Quote #00914 - Purchase Vehicles

Vehicle Purchases

Multiple Departments

Quote #00914
McCafferty New Holland
Apple Auto | Keystone Ford | Mall Chevrolet | Lake Chevrolet Ford Faulkner Hondru Ford Auto Star GMC Whitmoyer
(unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost)
Passenger Vehicles
Vehicle #
1 $21,098.00 NO BID $21,500.00 $21,506.00 NO BID $21,349.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23,850.00
2 $21,098.00 NO BID $21,500.00 $21,506.00 NO BID $21,824.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21,325.00
3 $27,290.00 $28,223.00 NO BID $27,423.00 $27,205.00 NO BID $27,915.00 $26,773.00 NO BID $27,100.00
4 $27,095.00 $28,468.00 NO BID $27,032.00 $26,856.00 NO BID $27,770.00 $26,734.00 NO BID $27,050.00
5 $31,025.00 $32,440.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30,905.00 NO BID $35,250.00
Vans
6 $27,864.00 NO BID $28,600.00 $28,662.00 NO BID $28,817.26 NO BID NO BID $28,664.00 $28,150.00
7 $26,795.00 NO BID $28,200.00 $27,816.00 NO BID $28,214.50 NO BID NO BID $27,981.00 $27,300.00
8 $24,975.00 NO BID $26,900.00 $26,376.00 NO BID $26,974.75 NO BID NO BID $26,037.00 $25,700.00
9 $25,795.00 NO BID $26,900.00 $25,940.00 NO BID $27,239.25 NO BID NO BID $26,652.00 $26,050.00
Trucks
10 $56,225.00 NO BID NO BID $64,136.00 NO BID $58,558.61 NO BID NO BID $56,968.00 $56,900.00
11 $30,490.00 NO BID $31,400.00 $31,077.00 NO BID $31,152.95 NO BID NO BID $31,079.00 $31,000.00




Quote #00914 - Purchase Vehicles

Vehicle Purchases
Multiple Departments
Quote #00914
McCafferty New Holland
Apple Auto | Keystone Ford | Mall Chevrolet | Lake Chevrolet Ford Faulkner Hondru Ford Auto Star GMC Whitmoyer
(unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost) (unit cost)
Quote by Manufacturer Grouping
(if quoting ALL applicable items)
General Motors (GM) (Item #1, #2,
#6, #7, #8, #9, #10, #11)| $262,204.00 N/A N/A $275,691.00 N/A $272,948.73 N/A N/A N/A $268,425.00
Ford Motor (ltem #3, #4, #5)| $112,700.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $111,185.00 N/A $116,500.00
Discount for multiple vehicle award
(2 or more) 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 1.00% 0.25%
Discount for multiple vehicle award
(5 or more) 0.00% 0.00% 1.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 2.00% 0.50%
Piggyback Contract | COSTARS NO NO COSTARS NO COSTARS COSTARS COSTARS COSTARS COSTARS




