Public Purchase Quote#: RAN2016-1

Department Name: Parks and Recreations
Project Name: Rangers Uniforms

Date: 2/23/2016
AWARD
g * Description Qty Atlantic Tactical American Uniforms Olympic Uniforms Lawmens Shooters T & T Uniforms
UNIT COST TOTAL DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL DESCRIPTION | UNIT COST TOTAL DESCRIPTION TOTAL DESCRIPTION
1 Z:ﬁ? SLEEVE UNIFORM 6 $54.45|  $326.70| Fechheimer 69R6604 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $69.00|  $414.00
2 LONG SLEEVE UNIFORM SHIRT 6 $59.30|  $355.80|Fechheimer 19W6604 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $74.00]  $444.00
3 COOL-MAX CLASS A SHIRT 3 $112.37|  $337.11 CMA252 $0.00|  NoBid $0.00|  NoBid
EXTERNAL CARRIER FOR ) )
4 BULLETPROOR VEST 4 $85.47|  $341.88 Elbeco V2 $0.00|  No Bid s000|  Nosgid
5 UNIFORM TROUSERS 3 $51.60|  $154.80| Fechheimer 38205 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $61.00|  $183.00
add on Billy Pocket 3 $15.00 $45.00 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $5.00 $15.00
6 STREETGEAR TROUSERS 10 $76.87|  $768.70|  Blauer 8810 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $89.00[  $890.00
*Olympic Mock .
7 MOCK TURTLENECK SHIRT 2 $20.67 $4134|  Elbeco 8602 $30.00) $60.00] " 00 boly) $0.00|  NoBid $29.00 $58.00| *Blauer 8110x
6
add on "BCPR" 2 $5.00 $10.00 $0.00|  included $0.00|  NoBid $6.00 $12.00
. . *Olmpic Turtle .
8 TURTLENECK SHIRT 2 $0.00 $0.00| *Item Discontinued *Ultra Club 8516] $30.00 $60.00 (100% Poly) $0.00 No Bid $29.00 $58.00( *Blauer 8100x
3
add on "BCPR" 2 $5.00 $10.00 $0.00 included $0.00|  NoBid $6.00 $12.00
*Fechheimer
9 DICKIES 2 $26.84] $53.68| 52500/52600 (not $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $16.00 $32.00
dickie)
add on "BCPR" 2 $5.00 $10.00 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $6.00 $12.00
10 |WINTER SWEATER 3 $84.22[  $252.66 Blauer 210 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $95.00[  $285.00
11 |WINTERJACKET 1 $169.87|  $169.87|  5.1148001 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $239.00)  $239.00
12 |LIGHTWEIGHT JACKET 3 $276.90 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $125.00]  $375.00
13 |REVERSIBLE RAINCOAT 1 $92.30 $92.30) $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $119.00)  $119.00
RAIN COVER FOR CAMPAIGN
14 |STYLE HATS ***NO 3 $19.95| Alboum Hat Cover $0.00|  No Bid $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $6.00 $18.00
AWARD***
15 |HIGH PATROL BOOTS 8 $138.75|  $1,110.00 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $155.00|  $1,240.00
16 |QUARTER BOOTS 6 $12125|  $727.50 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $138.00|  $828.00
17 |HIGLOSS DRESS BOOTS 1 $0.00 $63.00 $63.00 $89.00 $89.00
18 |PATROLSHOES 4 $55.60|  $222.40 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $7200]  $288.00
19 |WINTER CAMPAIGN HAT 1 $105.25|  $105.25|Stratton F-40) $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $99.00 $99.00
20 |SUMMER CAMPAIGN HAT 1 $80.75 $80.75 S"a“:; $-40 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $85.00 $85.00
21 |WINTER FUR CAP 1 Alboum $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $23.00 $23.00
22 |BASEBALL STYLE CAP $18.73 $93.65 Blaver 185 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $2200[  $110.00
23 WINTER WATCH CAP 4 $11.75 $47.00]  5.1189250 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $14.00 $56.00
add on "BCPR" 4 $5.00 $20.00 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $6.00 $24.00
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AWARD
g Description Qty Atlantic Tactical American Uniforms Olympic Uniforms Lawmens Shooters T & T Uniforms
UNIT COST DESCRIPTION UNITCOST | TOTAL | DESCRIPTION] UNITCOST | TOTAL | DESCRIPTION TOTAL | DESCRIPTION
CLIPONTIE 6 $4.65 $27.90 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $6.00) $36.00
DUTY HOLSTER 1 $110.25|  $110.25 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $139.00|  $139.00
PATROL DUTY BELT (OUTER *Don Hume
BELT) 2 $40.50 $81.00 $0.00 $30.24 $60.48( oo Doty et $59.00]  $118.00
*Don H
PATROL INNER BELT 3 $19.10 $57.30 $0.00 $17.38 $52.14 Ng;zsu;?/e $27.00 $81.00
*Don H
HANDCUFF CASE 2 $21.55 $43.10 $0.00 $17.54 $35.08[ Oonnume $29.00 $58.00
NC300HS
DOUBLE HANDCUFF CASE 2 6 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $35.00 $70.00
*Don Hume
DOUBLE MAGAZINE CASE 2 X 22.74 45.48 6.00 72,
lo] $0.00 $ $ ND407HS $3 $72.00
*Don Hume
PEPPER SPRAY CASE (SMALL 2 X 16.54 33.08 29.00) Y
( ) $0.00 $ S NC309-3-F HS $29 $58.00
CARRYING CASE FOR MEDICAL , $0.00 $12.50 $25.00] “0on Hume nsaca210 $22.00 $44.00
GLOVES
CARRYING CASE FOR
2 X 000  NoBid .00 78,
EXPANDABLE BATONS $0.00 $ o8 $39 $78.00
-
BELT KEEPERS 5 $9.40 $47.00|  Bianchi 7903 $0.00 $10.24 $51.20) IJN‘)Sr;:;TE $14.00 $70.00
BODY ARMOR 3 $497.80  1,493.40| e Chance 84200051 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $0.00|  NoBid
PATROL GEAR BAG 3 $3836|  $115.08) 51150012 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $5200]  $156.00
CITATION HOLDER 1 $21.80 $0.00 $39.66 $39.66| saunders 12205 $35.00 $35.00
FORMS HOLDER 1 $27.40 $27.40 $0.00 $37.85 $37.85|saunders 21017 $39.00 $39.00
HINGED HANDCUFFS 4 $3175|  $127.00 $0.00 $2067|  $118.68 sa1.00]  $164.00
Smith and W
LEG IRONS 2 $42.18 s8a.36| 31';00 esson $87.50 $0.00 _ $5200[  $104.00
COLD WEATHER GLOVES 4 $35.76|  $143.04| 51150344 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $49.00]  $196.00
COLD-GEAR HOOD 1 $20.64 $20.64| Under Armour 1244401 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $28.00 $28.00
COMPACT LIGHT HOLDER *Don Hume
37.74|  Bianchi 732 X 10. 1.50 14.00 42.
POUCH 3 S ianchi 7326 $0.00 $10.50 $3 ND106-M $ $42.00
STREAMLIGHT PROTAC HL
76. 228.00 X 000  NoBid £9.00) 267.
STR88040 3 $76.00]  $ $0.00 $ 0 Bi $89 $267.00
DIGITAL CAMERA 1 $0.00|  No Bid $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $0.00]  NoBid
STREAMLIGHT STRION LED )
PLASHLIGH 3 $106.75|  $320.25 $0.00 $0.00|  NoBid $149.00|  $447.00| 74302
v *Leatherman v
MULTI-PURPOSE TOOL 2 $0.00 No Bid $0.00! $57.21 $114.42( oo on (not equal) $0.00! No Bid
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