Lawn Care and Landscaping

Quote #PUR00615
Multiple Departments
M &M Cutting
wDB Emerald DiCenso Granieri Lawncare Bahnck Edge - Easy Care |Greenscape| Kovitch &
Landscape | Garden Landscape | Lawn Care East Lawncare Jordans | Landscape | Landscape Son
District Court Locations:
DC 07-1-01
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $1,125.00 $875.00 $1,125.00 $2,275.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,625.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $240.00 . $200.00 : $0.00 . . $280.00 $400.00 $360.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:|  $0.00 No Bid $80.00 NoBid 415000 | "NOBI NoBid 11000 | $200.00 | $250.00
DC 07-1-01 Total| $1,365.00 $1,155.00 $1,275.00 $2,965.00 | $2,100.00 | $2,235.00
Total with credit card discount| $1,344.53 $2,720.39
DC 07-1-02
Parking Lot Maint Only| $400.00 No Bid $280.00 No Bid $1,600.00 No Bid No Bid $512.00 $400.00 $800.00
Total with credit card discount| $394.00 $469.76
DC 07-1-03
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $625.00 $500.00 $750.00 | $1,000.00 $575.00 $750.00 | $1,125.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $240.00 No Bid $200.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid $96.00 $400.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:| $100.00 $40.00 $130.00 $80.00 $30.00 $200.00 $190.00
DC 07-1-03 Total| $965.00 $740.00 $880.00 $1,080.00 $701.00 $1,350.00 | $1,755.00
Total with credit card discount| $950.53 $643.17
DC 07-1-04
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $1,250.00 $875.00 $1,250.00 $3,200.00 | $2,000.00 | $1,875.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $240.00 . $320.00 . $0.00 . : $128.00 $800.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:| $210.00 | N°BId 5000 | NOBd I gi0000 | NOB NoBid ™ 4100.00 | $400.00 | $190.00
DC 07-1-04 Total| $1,700.00 $1,315.00 $1,350.00 $3,518.00 | $3,200.00 | $2,505.00
Total with credit card discount| $1,674.50 $3,227.77
DC 07-1-07
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $625.00 $500.00 $750.00 $875.00 | $1,250.00 | $1,050.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $200.00 . $200.00 . $0.00 . . $96.00 $400.00 $360.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:|  $0.00 No Bid $0.00 NoBid I —¢10000 | 'NOBid No Bid $30.00 | $100.00 | $250.00
DCO07-1-07 Total| $825.00 $700.00 $850.00 $1,001.00 | $1,750.00 | $1,660.00
Total with credit card discount| $812.63 $918.42
DC 07-1-08
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $1,000.00 $750.00 $1,250.00 $575.00 $1,250.00 | $1,875.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up: $0.00 ' $200.00 : $0.00 . : $64.00 $480.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:| $100.00 | \° Bl $90.00 NoBid 10000 | "NOPBU No Bid $30.00 | $200.00 | $180.00
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DC 07-1-08 Total| $1,100.00 $1,040.00 $1,350.00 $669.00 $1,930.00 | $2,495.00
Total with credit card discount| $1,083.50 $613.81
DC 07-1-09
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $1,000.00 $625.00 $1,125.00 | $1,125.00 $1,300.00 | $1,750.00 | $1,875.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $200.00 No Bid $200.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid $96.00 $600.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:| $150.00 $80.00 $350.00 $300.00 $30.00 $400.00 $180.00
DC 07-1-09 Total| $1,350.00 $905.00 $1,475.00 | $1,425.00 $1,426.00 | $2,750.00 | $2,495.00
Total with credit card discount| $1,329.75 $1,308.36
DC 07-1-10
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $750.00 $750.00 $1,125.00 $725.00 | $1,250.00 | $1,050.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $200.00 . $240.00 . $0.00 . . $72.00 $480.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:| $350.00 | N°BId 5000 | NOBd I —gi5000 | NOB No Bid $76.00 | $400.00 | $90.00
DC 07-1-10 Total| $1,300.00 $1,110.00 $1,275.00 $873.00 $2,130.00 | $1,580.00
Total with credit card discount| $1,280.50 $800.98
DC 07-1-11
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $1,000.00 $750.00 $1,875.00 $1,475.00 | $2,500.00 | $2,125.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $200.00 . $480.00 . $0.00 . : $96.00 $400.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:|  $0.00 No Bid $90.00 NoBid I —¢30000 | "NOBid NoBid ™ 4360.00 | $400.00 | $210.00
DC 07-1-11 Total| $1,200.00 $1,320.00 $2,175.00 $1,931.00 | $3,300.00 | $2,775.00
Total with credit card discount| $1,182.00 $1,771.69
DC 07-2-01
Bed Maint Only:| $180.00 $3,990.00 $150.00 $200.00 $400.00 No Bid No Bid $142.00 $1,000.00 $210.00
Total with credit card discount| $177.30 $130.29
DC 07-2-02
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $2,625.00 $875.00 $1,125.00 | $1,250.00 $1,125.00 | $2,200.00 | $6,250.00 | $1,125.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $240.00 No Bid $200.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $120.00 $168.00 $400.00 $360.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:| $160.00 $60.00 $300.00 $200.00 $50.00 $270.00 $200.00 $210.00
DC 07-2-02 Total| $3,025.00 $1,135.00 | $1,425.00 | $1,450.00 $1,295.00 | $2,638.00 | $6,850.00 | $1,695.00
Total with credit card discount| $2,979.63 $2,420.37
DC 07-2-05
\ Berm Maint Only: No Bid $2,240.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $800.00 $208.00 $1,000.00 | $1,000.00
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Total with credit card discount $190.84
DC 07-3-01
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing: $1,000.00 $1,875.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,175.00 | $2,825.00 | $2,500.00 | $3,750.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up: No Bid No Bid $400.00 No Bid $0.00 $1,200.00 $160.00 $168.00 $400.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care: $340.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $160.00 $520.00 $2,000.00 $300.00
DC 07-3-01 Total $1,740.00 $2,075.00 | $4,700.00 | $1,495.00 | $3,513.00 | $4,900.00 | $4,490.00
Total with credit card discount $3,223.18
DC 07-3-03
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing: $2,250.00 $875.00 $2,875.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,750.00 | $1,300.00 | $1,500.00 | $2,250.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up: No Bid $2,250.00 $200.00 No Bid $0.00 $800.00 $160.00 $72.00 $400.00 $440.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care: $1,350.00 $80.00 $200.00 $500.00 $50.00 $114.00 $200.00 $270.00
DC 07-3-03 Total $5,850.00 | $1,155.00 $3,075.00 | $2,800.00 | $1,960.00 | $1,486.00 | $2,100.00 | $2,960.00
Total with credit card discount $1,363.41
DC OPTIONAL SERVICES
(4) Red Crushed Stone:
Price per Application:| $85.00 $825.00 $100.00 $380.00 $95 ton N/A $60 ton $2,937.00 | $125 cu yd | $110.57 ton
Total with credit card discount| $83.73 $2,694.70
(5) Turf Maint/Seeding:
$85 per M $35 per 100 45 per M Sq
Price per Application:| $85.00 $1,900.00 $125.00 $450.00 Sq Ft N/A sq ft $2,216.00 $1 sq ft Ft
Total with credit card discount| $83.73 $2,033.18
(6) Problems or Potential Problems:
Cost Of Time & Materials (per hr) $40.00 $150.00 $40.00 $35.00 $50.00 N/A $40.00 $38.00 $48.00 $48.00
Total with credit card discount|  $39.40 $34.87
(7) Weed Control:
Included in Included in
location location
Price per Application: price $480.00 $65.00 $51.00 $75.00 N/A $85.00 $1,188.00 price $155.00

Total with credit card discount

$1,089.99




Lawn Care and Landscaping
Quote #PUR00615
Multiple Departments
M &M Cutting
wDB Emerald DiCenso Granieri Lawncare Bahnck Edge - Easy Care |Greenscape| Kovitch &
Landscape | Garden Landscape | Lawn Care East Lawncare Jordans | Landscape | Landscape Son
Bucks County Forensic Facility Location:
(1) Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $1,260.00 $480.00 $1,080.00 | $2,400.00 $1,752.00 | $2,400.00 $900.00
(2) Addl Maint/Clean Up:| $595.00 $175.00 $315.00 $0.00 $266.00 $420.00 $245.00
(3) Tree & Shrub Care:| $250.00 No Bid $100.00 $100.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid $180.00 $400.00 $150.00
(4) Turf Maint/Seeding| $415.00 $200.00 $430.00 $85.00 $532.00 $100.00 $450.00
(5) Mulching of Shrub & Tree Beds| $775.00 $200.00 $1,100.00 $150.00 $577.00 $100.00 $450.00
Forensic Facility Total| $3,295.00 $1,155.00 | $3,025.00 | $2,835.00 $3,307.00 | $3,420.00 | $2,195.00
Total with credit card discount| $3,245.58 $3,034.17
Emergency Management Location:
Lawn Cutting/Mowing:| $3,840.00 No Bid $1,200.00 | $1,440.00 | $3,480.00 No Bid No Bid $2,904.00 | $8,400.00 | $2,280.00
Total with credit card discount| $3,782.40 $2,664.42
TOTAL QUOTE| $20,545.00 | $12,080.00 | $15,300.00 | $8,445.00 | $25,695.00 | $7,500.00 | $5,550.00 | $27,794.00 | $46,580.00 | $33,130.00
Discount for credit card payment 0.015 0 0 0 0 0 0 0.0825 0 0




