Quote #PUR00519

Garage Oils

Total Cost Quote Pricing
Vendor Name Quote Total 0w20 5w20 5w30 15w40 Multi-Vechile ATF  Oil Absorbent AP Gear 80w90 75w90 Synthetic Gear Oil
Cross County $2,937.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,485.00 $262.50 $510.00 $680.00
PPC Lubricants, Inc $15,365.15 $1,334.85 $3,172.50 $5,240.00 $2,535.00 $1,544.40 $420.00 $446.40 $672.00
PPC Lubricants, Inc $18,465.15 $1,334.85 $4,072.50 $6,840.00 $3,135.00 $1,544.40 $420.00 $446.40 $672.00
Craft Oil/Petrochoice $16,993.65 $2,654.20 $2,866.50 $5,096.00 $2,859.00 $1,588.95 $362.00 $702.00 $860.00

Posted to Public Purchase

Notifications: 177
Total number of Plan Holders: 30
Total responses: 4



