Plastic Utensils, Cups etc
Spec #19-05/14

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment

Camden
Bag & King of
Paper Prussia
(Dubin Central Dade Pharmacy Manheim Penn
Paper) Poly Paper Services  Medical Jersey
List A
1 Containers, 32 oz. Foam NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 500 500 500
Case Cost  $33.60 $34.59 $33.40
Cost Per Item  $0.06720 $0.06918
Lids for 32 oz.
Containers NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 500 500 500
Case Cost  $17.50 $17.81 $17.43
Cost Per Item $0.0350 $0.0356 $0.0349
Combined Total $0.10220 $0.10480
2 Cups, 8 oz. Foam NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $17.40 $17.14 $18.50 $16.70 $17.20
Cost Per Item $0.01740 $0.01714 $0.01850 $0.01670 $0.01720
Lids for 8 oz. Cups NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $11.50 $11.52 $12.95 $9.25 $11.40
Cost Per ltem $0.01150 $0.01152 $0.01295 $0.00925 $0.01140
Combined Total $0.02890 $0.02866  $0.03145 $0.02860
3 Cups, 16 0z. Foam NO BID
Case Count 1000 500 500 500 500
Case Cost  $35.00 $34.52 $38.20 $32.60 $34.10
Cost Per Item $0.03500 $0.06904 $0.07640 $0.06520 $0.06820
Lids for 16 oz. Cups NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $14.00 $14.00 $14.97 $13.20 $13.53
Cost Per Item $0.01400 $0.01400 $0.01497 $0.01320 $0.01353
Combined Total[ $0.04900 $0.08304 $0.09137 $0.07840 $0.08173



Plastic Utensils, Cups etc
Spec #19-05/14

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment

Camden
Bag & King of
Paper Prussia
(Dubin Central Dade Pharmacy Manheim Penn
Paper) Poly Paper Services  Medical Jersey
4 5 o0z. Plastic Cup NO BID
Case Count 2500 2400 2400 2400 2400
Case Cost $32.00 $31.91  $35.85  $27.84  $33.98
Cost Per Item $0.01280 $0.01330  $0.01494 $0.01416
5 % 0z. Soufflé Cup NO BID
Case Count 5000 5000 5000 5000 5000
Case Cost  $32.00 $24.99  $33.60  $28.60  $28.15
Cost Per ltem  0.00640 0.00672  0.00572  0.00563
6 1 o0z. Medicine Cup NO BID
Case Count 5000 5000 5000 5000 5000
Case Cost $38.00 $21.43  $2895  $28.35  $24.55
Cost Per ltem 0.00760 0.00429 0.00567  0.00491
7 Forks, Heavyweight NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $19.80 $20.57 $20.00 $14.80
Cost Per ltem 0.01980 0.02057 0.02000
8 Knives, Heavyweight NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost $19.80 $20.57 $20.00  $14.80
Cost Per Item 0.01980 0.02057 0.02000
9 Tea Spoons,
heavyweight NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $19.80 $20.57 $20.15 $14.80
Cost Per ltem 0.01980 0.02057 0.02015
10 Straws, flex NO BID
Case Count 10000 12000 10000 10000 10000
Case Cost  $44.00 $41.50  $44.00  $37.75  $37.40
Cost Per ltem  0.00440 0.00440  0.00378  0.00374




Plastic Utensils, Cups etc

Spec #19-05/14

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment

Camden
Bag & King of
Paper Prussia
(Dubin Central Dade Pharmacy Manheim Penn
Paper) Poly Paper Services  Medical Jersey
11 Complete RX Cup NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000
Case Cost $48.00 $38.80
Cost Per Item 0.04800
List B
12 Plate, paper, 9" NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $70.00 $25.95 $34.20
Cost Per Item  0.07000 0.03420
13 Plate, foam, 6" NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost $12.80 $13.14 $13.99
Cost Per Item[ 0.01280 | 0.01314 0.01399
14 Plate, 8.5”, 1
compartment NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 500 500 500
Case Cost  $40.00 $77.40 $38.40
Cost Per Item  0.08000 0.15480
15 Napkin, luncheon white NO BID NO BID
Case Count 6000 6000 6000 6000
Case Cost  $22.20 $34.76 $24.60 $23.75
Cost Per Item[_0.00370 | 0.00579 0.00410  0.00396
16 Tray, paperboard food
tray NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 500 1000
Case Cost  $17.00 $25.90 $37.00
Cost Per item[_0.01700 | 0.05180 0.03700
17 Container, 8 oz squat NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $32.00 $25.91 $33.06 $31.60



Plastic Utensils, Cups etc
Spec #19-05/14

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment

Camden
Bag & King of
Paper Prussia
(Dubin Central Dade Pharmacy Manheim Penn
Paper) Poly Paper Services  Medical Jersey
Cost Per Item  0.03200 0.03306  0.03160
18 Container, foam, 4 oz
squat NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $18.00 $17.70 $17.25 $17.70
Cost Per Item  0.01800 0.01770 0.01770
19 Bowl, foam, 12 oz NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $24.00 $37.82 $21.50
Cost Per Item  0.02400 0.03782
20 Souffle Portion cup,
clear, 2 0z NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 2500 2400 2400
Case Cost  $24.00 $23.10 $23.70
Cost Per Item 0.00960 0.00963 0.00988
Cup lid NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 2500 2400 2400
Case Cost  $24.00 $23.65 $22.10
Cost Per Item 0.00960 0.00985 0.00921
Combined Total 0.01920 0.01948
21 Fork, medium weight NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost 5.70000 8.96000 7.75000 7.25000 5.85000
Cost Per Item[_0.00570 | 0.00896  0.00775 0.00725 0.00585
22 Sppon, tea,medium
weight
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $5.70 $8.96 $7.75 $12.15 $7.25 $5.85
Cost Per item[_0.00570 | 0.00896 0.00775 ~ 0.01215 000725 0.00585




Plastic Utensils, Cups etc
Spec #19-05/14

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment

Camden
Bag & King of
Paper Prussia
(Dubin Central Dade Pharmacy Manheim Penn
Paper) Poly Paper Services  Medical Jersey
23 Sp_oon, soup medium
weight NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $5.70 $8.96 $7.75 $7.25 $5.85
Cost Per tem[_0.00570 | 0.00896 ~ 0.00775 0.00725  0.00585
24 Knife, medium weight NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $5.70 $8.96 $7.75 $7.25 $5.85
Cost Per Item[_0.00570 | 0.00896  0.00775 0.00725  0.00585
25 Hotelpan, 6"x34"x18"  \opD NOBID NOBID NOBID  NOBID
Case Count 50
Case Cost $29.60

Cost Per Item

0.59200

Hotel pan, 2.5" x 34" x

26 12" NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 100
Case Cost $29.60
Cost Per Item
57 Gallon plastic storage
bags NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 250
Case Cost $10.45
Cost Per Item
o8 Sandwich plastic storage
bags NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 500
Case Cost $9.99
Cost Per Item
29 Bun pan cover, 27" x 37" N gIp NOBID NOBID  NOBID

Case Count 200



Plastic Utensils, Cups etc
Spec #19-05/14

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment

Camden
Bag & King of
Paper Prussia
(Dubin Central Dade Pharmacy Manheim Penn
Paper) Poly Paper Services Medical Jersey
Case Cost $18.00 $200.00
Cost Per Item 25.00000
30 Aluminum Foil, 18" x
1000 NO BID
Case Count 1 1 1 1 1
Case Cost  $33.00 $36.60 $46.70 $26.00 $28.80
Cost Per Item $33.0000 $36.6000 $46.7000 $28.8000
31 Plastic Film Wrap, 12" x
2000’ NO BID
Case Count 1 1 1 1 1
Case Cost  $8.90 $12.60 $9.76 $14.50 $9.68
Cost Per Item[_$8.9000 | $12.6000  $9.7600 $14.5000 $9.6800
32 Plastic Film Wrap, 18" x
2000 NO BID
Case Count 1 1 1 1 1
Case Cost  $13.70 $14.60 $14.10 $15.65 $13.95
Cost Per Item| $13.7000 | $14.6000 $14.1000 $15.6500 $13.9500
33 Parchment Paper. Sheet
pan size NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case Count 1000 1000 1000
Case Cost  $31.00 $43.20 $79.10
Cost Per Item[_0.03100 ] 0.04320  0.07910

Advertised in Newspaper
Posted on Demandstar
565 Notified

41 Planholders

6 Responses

2 Rejected

1 No Reply



