
Description

Unit Of 

Measure

First Choice 

Medical Supply

Manheim Medical 

Supply Inc.

DiaMedical USA

Equipment LLC

Sizewise 

Rentals

PURCHASE - SpanAmerica PressureGuard® APM2 Safety 

Supreme, Model SAF5880-29
EA $1,114.81 $1,138.45 $1,195.00 $1,125.22

PURCHASE - SpanAmerica PressureGuard® APM with 

Raised Safety Perimeter, Model 89161
EA $1,476.11 $1,475.00 $1,564.00 $1,275.22

PURCHASE - SpanAmerica PressureGuard® APM with 

Raised Safety Perimeter, Model 48557
EA $1,658.61 $1,655.00 $1,764.00 $1,275.22

RENTAL - SpanAmerica PressureGuard® APM2 Safety 

Supreme, Model SAF5880-29
DAY NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.72

RENTAL - SpanAmerica PressureGuard® APM with Raised 

Safety Perimeter, Model 89161
DAY NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.72

RENTAL - SpanAmerica PressureGuard® APM with Raised 

Safety Perimeter, Model 48557
DAY NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.72

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor

3-YEAR CONTRACT TO PURCHASE AND RENT PRESSURE RELIEVING MATTRESSES

Spec #59-12/17

Neshaminy Manor

No Award for Rentals


