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Spec #54-11/16

Alliance 

Computers

Apex Computer 

Systems

Aprisa 

Technology Blue Tech CherryStoneIT Connection Corbel Solutions DBISP Derive

Keystone Digital 

Imaging

PCMG Global 

Gov Ed 

Solutions TekSavers

Wynndalco 

Enterprises

Contract 1

Dell Servers Bid $219,729.83 $227,360.00 $230,160.00 $212,011.80 $229,300.00 $224,445.60 $246,420.00 $231,448.20 $233,250.40 $253,700.00 $162,830.60 $345,000.00 $233,234.20

Contract 2:

Brocade Switches Bid NO BID NO BID $140,407.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID $146,109.00 NO BID $136,562.52 NO BID $46,735.32 $134,560.00 NO BID

Awarded Vendor

PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF DELL SERVERS AND BROCADE SWITCHES


