
Snow Removal
Spec #52-12/13
Purchasing

(2” or more but less than 5”) M & M Lawncare CNS Cleaning
Cutting Edge Total 

Lawn Care
Cooper Remodeling 

Co
GROUP 1

D.C. 07-1-01  BROWN $550.00 $455.00 NO BID $300.00

D.C. 07-1-07  BARANOSKI $500.00 $335.00 NO BID $250.00

D.C. 07-1-08  KELLY $550.00 $400.00 NO BID $250.00

D.C. 07-1-03  KLINE $550.00 $335.00 NO BID $250.00

Combined total if bidding ALL Group 1 
Locations $15,050.00 $10,675.00 NO BID $7,350.00

GROUP 2
D.C. 07-1-11  BURNS $575.00 $800.00 NO BID NO BID

D.C. 07-1-10  VISLOSKY $575.00 $590.00 NO BID NO BID

D.C. 07-1-04  WAGNER $550.00 $400.00 NO BID $260.00

Combined total if bidding ALL Group 2 
Locations $11,900.00 $12,530.00 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 3
D.C. 07-1-09  FINELLO $500.00 $470.00 $245.00 NO BID

D.C. 07-2-02  DOUPLE $500.00 $470.00 $245.00 NO BID

Combined total if bidding ALL Group 3 
Locations $7,000.00 $6,580.00 $3,430.00 NO BID

GROUP 4
D.C. 07-3-01  SNOW NO BID $400.00 $245.00 NO BID

D.C. 07-3-03  GAMBARDELLA NO BID NO BID $245.00 NO BID

Combined total if bidding ALL Group 4 
Locations NO BID NO BID $3,430.00 NO BID

GROUP 5
FORENSIC FACILITY NO BID $400.00 $265.00 NO BID

EMERGENCY SERVICES BUILDING NO BID $1,070.00 $425.00 NO BID

Combined total if bidding ALL Group 5 
Locations NO BID $10,290.00 $4,830.00 NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT BID $33,950.00 $42,875.00 $11,690.00 $9,170.00

Discount for multiple location award 5% 0% 0% 0%

Advertised in Newspaper
Posted on Demand Star
1609 Notified
24 Planholders 
4 Responses

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day 
of the bid opening
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