

<b>2-YEAR CONTRACT TO PURCHASE HOSPITAL BED PARTS</b>						
<b>Spec #52-10/17</b>						
<b>Neshaminy Manor</b>						
#		DiaMedical USA Equipment	Legend Medical	Legend Medical Alt#1	EMED Medical Co	EMED Medical Co Alt#1
1	Invacare Corp Part #1117178 (Control Box)	\$246.50	\$174.00	NO BID	\$333.26	\$103.36
2	Invacare Corp Part #1140806 (Hi/Low Motor)	\$62.50	\$72.50	NO BID	\$201.27	NO BID
3	Joerns Healthcare Part #11011351 (Knee Actuator)	\$280.50	\$341.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4	Joerns Healthcare Part #11011474 (Bed Pendants)	\$98.50	\$119.85	\$59.00	\$135.10	NO BID
5	Joerns Healthcare Part #11011775 (PC Board)	\$169.75	\$208.50	NO BID	\$233.86	NO BID
6	Joerns Healthcare Part #11012990 (Bed Pendants - Standard (6 button))	\$98.50	\$117.00	NO BID	\$137.37	NO BID
7	Joerns Healthcare Part #39000804 (Control Box (U790 Bed))	\$267.75	\$323.00	NO BID	\$365.84	NO BID
8	Joerns Healthcare Part #11011963 (Hand Control (Low Boy - S#L1439))	\$98.50	\$119.85	\$59.00	\$135.98	NO BID
9	Big Boyz Part #HB43-02 (Hand Control (Big Boy - CV1840))	NO BID	\$97.00	\$59.00	\$138.84	NO BID
10	Span Medical Products Part #QP2508 (Handset Bed Controller)	\$47.50	\$49.00	\$45.00	NO BID	\$140.84
	<b>Low Vendor</b>					
	<b>Awarded Vendor</b>					