
2-YEAR CONTRACT TO PROVIDE DISPOSABLE WIPES

Spec #43-11/14

Neshaminy Manor

Bound Tree 

Medical

Delcrest 

Medical 

Services

First Choice 

Medical 

Supply

Fisher 

Scientific

Henry 

Schein

McKesson 

Medical-

Surgical 

Minnesota 

Supply Medco

Medline 

Industries

Penn Jersey 

Paper

Pyramid 

School 

Products

School 

Health Corp 

ITEM #1 - Professional Disposables 

International (PDI), Item #P13472, hand 

wipes, pre-moistened pop up towelette, 

water/alcohol based solution, MUST be 

bacteriostatic antimicrobial, 135/container, 

12 containers/cs

BID 

REJECTED

UNIT PRICE $4.97000 $4.91250 $0.03100 $67.68000 $0.03800 $5.40000 $0.02799 $0.01200 $89.98000 $0.03700

PRICE PER CASE $59.64 $58.95 $48.86 $67.68 $61.44 $70.32 $53.75 $18.68 $89.98 $60.72

TOTAL ITEM COST $42,938.18 $42,444.00 $35,179.00 $48,729.60 $44,236.80 $50,630.40 $38,700.00 $13,449.60 $64,785.60 $43,718.40

ITEM #2 - Professional Disposables 

International (PDI), Item #Q55172, surface 

wipes, pre-moistened pop up towelette, 

sani-cloth super germicidal, 55% alcohol, 

160/tub, 12 tubs/cs

BID 

REJECTED

UNIT PRICE $5.92000 $5.63250 $0.03200 $76.22000 $0.03400 $6.97000 $0.02850 $0.03740 $102.95 $0.03700

PRICE PER CASE $70.98 $67.59 $61.14 $76.22 $65.88 $83.64 $54.72 $35.86 $102.95 $71.76

TOTAL ITEM COST $5,110.69 $4,866.48 $4,402.08 $5,487.84 $4,743.36 $6,022.08 $3,939.84 $2,581.92 $7,412.40 $5,166.72

ITEM #3 - Select Medical, Item #4577, 

bathing cloths, pre-moistened, 8/pack, 24 

pk/cs 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BID 

REJECTED
NO BID NO BID NO BID

UNIT PRICE $0.29900 $0.16310 $0.02850

PRICE PER CASE $57.35 $31.31 $16.38

TOTAL ITEM COST $1,376.40 $751.44 $393.12

ITEM #4 - Cleanis Premoistened Aqua 

Wash Glove, Item #4628209, 12/pk 12 

pk/cs

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BID 

REJECTED
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

UNIT PRICE

PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL ITEM COST

Posted on Public Purchase

Advertised in Newspaper

237 Notified

63 Notified

11 Responses

1 Rejected

3 No Responses

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid opening
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