
3-YEAR CONTRACT TO PROVIDE GLUCOSE METERS & SUPPLIES

Neshaminy Manor

Spec #37-08/16

Blood 

Glucose 

Test Strips 

(unit cost)

Glucose 

Control 

Solution 

(unit cost)

Pressure 

Activated 

Safety 

Lancets 

(unit cost) 

Safety Pen 

Needle 

(unit cost)

American HealthCare Services $10.09 $7.99 $34,848.90 $15.74 $8,499.60 NO BID

Arkay Arkay SteriLance Press

Amerisochi, Inc. $12.27 $10.91 $42,700.50 $14.00 $7,560.00 $69.40 $59,961.60

Arkay Arkay Owen Mumford BD

AOSS Medical Supply, Inc. $10.00 $7.75 $34,492.50 $10.75 $5,805.00 $60.50 $52,272.00

Embrace Embrace Medipurpose BD

Bound Tree Medical LLC $9.15 $9.45 $32,197.50 $9.45 $5,103.00 NO BID

Arkay Arkay Arkay

Clarity Diagnostics $6.95 $5.20 $23,922.00 $7.95 $4,293.00 NO BID

Clarity Clarity Clarity

Delcrest Medical Services  $9.95 $7.20 $34,182.00 $9.78 $5,281.20 $568.00 $61,344.00

Arkay Arkay Arkay case price $71/bx, 8bx/cs

BD

Diversa Health & Sciences $8.70 $6.50 $29,943.00 $15.50 $8,370.00 $98.50 $85,104.00

Home Aide Home Aide Dynarex BD

First Choice Medical Supply $9.81 $6.99 $33,671.70 $11.10 $5,994.00 $52.96 $45,757.44

Arkay Arkay First Choice BD

ForaCare $7.45 $2.75 $24,880.50 $8.00 $4,320.00 $13.50 $11,664.00

FORA FORA FORA Berpu

ForaCare $7.45 $3.25 $25,015.50 $8.00 $4,320.00 $13.50 $11,664.00

FORA FORA FORA Berpu

GEMCO Medical $5.25 $4.50 $18,225.00 $6.85 $3,699.00 $32.00 $27,648.00

EasyMax EasyMax Sterilance NovaNordisk

Lochness Medical $8.67 $3.95 $29,157.30 $3.40 $1,836.00 NO BID

04GLU 04GLU 04GLU

Manheim Medical $9.40 $8.75 $32,818.50 $6.75 $3,645.00 $56.65 $48,945.60

ARK ARK AHT BD

Manheim Medical $6.75 $6.00 $23,490.00 $6.75 $3,645.00 $56.65 $48,945.60

Gem Gem Gem BD

Must be the same Mfg.
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McKesson Med-Surg Supply $9.94 $7.15 $34,136.10 $7.50 $4,050.00 $65.80 $56,851.20

Arkay Arkay Arkay BD

Medline Industries $7.25 $5.50 $24,975.00 $14.75 $7,965.00 $64.20 $55,468.80

EvenCare EvenCare Medline BD

Medpart (Healthcare Equipt) $8.00 $4.00 $27,000.00 $6.00 $3,240.00 $55.30 $47,779.20

Arkay Arkay Sterilance BD

MMS Midwest Med Supply $9.70 $6.90 $33,291.00 $8.80 $4,752.00 $54.25 $46,872.00

Arkay Arkay Dynarex BD

Moore Medical $13.50 $9.00 $46,170.00 $16.50 $8,910.00 NO BID

Moore Moore Owen Mumford

Slakoper Mat's Pharm & Med Supply $10.41 $4.00 $34,808.40 $10.47 $5,653.80 $72.77 $62,873.28

Prodigy Prodigy Prodigy BD

Steede Medical $6.95 $4.95 $23,854.50 $11.80 $6,372.00 $10.10 $8,726.40

Acon Labs Acon Labs Dynarex Dynarex

low bid

recommended for award

Advertised in Newspaper

Posted on Public Purchase

151 Notified

58 Planholders

19 Responses

1 No Bid


