
2-YEAR CONTRACT TO PROVIDE FALL DETECTION EQUIPMENT

Spec #36-09/17

Neshaminy Manor

DiaMed USA Equip

Health-Care Equip & 

Parts Co. MedPart Maven Medical Skil-Care Corp

1
Patient Alarm

COST PER EA
$48.81 $24.95 $62.82 No Bid

2
Replacement Chair Sensor Pads

COST PER CS
$446.56 $216.30 $553.48 No Bid

3
Replacement Bed Sensor Pads

COST PER CS
$454.56 $320.12 $563.92 No Bid

4
Nonslip Floor Mat Alarm System

COST PER EA
$136.56 $168.54 $176.64 No Bid

5
Replacement Nonslip Floor Mat

COST PER EA
$103.01 $98.15 $133.88 No Bid

6
TR Contact Alarm

COST PER EA
$54.56 $50.56 $69.74 No Bid

7
Pull String Personal Monitors

COST PER EA
No Bid $9.73 $12.42 $17.50

8
Door/Window Alarm

COST PER PK
$69.56 $51.80 $89.80 $37.00

Total Award $23,898.00 $75,248.10 - $4,440.00

Low Bidder

Awarded Bidder


