
3-YEAR CONTRACT FOR ELEVATOR PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICE

Spec #34-08/14

General Services

Kone Elevator Co 

(US Communities 

Alternate Bid) Delaware Elevator Kencor Inc Standard Elevator

Kone Elevator Co 

(US Communities 

Base Bid)

Amtech 

Reliable/Otis 

Elevator Co 

(National IPA) Ace Elevator LLC

Site 1 - Neshaminy 

Manor Nursing Facility
$16,431.60 $17,280.00 $16,200.00 $39,180.00 $64,666.92 $56,004.00 $43,440.00

Site 2 - Building G, 

Almshouse
$5,477.16 $5,760.00 $5,400.00 $13,284.00 $21,555.60 $23,676.00 $14,484.00

Site 3 - Domestic 

Relations - 20 E Court St
$5,477.16 $6,120.00 $5,400.00 $13,284.00 $21,555.60 $23,676.00 $14,484.00

Site 4 - Domestic 

Relations - 30 E Court St
$5,477.16 $6,120.00 $5,400.00 $13,284.00 $21,555.60 $23,676.00 $14,484.00

Site 5 - Courthouse $68,467.56 $66,240.00 $79,500.00 $125,244.00 $237,826.20 $116,232.00 $211,020.00

Site 6 - Justice Center NO BID $64,470.00 $68,040.00 NO BID NO BID $137,452.00 $290,460.00

Site 7 - Library & District 

Center
$5,477.16 $5,400.00 $5,148.00 $13,284.00 $21,555.60 $23,676.00 $14,484.00

Site 8 - Parking Garage $16,481.60 $21,600.00 $16,200.00 $35,820.00 $64,666.92 $56,004.00 $43,448.00

Site 9 - County Building - 

50 N Main St
$5,477.16 $5,760.00 $5,220.00 $12,204.00 $21,555.60 $23,676.00 $15,948.00

Site 10 - Morrisville 

Senior Center
$5,477.16 $5,760.00 $5,220.00 $13,860.00 $21,555.60 $23,676.00 $14,484.00

Site 11 - Mental Health / 

Developmental Programs 
$5,477.16 $5,760.00 $5,220.00 $14,760.00 $21,555.60 $23,676.00 $14,484.00

Site 12 - Controller’s 

Office
$2,567.88 NO BID $1,680.00 $2,160.00 $7,342.08 $23,028.00 $1,854.00

Site 13 - Morgue – 

Forensic Center
$5,477.16 $6,480.00 $5,220.00 $14,004.00 $21,555.60 $18,672.00 $14,484.00

Site 14 - Emergency 

Mgmt / 911 Ctr
$5,477.16 $6,480.00 $5,040.00 $12,924.00 $21,555.60 $18,672.00 $14,484.00

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid opening
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Site 15 - District Court 07-

2-05
$5,477.16 $6,480.00 $5,040.00 NO BID $21,555.60 $18,672.00 $14,484.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BID $158,670.24 $229,710.00 $233,928.00 $323,292.00 $590,058.00 $610,467.00 $736,518.00

Discount for multiple 

location award (2 – 4 

locations)
0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 3.0% 0.0%

Discount for multiple 

location award (5 – 9 

locations)
1.0% 2.0% 0.0% 0.0% 1.0% 5.0% 5.0%

Discount for multiple 

location award (10 or 

more locations)
2.0% 3.0% 1.0% 5.0% 2.0% 8.0% 10.0%

Advertised in Newspaper

Posted on Demandstar

171 Notified

17 Planholders

10 No Responses

1 Non Responsive


