
NO. Description Type UOM Quantity

Corporate 

Mailing 

Services, Inc.

Higher 

Information 

Group

100

Option 1, Group 1 is for BERKS COUNTY ONLY. 

Option 1, Group 2 is for BUCKS COUNTY & 

LEHIGH COUNTY

101- Group 1

Group 1-Berks County Only - Letters (5 Digit) USPS 

Current Rate $0.389 - 24 Hour Service Base per piece 958,000.00 No bid No bid

102- Group 1

Group 1-Berks County Only - Flat size mail (5 digit) 

USPS Current Rate $0.430 - 24 Hour Service Base per piece 29,600.00 No bid No bid

103- Group 1

Group 1-Berks County Only - Flat size mail (3 digit) 

USPS Curent Rate $0.577 - 24 Hour Service Base per piece 29,600.00 No bid No bid

104- Group 1

Group 1-Berks County Only - Letters (5 Digit) USPS 

Current Rate $0.389 - Same Day Service Option per piece 958,000.00 No bid No bid

105- Group 2

Group 2-Bucks County - Letters (5 Digit) USPS 

Current Rate $0.389 - 24 Hour Service Base per piece 1,170,000.00 0.081 No bid

106- Group 2

Group 2-Bucks County - Flat size mail (5 digit) 

USPS Current Rate $0.430 - 24 Hour Service Base per piece 32,000.00 0.350 No bid

107- Group 2

Group 2-Bucks County - Flat size mail (3 digit) 

USPS Current Rate $0.577 - 24 Hour Service Base per piece 32,000.00 No bid No bid

108- Group 2

Group 2-Lehigh County - Letters (5 Digit) USPS 

Current Rate $0.389 - 24 Hour Service Base per piece 1,000,000.00 0.081 No bid

109- Group 2

Group 2-Lehigh County-Additional cost per piece 

if a second pick up location is required Option per piece 1 0.020 No bid

200 Option 2 is for ALL COUNTIES

201

Berks County-Letters (5 Digit) USPS Current Rate 

$0.389 - 24 Hour Service Option per piece 958,000.00 0.071 0.085

202

Berks County -Flat size mail (5 digit) USPS Current 

Rate $0.430 - 24 Hour Service Option per piece 29,600.00 0.350 0.047

203

Berks County-Flat size mail (3 digit) USPS Current 

Rate $0.577 -24 Hour Service Option per piece 29,600.00 No bid No bid

204

Berks County-Letters (5 Digit) USPS Current Rate 

$0.389 - Same Day Service Option per piece 958,000.00 No bid No bid

205

Bucks County Letters (5 Digit) USPS Current Rate 

$0.389 - 24 Hour Service Option per piece 1,170,000.00 0.071 0.085

206

Bucks County-Flat size mail (5 digit) USPS Current 

Rate $0.430 - 24 Hour Service Option per piece 32,000.00 0.350 0.047

207

Bucks County-Flat size mail (3 digit) USPS Current 

Rate $0.577 - 24 Hour Service Option per piece 32,000.00 No bid No bid

208

Lehigh County-Letters (5 Digit) USPS Current Rate 

$0.389 - 24 Hour Service Option per piece 1,000,000.00 0.071 0.085

209

Lehigh County-Additional cost per piece if a 

second pick up location is required Option per piece 1 0.02 15.00

Please note, the amounts shown are the numbers that were read at the public bid opening and do not reflect 

any evaluation and do not indicate an intent to award.

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and 

none are listed on the day of the bid opening.

2-Year Contract to Provide Pre-Sort Mail Services.2 for the Southeastern PA Counties Cooperative Purchasing Board; 

Spec #34-07/20


