
CONTRACT TO PROVIDE MEDICAL & SURGICAL SUPPLIES

Spec #33-08/17

Purchasing Department
No free 

samples

must order 

all items at 

once 

pricing good 

for 60 days

No free 

samples

American

 Health 

Care 

Services

Bound Tree 

Medical
Cintas Corp

Conney 

Safety

CVS 

Pharma

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Delcrest
DiaMed 

USA Equip

EMED 

Medical

Manheim 

Medical 

Supply

Maven 

Medical

Maxon 

Supplies 

LLC DBA 

NJ Safety 

Equip

McKesson 

Med-Surg

McKesson 

Med-Surg Alt 

#1

Med Supply 

& Equip Co

Medco 

Sports 

Medicine

Medline

Mountain 

side Med 

Equip

NAO Global 

Health

NAO Global 

Health     

Alt #1

Para 

Scientific

School 

Health Corp

1

Conforming Stretch Bandage, Dukal 

#504LF or equal; 4” x 4.5 yd; Non-

sterile; 10 rls/bx, 5 bx/cs

$0.537 $0.450 $31.000 $0.267 No Bid $0.637 $0.188 $0.719 $1.230 $0.520 $0.565 $0.790 $0.097 $5.666 No Bid $0.341 $0.608 $0.753 $0.709 $0.156 $0.418

Case Count 50.00 50.00 1.00 12.00 50.00 96.00 50.00 10.00 50.00 50.00 1.00 96.00 10.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 96.00 50.00

Case Cost $26.85 $22.50 $31.00 $3.20 $31.84 $18.00 $35.95 $12.30 $26.00 $28.24 $0.79 $9.30 $56.66 $17.06 $30.40 $37.67 $35.43 $14.97 $20.90

2

Conforming Stretch Bandage, Dukal 

#506LF or equal; 6” x 4.5 yd; Non-

sterile; 10 rls/bx, 5 bx/cs

$0.806 $0.710 $0.430 $0.328 No Bid $0.910 $0.198 $1.139 $3.060 $0.770 $0.878 $0.990 $0.103 $6.599 No Bid $0.472 $0.632 $1.152 $1.063 $0.295 $0.619

Case Count 50 50 1 12 50 96 50 1 50 50 1 96 10 50 50 50 50 48 50

Case Cost $40.30 $35.50 $0.43 $3.93 $45.50 $19.00 $56.95 $3.06 $38.50 $43.90 $0.99 $9.90 $65.99 $23.60 $31.60 $57.59 $53.17 $14.18 $30.95

3

Bandages, Johnson & Johnson 

#38137004473 or equal, Sponge Bob 

Square Pants, adhesive, sterile, 2 

sizes/box: 10 - 3/4” x 3”, 10 - 5/8” x 2-

1/4”, 20/bx

No Bid $0.140 $0.137 $0.149 $0.088 $0.193 No Bid $0.173 $0.313 No Bid $0.020 No Bid $0.132 $0.012 $0.220 $0.123 $0.017 $0.135 $0.152 No Bid $0.182

Box Count 20.00 20.00 480.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 100.00 20.00 100.00 20.00 20.00 1200.00 20.00 20.00 20.00

Box Cost $2.79 $2.73 $71.65 $1.76 $3.85 $3.45 $6.26 $2.04 $2.63 $1.23 $4.40 $2.45 $20.00 $2.69 $3.04 $3.63

4

Gauze, 2” x 2”, 8-ply surgical 

sponges, non-sterile, color: white, 

200/pkg

$0.003 $0.004 $0.011 $0.007 $0.026 $0.005 $0.005 $0.005 $0.028 $0.004 $0.004 $0.063 $0.004 $0.004 $0.016 $0.010 $0.006 $0.005 $0.005 $0.119 $0.007

Package Count 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 100.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 5000.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00

Package Cost $0.59 $0.89 $2.11 $1.42 $5.28 $0.98 $1.02 $0.95 $5.60 $0.78 $0.79 $6.25 $0.78 $0.76 $3.25 $2.06 $27.59 $0.99 $0.96 $23.84 $1.42

5
Non-Adhering Dressing, Shur #77042 

or equal, 3” x 8”, 50/bx
No Bid $0.296 $0.351 $2.390 $0.160 $2.332 $0.279 $0.941 $0.243 $0.560 $0.392 No Bid $0.123 $0.578 No Bid $0.506 $0.437 No Bid $0.142 $0.326

Box Count 144.00 50.00 1.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 24.00 50.00 75.00 50.00 144.00 50.00 50.00 50.00

Box Cost $42.67 $17.56 $2.39 $8.00 $116.61 $13.93 $47.04 $12.15 $13.44 $19.61 $9.20 $28.89 $72.84 $21.85 $7.11 $16.31

6

Hydrogen Peroxide Solution 10 

volume, Swan #0869 0871 43 or 

equal, local antiseptic, 16 oz plastic 

btl, 12/cs

No Bid $0.960 $0.660 $1.210 $0.500 $0.573 $0.600 $0.663 No Bid $0.680 $0.588 $1.850 $0.654 $0.593 No Bid $0.574 $0.638 $0.494 No Bid $18.707

Case Count 12.00 1.00 1.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 1.00 12.00 24.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00

Case Cost $11.52 $0.66 $1.21 $6.00 $6.88 $7.20 $7.95 $8.16 $7.06 $1.85 $7.85 $14.23 $6.89 $7.65 $5.93 $224.48

7

Sodium Chloride Irrigation Solution  

0.9%, Baxter #2F7122 or equal, 

250ml btl, 24/cs

No Bid $2.510 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.375 No Bid $3.852 No Bid $1.100 No Bid No Bid $1.303 $6.390 No Bid $4.214 $2.021 $4.863 No Bid No Bid

Case Count 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 12.00 24.00 24.00 24.00

Case Cost $60.24 $225.00 $92.45 $26.40 $31.28 $76.68 $101.13 $48.50 $116.70

8
Sterile Water for Irrigation, Baxter 

#2F7112 or equal, 250 ml/btl, 24/cs
No Bid $4.340 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.240 No Bid $4.165 No Bid $1.100 $1.544 $0.129 $1.360 $7.301 No Bid $4.501 $1.971 $4.979 No Bid No Bid

Case Count 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 24.00

Case Cost $104.16 $125.76 $99.95 $26.40 $37.06 $3.10 $32.64 $175.23 $108.03 $47.30 $119.50

9
Odor Eliminator, Dermarite #00257 or 

equal, Bye Bye Apricot, 48/cs
No Bid $26.800 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.938 $1.359 $10.954 No Bid No Bid $1.336 No Bid $1.385 $3.381 No Bid $1.563 $1.703 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Case Count 12.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00

Case Cost $321.60 $93.00 $65.24 $525.80 $64.12 $66.46 $162.29 $75.00 $81.75

10
Hand Sanitizer w/ vitamin E, Select 

Medical #1067 or equal, 4 oz, 48/cs
No Bid $2.100 $2.250 $1.940 No Bid $1.811 $0.325 $0.665 $4.480 No Bid $0.557 No Bid $1.155 $1.263 $1.283 No Bid $0.857 $3.140 $1.586 $0.670 $1.750

Case Count 24.00 1.00 1.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 1.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 48.00 24.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 24.00

Case Cost $50.40 $2.25 $1.94 $86.95 $15.60 $31.90 $4.48 $13.37 $27.73 $30.30 $61.56 $20.56 $150.70 $76.13 $32.14 $42.00

11
Lubricating Jelly, HR Pharma #136 or 

equal, 5 oz tube, 12/cs
No Bid $1.560 $0.420 No Bid No Bid $1.333 $3.510 $1.371 No Bid $1.170 $0.837 No Bid $1.013 $2.017 No Bid $1.113 $1.750 No Bid $1.383 No Bid

Cost per Oz $0.390 $0.099 $0.333 $0.702 $0.343 $0.293 $0.167 $0.253 $0.504 $0.278 $0.438 $0.346

Case Count 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 72.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 72.00

did not agree to extend 

pricing for an additional 30 

days 
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Care 
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Medical
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Health Corp

did not agree to extend 

pricing for an additional 30 

days 

Case Cost $18.72 $5.04 $16.00 $42.12 $16.45 $14.04 $60.29 $12.15 $24.20 $13.35 $21.00 $99.58

12

Antibiotic Ointment (Triple), Bacitracin, 

400 units, Neomycin Sulfate, 5mg, 

Polymyxin-B Sulfate 5000 units, 

Inactive Ingrediant: Petrolatum, 1.0gm 

pkt, 144 pkt/bx

$0.087 $0.135 $0.081 $0.129 No Bid $0.117 $0.120 $0.069 No Bid $0.082 $0.072 $0.087 $0.081 $0.127 No Bid $0.052 $0.077 $0.065 $0.109 $0.142

Box Count 144.00 10.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00

Box Cost $12.50 $1.35 $11.61 $18.56 $16.80 $17.25 $9.95 $11.78 $10.37 $12.50 $11.71 $18.22 $7.46 $11.15 $9.37 $15.71 $20.47

13

Hydrocortisone Cream 1%, temporary 

relief of itching associated with minor 

skin irritation, inflammation and 

rashes, net weight: 1.0g, 144/bx

$0.077 $0.074 $0.085 $0.101 No Bid $0.089 $0.083 $0.097 No Bid $0.074 $0.075 $0.087 $1.430 $0.121 $0.049 $0.087 $0.095 $0.056 No Bid $0.139

Box Count 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 1.00 144.00 144.00 288.00 144.00 144.00 144.00

Box Cost $11.08 $10.62 $12.28 $14.53 $12.80 $11.90 $13.98 $10.70 $10.74 $12.50 $1.43 $17.43 $7.00 $25.11 $13.75 $8.11 $19.98

14

Eye Wash, Ingredients: Purified water 

98%, Calcium Gluconate 1%, 

Benzalkonium Choride, Boric Acid, 

Sodium Borate, Sodium Chloride, 4 

oz.

No Bid $2.460 $2.250 $2.800 No Bid No Bid $4.670 $2.450 No Bid No Bid $10.590 $3.750 $1.640 $14.220 $2.410 $4.440 $4.350 No Bid No Bid $2.530

Bottle Count 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

Bottle Cost $2.46 $2.25 $2.80 $4.67 $2.45 $10.59 $3.75 $1.64 $14.22 $2.41 $4.44 $4.35 $2.53

15

Hand Instant Sanitizer, Gojo Purell 

#9631-24 or equal, waterless w/ aloe, 

4 oz. flip cap bottle

No Bid $1.020 $2.250 $2.145 No Bid No Bid $1.980 $1.950 No Bid $0.690 $1.741 $3.750 $1.263 $3.260 No Bid $1.998 $53.000 $38.230 $5.870 $2.590

Bottle Count 1.00 1.00 24.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 24.00 1.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

Bottle Cost $1.02 $2.25 $51.48 $1.98 $1.95 $0.69 $41.79 $3.75 $30.30 $78.25 $47.95 $53.00 $38.23 $5.87 $2.59

16

TB Safety Syringe, Kendall 

#8881511201 or equal, 1ml, 28g x 

1.2”, 100/bx

No Bid $0.019 No Bid $0.426 No Bid $0.143 $0.261 $0.405 $0.299 $0.210 $0.231 No Bid $0.236 $0.902 No Bid $0.416 $0.314 $0.290 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 500.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00

Box Cost $9.55 $42.61 $14.25 $26.07 $40.45 $29.87 $21.00 $23.06 $23.55 $90.24 $41.56 $31.39 $28.95

17

Syringe, BD #305271, Integra 

needle/syringe w/ detachable needle, 

sterile, latex-free, 3cc 23g x 1", 100/bx  

No Substitute 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.600 No Bid $0.600 $2.680 $0.470 No Bid No Bid $0.544 $0.913 No Bid $0.604 $0.980 $0.646 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 100.00 100.00 1.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00

Box Cost $60.00 $59.95 $2.68 $46.95 $54.39 $91.25 $60.41 $98.00 $64.56

18

Syringe, BD #309625, tuberculin with 

precision glide, detachable needle, 

slip tip, intradermal bevel, 26g x 3/8", 

1mL, 100/bx  No Substitute

No Bid $0.1433 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1500 $0.1802 $0.2095 No Bid $0.1655 No Bid No Bid $0.1567 $0.3235 No Bid $0.2166 $0.1949 $0.2275 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00

Box Cost $14.33 $15.00 $18.02 $20.95 $16.55 $15.67 $32.35 $21.66 $19.49 $22.75

19

Needle only, BD #305125 Precision 

glide hypodermic needles, regular 

wall, regular bevel, sterile, latex-free, 

25g x 1", 100/bx  No Substitute

No Bid $0.080 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.077 $0.081 $0.090 $0.136 $0.078 No Bid No Bid $0.074 $0.140 No Bid $0.094 $0.088 $0.098 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00

Box Cost $7.96 $7.71 $8.12 $8.95 $13.63 $7.75 $7.42 $14.02 $9.39 $8.75 $9.75

20

Lancets, Medipurpose #SLN100, 

safety, 26g x 1mm, color: yellow, 

100/bx  No Substitute

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.123 $0.119 $0.119 $0.213 $0.098 $0.143 No Bid $0.105 $0.221 No Bid No Bid $0.243 $0.094 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
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pricing for an additional 30 

days 

Box Cost $12.25 $11.88 $11.85 $21.34 $9.80 $14.33 $10.52 $22.12 $24.30 $9.36

21

Lancets, Medipurpose #SLN240 or 

equal, safety, 22g x 2.2mm, needle is 

concealed before and after use, pre-

armed and ready to use, color: 

orange, 100/bx

No Bid $0.141 $0.189 No Bid No Bid $0.123 $0.150 $0.119 $0.213 $0.098 $0.085 No Bid $0.105 $0.209 No Bid $0.192 $0.243 $0.094 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 200.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00

Box Cost $14.10 $18.93 $12.25 $15.00 $11.85 $21.34 $9.80 $17.09 $10.53 $20.90 $19.23 $24.30 $9.36

22

Lancets, Medipurpose #SLN300 or 

equal, safety, 21g x 2.8mm, needle is 

concealed before and after use, pre-

armed and ready to use, color: pink, 

100/bx

No Bid $0.141 $0.189 No Bid No Bid $0.123 No Bid $0.119 $0.213 $0.080 $0.085 No Bid $0.104 $0.191 No Bid No Bid $0.243 $0.094 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 200.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00

Box Cost $14.10 $18.93 $12.25 $11.85 $21.34 $7.95 $17.09 $10.37 $19.06 $24.30 $9.36

23

Vacutainer, BD #367285, blood 

collection and infusion set w/ luer 

adapter, 25g x 0.75" needle x 12" 

tubing, 50/bx  No Substitute

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.330 No Bid $1.359 $4.670 $1.059 No Bid No Bid $1.142 $1.955 No Bid $5.440 $1.233 $1.471 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 50.00 50.00 1.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00

Box Cost $66.51 $67.95 $4.67 $52.95 $57.09 $97.77 $272.00 $61.65 $73.53

24

Vacutainer, BD #367283, blood 

collection and infusion set w/ luer 

adapter, 23g x 0.75" needle x 12" 

tubing, 50/bx  No Substitute

No Bid $1.170 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.258 No Bid $1.319 $4.670 $1.030 No Bid No Bid $1.130 $1.955 No Bid $5.260 $1.233 $1.428 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 50.00 50.00 50.00 1.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00

Box Cost $58.50 $62.92 $65.95 $4.67 $51.50 $56.50 $97.77 $263.00 $61.65 $71.38

25

Catheter Tray, Amsino International 

#AS870 or equal, urethral, 14 fr, latex-

free, sterile 

$1.510 No Bid $6.932 No Bid No Bid $1.825 $1.830 $1.890 $2.304 $1.650 $1.270 No Bid $1.480 $5.280 No Bid No Bid $1.800 $39.290 No Bid No Bid

Case Count 1.00 10.00 20.00 1.00 1.00 20.00 1.00 24.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

Case Cost $1.51 $69.32 $36.50 $1.83 $1.89 $46.08 $1.65 $30.49 $1.48 $5.28 $1.80 $39.29

26

Irrigation Tray Sterile Saline, Welyn 

#6122 or equal, thumb control ring 

piston syringe, 60cc piston syringe w/ 

sterile saline, 20/cs

$0.895 $1.221 $0.064 No Bid No Bid $2.864 $3.570 $1.098 No Bid $1.840 $1.061 No Bid $2.520 $1.000 $2.645 No Bid $1.394 $1.050 $4.835 No Bid No Bid

Case Count 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 1.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00

Case Cost $17.90 $24.41 $1.27 $57.28 $71.40 $21.95 $36.80 $21.22 $2.52 $20.00 $52.89 $27.88 $21.00 $96.69

27
Cath Straps, Dale #136 or equal, latex 

free, washable,12/bx
$1.260 No Bid $32.070 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.630 $0.796 No Bid $2.858 $2.246 No Bid $5.042 $0.986 No Bid $2.655 $0.538 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Box Count 50.00 1.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 10.00 12.00 10.00 12.00

Box Cost $63.00 $32.07 $55.56 $9.55 $34.30 $26.95 $50.42 $11.83 $26.55 $6.45

28

Alcohol Wipes, IMCO #2954-11-

30001 or equal, sterile, 2 ply saturated 

w/ 70% Alcohol, 200/bx, 20 bx/cs

$0.0033 $0.0071 $0.0268 $0.0754 $0.0049 $0.0078 $0.0088 $0.0112 No Bid $0.0060 $0.0070 $0.0250 $0.0073 $0.0798 $0.0003 $5.2367 $0.0004 $0.0096 $0.0084 $0.0109

Case Count 4000.00 4000.00 50.00 100.00 4000.00 2000.00 4000.00 4000.00 2000.00 4000.00 100.00 4000.00 1000.00 4000.00 12.00 4000.00 4000.00 2000.00 4000.00

Case Cost $13.10 $28.40 $1.34 $7.54 $19.60 $15.50 $35.00 $44.95 $11.90 $27.80 $2.50 $29.22 $79.84 $1.37 $62.84 $1.75 $38.48 $16.83 $43.60

29

Sterile Cotton Tipped Applicators, 

Dynarex #4304 or equal, 6”, 100/bx, 

10 bx/cs

$0.004 $0.028 $0.007 $0.038 No Bid $0.023 $0.002 $0.027 $0.071 $0.021 $0.003 $0.010 $0.023 $0.022 $0.020 $0.024 $0.019 $0.003 $0.029 $0.026 $0.767

Case Count 10000.00 100.00 1000.00 200.00 100.00 1000.00 1000.00 100.00 100.00 1000.00 1000.00 100.00 100.00 1000.00 100.00 200.00 1000.00 1000.00 100.00 100.00

Case Cost $35.90 $2.78 $6.85 $7.64 $2.25 $2.40 $27.45 $7.08 $2.05 $3.36 $9.90 $2.34 $2.22 $19.80 $2.39 $3.88 $3.15 $29.38 $2.55 $76.70

No Award for Item NO AWARD
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30
Lemon Glycerin Swabs, Triad #10-

4002 or equal, 75/bx, 10 bx/cs
$0.114 $0.064 $0.144 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.031 $0.043 $0.269 $0.132 $0.036 No Bid $0.108 $0.037 $0.065 No Bid $0.033 $0.004 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Case Count 250.00 500.00 25.00 750.00 750.00 25.00 750.00 750.00 250.00 750.00 750.00 750.00 750.00

Case Cost $28.44 $31.90 $3.61 $23.20 $31.95 $6.72 $98.80 $26.76 $27.11 $27.52 $48.70 $24.94 $3.25

31
Batteries, 3 volt lithium, Duracell 

#CR2032 or equal, 5/pkg
No Bid $1.420 $1.611 $1.400 No Bid No Bid $1.260 $1.242 No Bid No Bid $1.404 No Bid $0.500 $6.781 $1.450 No Bid $0.761 $0.172 No Bid $1.596 $0.128 $1.560

Package Count 5.00 12.00 1.00 5.00 6.00 5.00 5.00 10.00 5.00 10.00 5.00 5.00 250.00 5.00

Package Cost $7.10 $19.33 $1.40 $6.30 $7.45 $7.02 $2.50 $67.81 $7.25 $7.61 $0.86 $7.98 $32.05 $7.80

32

Acetaminophen Non-Aspirin, Extra 

Strength, generic pain reliever/fever 

reducer, 500 mg/tablet, 2 tablets/pkt, 

250 pkt/bx

No Bid $0.006 $0.041 $0.036 No Bid No Bid $0.053 $0.071 No Bid No Bid $0.010 $0.066 $0.014 $0.064 $0.029 $1.190 $0.069 $0.049 No Bid $0.596

Box Count 600.00 125.00 500.00 250.00 250.00 1000.00 250.00 100.00 200.00 250.00 1.00 250.00 250.00 250.00

Box Cost 3.78 $5.17 $17.98 $13.25 $17.75 $9.76 $16.50 $1.35 $12.72 $7.23 $1.19 $17.25 $12.32 $148.90

33

Aspirin, (NSAID) 325 mg per tablet, 

pain reliever/fever reducer/ 

nonsteroidal anti-inflammatory drug, 2 

tablets/pkt, 250 pkt/bx

No Bid $0.003 $0.032 $0.025 No Bid $0.040 $0.044 $0.039 No Bid No Bid $0.014 $0.050 $0.013 No Bid $0.031 $1.510 $0.048 $0.036 No Bid No Bid

Box Count 750.00 100.00 500.00 250.00 250.00 250.00 100.00 250.00 100.00 250.00 1.00 250.00 250.00

Box Cost $2.43 $3.21 $12.37 $10.00 $11.00 $9.75 $1.35 $12.50 $1.25 $7.70 $1.51 $12.05 $9.04

34

Ibuprofen (NSAID) Tablets, generic 

pain reliever/fever reducer 

nonsteroidal anti-inflammatory drug, 

generic, 200 mg/tablet, 2 tablets/pkt, 

200 pkt/bx

No Bid $0.012 $0.051 $0.041 No Bid No Bid $0.120 $0.105 No Bid No Bid $0.020 $0.098 $0.017 No Bid $0.054 $1.720 $0.076 $0.069 No Bid $0.095

Box Count 750.00 125.00 500.00 200.00 200.00 100.00 200.00 100.00 200.00 1.00 200.00 200.00 250.00

Box Cost $9.08 $6.37 $20.51 $23.96 $20.95 $1.96 $19.50 $1.73 $10.84 $1.72 $15.25 $13.83 $23.81

35

Antacid Tablets, calcium carbonate, 

420 mg/tablet, 2 tablets/pkt, 250 

pkt/bx

No Bid $0.005 $0.036 $0.032 No Bid No Bid $0.052 $0.098 No Bid No Bid $0.014 $0.057 $0.050 $0.014 No Bid No Bid $4.320 $0.080 $0.046 No Bid $0.124

Box Count 600.00 125.00 500.00 250.00 250.00 150.00 250.00 500.00 150.00 1.00 250.00 250.00 100.00

Box Cost $3.02 $4.54 $15.87 $13.00 $24.45 $2.12 $14.25 $25.17 $2.16 $4.32 $20.10 $11.57 $12.38

36

Defibrillator Accessories, Zoll AED 

Plus or equal, 2 piece electrode pads 

with HVP gel. Stat Padz #II-8900-

0801-01, 2/set

No Bid $20.345 $20.000 $32.065 No Bid $32.260 No Bid $31.225 No Bid $24.000 $41.140 $97.750 $50.930 $83.990 $74.500 $65.650 $22.285 $35.860 No Bid $22.885

Set Count 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 1.00 2.00 2.00 1.00 2.00 2.00 2.00

Set Cost $40.69 $40.00 $64.13 $64.52 $62.45 $48.00 $82.28 $195.50 $50.93 $167.98 $149.00 $65.65 $44.57 $71.72 $45.77

37

Defibrillator Accessories, Zoll AED 

Plus or equal, 2 piece electrode pads 

with HVP gel. Pedi Padz #II-8900-

0810-01, 2/set

No Bid $20.35 $45.00 $51.63 No Bid $49.88 No Bid $49.98 No Bid $38.73 No Bid $59.25 No Bid No Bid $57.65 $47.50 $101.49 $50.88 $57.75 No Bid $43.23

Set Count 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 1.00 2.00 2.00 2.00

Set Cost $40.69 $90.00 $103.26 $99.75 $99.95 $77.45 $118.50 $115.29 $95.00 $101.49 $101.75 $115.49 $86.45

38

Pen lights, disposable, comes with 

plastic sleeve to protect batteries, 

6/pk

$0.625 $0.662 $0.923 $1.733 No Bid $0.758 $1.210 $1.125 No Bid $0.825 $0.665 No Bid $1.143 $2.275 $0.632 $1.065 $0.775 $0.775 No Bid $1.018

Pack Count 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00

Pack Cost $3.75 $3.97 $5.54 $10.40 $4.55 $7.26 $6.75 $4.95 $3.99 $6.86 $13.65 $3.79 $6.39 $4.65 $4.65 $6.11

39

Pregnancy Tests, ACON #FHC-102 or 

equal, hCG urine test device, FDA 

cleared and CLIA waived, 40/bx

No Bid $1.504 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.859 $1.739 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.364 $0.721 No Bid $1.120 $0.309 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Box Count 25.00 35.00 40.00 25.00 50.00 25.00 40.00

Box Cost $37.61 $65.06 $69.56 $9.11 $36.04 $28.00 $12.35
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40

Sharps Biohazard Collector, B-D 

#300467 or equal, 6.9 qt, plastic, 

color: red, one-piece with regular 

funnel entry w/ two handles, must not 

be able to see through container, 

11.5” x 8.75” x 5.5”, 10/cs

No Bid $3.517 $0.922 $13.030 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.395 No Bid No Bid $6.552 $14.500 $5.362 $14.256 No Bid $2.561 $0.495 $0.859 No Bid No Bid

Case Count 12.00 10.00 1.00 10.00 12.00 1.00 12.00 10.00 20.00 10.00 10.00

Case Cost $42.20 $9.22 $13.03 $83.95 $78.62 $14.50 $64.34 $142.56 $51.21 $4.95 $8.59

41
Thigh Inflation System, Tyco or equal, 

2 tubes, black color
No Bid $20.630 $36.430 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.290 $82.500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.690 $23.380 No Bid $14.130 $25.500 $17.320 No Bid No Bid

Each Count 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

Each Cost $20.63 $36.43 $42.29 $82.50 $50.69 $23.38 $14.13 $25.50 $17.32

42
Tongue Wood Depressors, 6”x ¾”, 

non-sterile, 100/bx
$0.0074 $0.0109 $0.0084 $0.0224 No Bid No Bid $0.0270 $0.0245 $46.4900 $0.0068 $0.0073 $0.0970 $0.0067 $0.0296 $0.0245 $0.0222 $0.0445 $0.0456 $0.1087 $0.0615

Box Count 5000.00 500.00 500.00 500.00 100.00 100.00 1.00 500.00 500.00 500.00 500.00 100.00 100.00 250.00 100.00 100.00 500.00 100.00

Box Cost $36.90 $5.43 $4.20 $11.21 $2.70 $2.45 $46.49 $3.40 $3.64 $48.50 $3.34 $2.96 $2.45 $5.56 $4.45 $4.56 $54.34 $6.15

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor


