
3-YEAR CONTRACT TO PROVIDE BEDDING & LINEN SUPPLIES

Spec #32-08/17

Various Departments

Description

ATD-

AMERICAN Bob Barker

First 

Choice 

Med 

Supply

Harbor 

Linen

Joseph 

Gartland

King of 

Prussia 

Pharmacy 

Services

McKesson 

Medical-

Surgical 

Minnesota 

Supply Inc.

Mill 

Distributor

Sigmatex 

Lanier 

Textile

Standard 

Textile Co

Tabb 

Textiles

Tabb 

Textiles     

Alt #1

Victory 

Supply Inc

1

Wash Cloth, 12" x 12", 

86% cotton / 14% poly 

blend, 1 lb/dz, 

heavyweight, 1st 

quality, color: white

0.2533 0.1750 0.2450 0.2067 0.2458 0.2458 0.4977 0.2500 0.3625 0.2100 0.2292 0.1542 NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 60 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $3.04 $2.10 $2.94 $2.48 $2.95 $2.95 $29.86 $3.00 $4.35 $2.52 $2.75 $1.85

2

Wash Cloth, 12" x 12", 

100% cotton, 1 lb/dz, 

color: white

NO BID $0.2100 $0.2000 $0.2475 NO BID $0.2458 $0.2613 $0.2100 $0.4583 $0.1600 $0.2292 $0.1542 NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12 60 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $2.52 $2.40 $2.97 $2.95 $15.68 $2.52 $5.50 $1.92 $2.75 $1.85

3

Terry Towel, 24" x 50", 

85% cotton / 15% poly 

blend, 10 lb/dz, 

heavyweight, 1st 

quality, color: white

$2.331 $1.817 $2.332 $2.070 NO BID $2.583 $4.590 $2.440 $3.450 $3.080 $1.663 $2.079 $2.23

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $27.97 $21.80 $27.98 $24.84 $31.00 $55.08 $29.28 $41.40 $36.96 $19.95 $24.95 $26.77

4

Terry Towel, 25" x 50", 

100% cotton, 1st 

quality, 13 lb/dz, color: 

white

$3.490 $1.949 $5.547 $4.164 NO BID $5.413 $5.815 $4.140 NO BID $3.460 $3.250 $3.250 $2.32

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $41.88 $23.39 $66.56 $49.97 $64.95 $69.78 $49.68 $41.52 $39.00 $39.00 $27.78

5

Bath Towel, 27" x 54", 

100% cotton, 17 lb/dz, 

color: white

NO BID NO BID $5.22 $5.63 NO BID $7.45 $7.88 $1.80 $6.91 $5.01 NO BID NO BID $5.58

Case Count 12 12 12 12 36 12 12 12

Case Cost $62.60 $67.50 $89.40 $94.50 $64.92 $82.95 $60.12 $66.97

6

Bath Blanket, multi-

purpose, 66" x 90",  

80% cotton / 20% poly 

blend, loom-woven, 1.6 

lb/dz, color: white with 

color borders

NO BID NO BID $4.69 NO BID NO BID $3.61 $1.06 NO BID NO BID $3.83 NO BID NO BID $5.81

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $56.32 $43.33 $12.76 $45.96 $69.75

7

Pillow, 21" x 27", non-

flammable, poly filled, 

Staph check

NO BID $6.98 $4.87 $4.09 NO BID $4.60 $6.46 $5.07 NO BID $2.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Case Count 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

Case Cost $6.98 $4.87 $4.09 $4.60 $6.46 $5.07 $2.93

8

Pillow 20" x 26", 

Lightweight Poly Core / 

Vinyl, Flame-resistant 

core of 100% poly fiber. 

PVC coated taffeta knit 

cover, Wipe clean 

(soap), 4/cs

NO BID $5.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.99 $15.71 NO BID NO BID $2.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Case Count 4 4 4 4

Case Cost $23.56 $3.95 $62.84 $10.64

9

Pillow Case, 20½" x 31 

¾", T180, standard 

size, 50% cotton / 50% 

polyester blend, color: 

bleached white

$1.00 $0.99 $1.24 $0.85 NO BID $0.94 $1.43 $1.12 $1.28 $0.86 $1.01 $1.01 NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $11.94 $11.90 $14.93 $10.19 $11.30 $17.17 $13.44 $15.35 $10.32 $12.15 $12.15

10

Flat Sheet, 54" x 90", 

T180, Twin, 55% cotton 

/ 45% polyester blend, 

color: white

$3.27 $3.21 $4.14 $2.79 NO BID $3.35 NO BID $4.99 $5.08 $3.60 $2.60 $2.60 $3.07

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $39.27 $38.56 $49.70 $33.48 $40.15 $59.88 $61.00 $43.20 $31.15 $31.15 $36.81
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11

Flat Sheet, 66" x 104", 

T-180, regular flat, 50% 

cotton / 50% polyester 

blend, Color: white

$4.32 $4.08 $5.16 $3.91 NO BID $4.46 $5.23 $4.85 $5.43 $3.74 $3.92 $3.92 $3.32

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $51.88 $48.90 $61.87 $46.88 $53.55 $62.70 $58.20 $65.20 $44.88 $47.00 $47.00 $39.81

12

Fitted Sheet, 36" x 75"x 

6", T180, Twin, 55% 

cotton / 45% polyester 

blend, color: white

NO BID $3.58 $4.58 $3.70 NO BID $8.42 NO BID NO BID $7.83 $3.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $42.90 $54.90 $44.37 $101.00 $93.95 $44.04

13

Contour Sheet, 36" x 

84" x 9", fitted, 50% 

cotton / 50% polyester 

blend, cotton/knitted 

soft, color: solid colors

$3.22 NO BID $4.31 $10.49 NO BID $4.14 $8.04 $3.50 NO BID $10.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $38.68 $51.70 $125.84 $49.65 $96.43 $42.00 $121.92

14

Contour Sheet, 38" x 

86" x 9", fitted, 50% 

cotton / 50% polyester 

blend, cotton/knitted 

soft, color: white only

NO BID NO BID $4.04 $7.99 NO BID $4.73 NO BID $3.50 NO BID $3.50 $3.42 $3.42 $4.09

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $48.47 $95.92 $56.70 $42.00 $42.00 $41.00 $41.00 $49.11

15

Percale Contour Sheet, 

36" x 84" x 9", T-180, 

fitted, 50% cotton / 50% 

polyester blend, color: 

white

NO BID NO BID $4.43 $3.99 NO BID $4.15 $8.04 $4.70 $4.53 $3.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $53.12 $47.88 $49.80 $96.43 $56.40 $54.30 $44.04

16

Percale Contour Sheet, 

54" x 80" x 9", T-180, 

fitted 50% cotton / 50% 

polyester blend, color: 

blue

NO BID NO BID $7.13 $8.75 NO BID $11.81 $1.06 $8.27 $8.75 $7.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $85.57 $104.95 $141.70 $12.76 $99.24 $105.00 $95.40

17

Muslin Draw Sheet, 54" 

x 72" or 54" x 81" 55% 

cotton / 45% polyester 

blend, colors: solid 

colors and/or white

NO BID NO BID $2.87 $8.02 NO BID $2.46 $5.40 $2.42 NO BID $1.80 NO BID NO BID $3.26

Case Count 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $34.40 $96.25 $29.50 $64.83 $29.04 $21.60 $39.11

18

Thermal Blanket, 66" x 

90", snag free, 100% 

cotton heavyweight 

thermal weave, color: 

white

$5.94 $6.46 $6.23 $5.12 NO BID $2.46 $10.99 $6.30 $8.00 $6.16 $5.15 $5.15 $5.69

Case Count 12 1 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $71.28 $6.46 $74.80 $61.44 $29.50 $131.84 $75.60 $96.00 $73.92 $61.80 $61.80 $68.31

19

Thermal Blanket, 74" x 

108", snag free, 100% 

cotton heavyweight 

thermal weave, color: 

blue

$12.88 $16.80 $16.06 NO BID NO BID $18.33 $27.25 $16.73 $17.50 $12.39 $8.50 $8.50 $11.93

Case Count 12 10 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $154.56 $167.98 $192.74 $220.00 $327.04 $200.76 $210.00 $148.68 $102.00 $102.00 $143.11

20

Cozy Blanket, 66" x 

90", color: gray w/ blue 

striping, 15/cs

NO BID $4.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.75 $8.75 $7.30

Case Count 15 12 12 15

No Award
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Case Cost $73.35 $105.00 $105.00 $109.50

21

Wheelchair pads, 17" x 

24", quilted with round 

corners and water 

check barrier inside, 

cotton blend quilting, 

color: white

NO BID NO BID $2.33 $2.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.22 NO BID $4.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Case Count 12 12 12 12

Case Cost $28.00 $26.88 $26.64 $51.96

Advertised in 

Newspaper

Posted on Pennbid

56 Notified

12 Responses

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor


