
3-YEAR CONTRACT TO PROVIDE PATIENT PERSONAL CARE SUPPLIES

Spec #31-08/17

Neshaminy Manor

Description

Agni 

Enterprise

Amercare 

Products

Amercare 

Products

Alt #1 Bob Barker

Care 

Supplies Charm-Tex

CVS 

Pharmacy

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Delcrest 

Medical 

Services

DiaMedical 

USA 

Equipment

Manheim 

Medical 

Supply Inc.

Maven 

Medical

McKesson 

Medical-

Surgical 

Minnesota 

Supply Inc.

McKesson 

Medical

Alt #1

Para 

Scientific

1 Body Wash  Shampoo 8fl oz 0.8835 NO BID 0.4998 0.7467 NO BID 0.6058 NO BID 1.0625 NO BID 0.9365 0.5469 0.6035 NO BID 0.9881 0.5548

Case Count 48.00 48.00 12.00 24.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00

Case Cost $42.41 $23.99 $8.96 $14.54 $51.00 $44.95 $26.25 $28.97 $47.43 $26.63

2 Roll-On Antiperspirant 1.5 oz 0.4380 NO BID 0.3599 0.3464 0.2698 0.2490 NO BID 0.3214 0.3105 0.4266 0.2760 0.2960 0.3095 NO BID 0.3306

Case Count 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00 96.00

Case Cost $42.05 $34.55 $33.25 $25.90 $23.90 $30.85 $29.81 $40.95 $26.50 $28.42 $29.71 $31.74

3
Toothbrush Total Soft

Full Head
0.0511 0.7519 NO BID 0.2064 0.2090 0.0549 0.2012 NO BID 0.4600 0.4858 0.1292 0.0403 1.2650 NO BID 0.4494

Case Count 1440.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 72.00 144.00

Case Cost $73.55 $108.28 $29.72 $30.10 $7.90 $28.97 $66.24 $69.95 $18.60 $5.80 $91.08 $64.71

4
Toothpaste, Personal Size, 1.5 

oz tube
0.3169 0.1666 NO BID 0.1344 0.1833 0.1590 NO BID 0.2528 0.2055 0.2219 0.1705 0.1934 0.2724 NO BID 0.2417

Case Count 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00

Case Cost $45.64 $23.99 $19.36 $26.40 $22.90 $36.40 $29.59 $31.95 $24.55 $27.85 $39.22 $34.81

5 Alcohol-Free Mouthwash 4oz 0.5703 NO BID NO BID 0.3373 0.3433 NO BID NO BID 0.2993 0.3200 0.3325 0.3000 0.2522 0.2618 NO BID 0.5708

Case Count 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 96.00 60.00 60.00 60.00

Case Cost $34.22 $20.24 $20.60 $17.96 $19.20 $19.95 $28.80 $15.13 $15.71 $34.25

6
Overnight Denture Cleanser 

Tablets
0.05584 NO BID 0.03614 0.02989 0.03500 NO BID 0.02505 0.03883 0.03125 0.04891 NO BID 0.03084 0.03873 NO BID NO BID

Case Count 960.00 960.00 90.00 960.00 960.00 960.00 960.00 960.00 960.00 480.00

Case Cost $53.61 $34.69 $2.69 $33.60 $24.05 $37.28 $30.00 $46.95 $29.61 $18.59

7
Denture Adhesive Powder

2.7 oz
$8.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.74 NO BID $5.99 NO BID NO BID $8.23 $3.71 NO BID $1.51

Case Count 12.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 1.00 24.00

Case Cost $102.97 $113.78 $143.76 $197.52 $3.71 $36.14

8 Oral Swabs NO BID NO BID 0.1948 0.0734 NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0833 0.0718 0.1590 0.0580 0.0684 NO BID 0.0734 0.0984

Case Count 1000.00 500.00 1000.00 1000.00 1000.00 1000.00 1000.00 1000.00 1000.00

Case Cost $194.77 $36.72 $83.28 $71.84 $158.95 $58.00 $68.42 $73.40 $98.38

9
Denture Adhesive Cream

2.4 oz tube
$8.5808 NO BID $0.9600 $1.5417 $4.1500 NO BID $2.5971 $2.9167 $5.4800 $5.4792 $4.8750 $1.5800 NO BID $2.4900 $5.1608

Case Count 12.00 24.00 6.00 24.00 24.00 12.00 24.00 24.00 12.00 24.00 1.00 24.00

Case Cost $102.97 $23.04 $9.25 $99.60 $62.33 $35.00 $131.52 $131.50 $58.50 $37.92 $2.49 $123.86

10 Combs, 7 inch, unbreakable $0.0454 $0.0300 NO BID $0.0414 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0417 $0.0717 $0.0534 $0.0333 $0.0283 $0.0241 NO BID $0.3706

Case Count 1440.00 144.00 144.00 240.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 1440.00 144.00
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Case Cost $65.39 $4.32 $5.96 $10.00 $10.32 $7.69 $4.80 $4.08 $34.76 $53.37

11 Women's Soft Touch Brushes $0.4166 $0.2667 NO BID $0.3117 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.3300 $0.3542 $0.2900 $0.3450 $0.2381 NO BID NO BID

Case Count 288.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 1000.00

Case Cost $119.99 $3.20 $3.74 $3.96 $4.25 $3.48 $4.14 $238.10

12 Emery Boards 4.25" $0.0258 NO BID $0.0191 $0.0132 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0417 $0.0365 $0.0323 $0.0170 $0.0197 NO BID $0.0161 $0.4453

Case Count 3456.00 144.00 100.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 4002.00 144.00

Case Cost $89.10 $2.75 $1.32 $6.00 $5.25 $4.65 $2.45 $2.84 $64.29 $64.12

13 Manicure Sticks 4.5" $0.0157 $0.0123 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0301 $0.0295 $0.0240 $0.0108 $0.0128 NO BID $0.0115 $0.6605

Case Count 7200.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 7200.00 144.00

Case Cost $112.97 $1.77 $4.33 $4.25 $3.45 $1.55 $1.84 $82.51 $95.11

14 Nail Clipper, Large Size $0.3338 NA NA $0.4742 NO BID NO BID $0.3826 $1.8867 $0.6000 $0.5622 $0.4500 $0.2758 $0.4696 NO BID $0.5528

Case Count 288.00 ? ? 12.00 144.00 6.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 144.00 240.00 144.00

Case Cost $96.12 $62.24 $33.00 $5.69 $55.10 $11.32 $86.40 $80.95 $64.80 $39.72 $112.71 $79.60

15 Razors, Twin Blade $0.1690 NO BID NO BID $0.0478 NO BID $0.0790 $0.4304 $0.0851 $0.1731 $0.1290 $0.2790 $0.0822 $0.0674 NO BID $0.2482

Case Count 500.00 600.00 100.00 100.00 2000.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00

Case Cost $84.50 28.69 $7.90 $43.04 $170.17 $17.31 $12.90 $27.90 $8.22 $6.74 $24.82

16
Brushless Shave Cream

11oz can
$0.0622 $1.3025 NO BID $1.8617 $1.1333 NO BID NO BID $0.7467 $1.0200 $1.1625 $1.0167 $0.9317 $0.5308 NO BID $1.3083

Case Count 2000.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 144.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 144.00 12.00

Case Cost $124.44 $15.63 $22.34 $13.60 $107.53 $12.24 $13.95 $12.20 $11.18 $76.43 $15.70

17 Facial Tissue $0.00664 NO BID NO BID $0.58733 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.01060 $0.00676 $0.00739 $0.00470 $0.00548 $0.00748 $0.00583 $0.00024

Case Count 3000.00 30.00 3000.00 3000.00 2700.00 3000.00 3000.00 3000.00 3000.00 3000.00

Case Cost $19.93 $17.62 $31.80 $20.28 $19.95 $14.10 $16.44 $22.43 $17.50 $0.71

18 Dove Soap, 3.5 oz bar $2.14 $0.81 NO BID NO BID $0.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.18 NO BID $1.13 $1.27 $1.53 NO BID NO BID

Case Count 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00 48.00

Case Cost $102.54 $39.00 $41.20 $200.64 $54.00 $60.78 $73.61

19 Moisturizing Lotion 8 oz btl $4.0871 NO BID $0.3400 $0.5498 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.9875 $0.8000 $3.2063 $0.3604 $0.3875 $1.6513 NO BID $0.0267

Case Count 24.00 48.00 48.00 24.00 24.00 24.00 48.00 24.00 24.00 24.00

Case Cost $98.09 $16.32 $26.39 $71.70 $19.20 $76.95 $17.30 $9.30 $39.63 $0.64

20 Shower Caps, Disposable $0.00549 $0.04655 NO BID $0.11340 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.04467 $0.04455 $0.06390 $0.03525 $0.05000 $0.07315 NO BID NO BID

Case Count 2000.00 200.00 100.00 2000.00 200.00 500.00 200.00 200.00 200.00

Case Cost $10.98 $9.31 $11.34 $89.33 $8.91 $31.95 $7.05 $10.00 $14.63
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21 Body Wash Shampoo, 1 Gal $0.99 NO BID NO BID $6.24 NO BID $8.23 NO BID $13.64 NO BID $11.24 $7.40 $8.51 $10.26 NO BID $7.49

Case Count 48.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00 4.00

Case Cost $47.71 $24.96 $32.90 $54.57 $44.95 $29.60 $34.05 $41.04 $29.96

Total $164.70 $5,850.00 - $10,732.80 - - - - - - $41,981.05 - $9,388.62 -

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor


