
Paving at Ten Locations

General Services

Spec #31-08/15

Associated Paving 

Contractors Clearwater Construction Crisdel Group

H & K (Haines & 

Kibblehouse)

CORE CREEK $332,782.40 $643,652.50 $380,009.50 No Bid

PEACE VALLEY $405,750.00 $703,420.00 $409,927.50 $409,695.00

TOHICKON VALLEY No Bid $397,213.00 $220,672.00 No Bid

BUILDING “K” $60,024.00 $98,083.00 $67,810.00 No Bid

BUILDING “G” – FRONT $53,440.00 $96,708.00 $63,256.00 No Bid

BUILDING “G” – REAR $61,010.00 $111,525.00 $74,111.00 No Bid

EMERGENCY SERVICES CENTER $118,911.00 $194,769.00 $129,552.00 No Bid

DISTRICT COURT 07-1-09 $33,660.00 $67,686.00 $47,672.00 No Bid

DISTRICT COURT 07-1-03 $24,840.00 $74,654.00 $58,050.00 No Bid

*Should be $37,090.00

BUILDING “S” $41,650.00 $124,281.50 $56,820.00 No Bid

Awarded Total $1,144,317.40 $220,672.00

Advertised in Newspaper

Posted on Public Purchase

496 Invited

32 Planholders

4 Responses

3 No Responses
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