
No. Description Type UOM Quantity Haines Paving Inc. James D. Morrissey GoreCon Inc. Marino Corporation Monster Paving

110 Peace Valley Park Location Base Bid Base LS 1 No bid $454,370.05 $565,463.88 $574,990.70 No bid

111 Peace Valley Park Allowance Base Allowance 1 - $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00 -

120

Moravian Tile Works and Ranger Annex Station 

Location Base Bid Base LS 1 $112,397.50 $112,024.00 $148,762.98 $150,919.00 No bid

121

Moravian Tile Works and Ranger Annex Station 

Allowance Base Allowance 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 -

130 Neshaminy Manor Location Base Bid Base LS 1 $53,217.10 $61,765.10 $63,651.90 $72,132.80 No bid

131 Neshaminy Manor Allowance Base Allowance 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 -

210

Lower Bucks County Government Center 

Location Base Bid Base LS 1 $226,811.60 $283,947.80 $420,865.95 $338,270.50 $398,728.70 

211

Lower Bucks County Government Center 

Allowance Base Allowance 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

220 Delaware River Access Area Location Base Bid Base LS 1 $187,080.00 $214,705.00 $207,061.47 $239,340.00 $289,860.00 

221 Delaware River Access AreaAllowance Base Allowance 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 

310 District Court 07-3-03 Base Bid Option LS 1 $24,272.15 $32,503.00 $39,245.44 $91,080.20 No bid

311 District Court 07-3-03 Allowance Option Allowance 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 -

410 District Court 07-1-10 Base Bid Option LS 1 No bid $77,934.00 $85,066.07 $92,478.00 No bid

411 District Court 07-1-10 Allowance Option Allowance 1 - $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 -

500

Discount for multiple location award. (The 

discount will apply to any combination of 

multiple award locations within a Group and will 

apply to ALL awarded locations within the Group) Option LS 1 $100.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Lower Bucks Group:

Add Alternate #1 District Court 07-3-03:

Add Alternate #2 District Court 07-1-10:

Spec #30-07/20

Site Paving at Select Central and Lower Bucks Locations

Please note, the amounts shown are the numbers that were read at the public bid opening and do not reflect any evaluation and 

do not indicate an intent to award.

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed 

on the day of the bid opening.

Central Bucks Group:


