
Item Description

Unit Of

Measure

10 Containers, 32 oz. foam ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0942 0.1020

11 Lids for above 32 oz. Containers ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0429 0.0580

20 Container, Dart or equal, foam, 4 oz squat white ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0220 0.0280

20.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dart PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 Container, Dart or equal, foam, 8 oz squat ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0394 0.0500

30.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dart PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 Cups, 8 oz. foam ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0206 0.0260

41 Lids for above 8 oz. Cups ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0158 0.0190

50 Cups, 16 oz. foam ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0423 0.0540

51 Lids for above 16 oz. Cups, ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0183 0.0230

60 Cup, Dart #5N25 or equal, 5 oz. ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

60.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dart PRODUCT ea   No Bid  0.0103 0.0101 0.0180

70 Medicine Cup, 1 oz ea   No Bid  0.0050 0.0062 0.0060

80 Paper Soufflé Cup, American Convenience or equal, 1 oz ea   No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid

80.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL American Convenience PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0066 0.0090

90 Plastic Soufflé Portion cup, Monogram or equal, clear, 2 oz ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

90.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Monogram PRODUCT ea   No Bid  0.0075 0.0080 0.0120

91 Lids for above, Monogram or equal, flat, clear portion, 2 oz ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

91.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Monogram PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0079 0.0100

100 Plate, Monogram or equal, paper, 9" ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid
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100.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Monogram PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0335 0.0200

110 Plate, Chinet or equal, 8.5" ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

110.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Chinet PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0852 0.0970

120 Plate, Dart Concorde  #CPWCR or equal, foam, 6" ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0160 No Bid

120.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dart PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid 0.0210

130 Bowl, Dart #BW1260 or equal, foam, 12 oz ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0321 No Bid

130.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dart PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid 0.0350

140 Tray, Monogram or equal, paperboard food tray ea   NoBid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

140.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Monogram PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0159 0.0540

150 Napkin, Georgia Pacific or equal, luncheon white, 12.5" x 11.68" ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

150.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Georgia Pacific PRODUCT ea   No Bid  0.0031 0.0033 0.0050

160 Fork, Monogram or equal, medium weight ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

160.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Monogram PRODUCT ea 0.0088 0.0049 0.0051 0.0070

170 Spoon, tea, Monogram or equal, medium weight ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

170.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Monogram PRODUCT ) ea 0.0088 0.0049 0.0051 0.0070

180 Spoon, soup, Monogram or equal medium weight ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

180.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Monogram PRODUCT ea 0.0088 0.0049 0.0051 0.0070

190 Knife, Berk Enterprises or equal, medium weight ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

190.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Berk Enterprises PRODUCT ea 0.0088 0.0049 0.0051 0.0070

200 Straws, Flexible, Clear ea   No Bid  0.0027 0.0026 0.0040
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210 Aluminum Foil, 18" x 1000' ea   No Bid  24.7800 23.4300 53.0000

220 Plastic Film Wrap, 18" x 2000'  ea 17.9700  No Bid 12.9800 17.2500

230 Parchment Paper, sheet pan size approx 16 3/8" x 24 3/8" ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0317 0.0360

240 Hotel pan, Pansaver or equal, 6" x 34" x 18" ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.5860 0.6500

240.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Pansaver PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.5860 No Bid

250 Bun pan cover, 27" x 37", 13 microns (must be a food grade product) ea 0.0175  No Bid 0.0838 0.0900

No Award for this item 

260 Foil Steam Table Pan Disposable, Full pan (med), 12" x 20" x 2¼" ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.5792 0.8300

270 Plastic storage bags, Ziploc or equal, Gallon size, zip closure ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

270.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Ziploc PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0334 0.0450

280 Plastic storage bags, Ziploc or equal, Quart size, zip closure ea   No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid

280.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Ziploc PRODUCT ea   No Bid   No Bid 0.0152 0.0250

Low Bid 

Awarded 


