
3-Year Contract to Provide Personal Cleansing Wipes.2; Spec #28-06/20

No. Description Type UOM Quantity
Medline 

Industries, Inc.
Medline Total 

DELCREST 
MEDICAL 
SERVICES

DELCREST Total
Manheim 

Medical Supply 
Inc.

Manheim Total

McKesson 
Medical-Surgical 

Minnesota 
Supply Inc.

McKesson Total Maven Medical Maven Total

1

Personal Wipe Prevail Soft Pack Aloe Mfg# WW-
710, 48 wipes/pack, 12 packs/case (Enter the cost 
for 1 wipe) Base each 3,873,600.00 No bid No Bid No bid No Bid $0.0349 $135,188.64 $0.0364 $140,999.04 $0.0357 $138,287.52 

1.1

Alternate to Prevail Soft Pack Aloe Wipe that 
meets specifications (Enter cost for 1 wipe) (The 
manufacturer, item #, packaging and case count 
must be noted in the "Comment" area Option each 3,873,600.00 $0.0230 $89,092.80 $0.0248 $96,065.28 $0.0267 $103,425.12 $0.0300 $116,208.0000 $0.0357 $138,287.52 

Low Bid 
Awarded 
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