2-Year Contract to Provide Liquid Nutritional Supplements.2

Spec # 28-06/18

Item |Description Total Oz American Health Care Benjamin Foods Concordance Healthcare | Good Source Solutions Inc
1| Abbott Labs Ensure Clear 125337.6 $0.1598 | $20,028.95 No Bid $0.1480 | $18,549.96 No Bid
1.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL No Bid No Bid $0.1480 | $18,549.96 $0.1600 | $20,054.02
2|Abbott Labs Glucerna 110592 S0.1692 | $18,712.17 No Bid $0.3010 | $33,288.19 $0.3200 | $35,389.44
2.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL No Bid No Bid $0.3010 | $33,288.19 No Bid
3|Hormel Thick Easy 230400 No Bid $0.0914 $21,058.56 No Bid $0.1300 | $29,952.00
3.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL No Bid No Bid $0.1420 | $32,716.80 No Bid
4[Hormel Thick Easy Honey 576000 No Bid $0.1539 $88,646.40 No Bid S0.1400 | $80,640.00
4.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL No Bid No Bid $0.1420 | $81,792.00 No Bid
5| Medtrition ProSource NoCarb 23040 S0.7416 | $17,086.46 No Bid S0.7740 | $17,832.96 No Bid
5.1|ALTERNATE or EQUAL No Bid $0.6296 $14,505.98 No Bid $0.8900 | $20,505.60

Low Bid
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