
3-Year Contract to Provide Poly Bags & Can Liners; Spec #26-05/20

item Description UOM Quantity
Unipak 
Corp.

1
Rolled 23” x 10” x 39” black plastic trash liners, 2 
mil, case net weight 17.2 lbs, 100/cs. each 61500 $0 0.1114 6,851.10 0.1120 0.01 0.1624 9987.60

1.1
Folded 23” x 10” x 39” Black plastic trash liner, 2 
mil, case net weight 17.2 lbs, 100/cs. each 61500 $0 0.1114 6,851.10 0.1120 6888.00 0.1624 9987.60

2

Rolled 24” x 24” Clear plastic liner, 6 micron, star 
seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net weight 9 lbs, 
1000/cs, SSS Brand each 1203000 $0 0.0092 11,067.60 No Bid 0.0091 10947.30

2.1

Folded 24” x 24” Clear plastic liner, 6 micron, star 
seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net weight 9 lbs, 
1000/cs, SSS Brand each 1203000 $0 No Bid No Bid 0.0091 10947.30

2.2

Alternate Rolled 24” x 24” Clear plastic liner, 6 
micron, star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net 
weight 9 lbs, 1000/cs, that meets specifications each 1203000 $0 No Bid 0.0090 10827.00 0.0091 10947.30

2.3

Alternate Folded 24” x 24” Clear plastic liner, 6 
micron, star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net 
weight 9 lbs, 1000/cs, that meets specifications each 1203000 $0 No Bid 0.0090 10827.00 0.0091 10947.30

3

Rolled 24" x 33" Clear trash bag, 13 gallon, star 
seal, 8 micron, High Density Poly, case net weight 
12.5 lbs, 1000/cs each 18000 $0 0.0129 232.20 0.0113 203.40 0.0125 225.00

3.1

Folded 24" x 33" Clear trash bag, 13 gallon, star 
seal, 8 micron, High Density Poly, case net weight 
12.5 lbs, 1000/cs each 18000 $0 No Bid 0.0113 203.40 0.0125 225.00

4

Rolled 30" x 43" BLUE plastic liner with black 
printed letters "Soiled Linen", 14 micron, star 
seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net weight 12.2 
lbs, 250/cs, SSS Brand each 365000 $0 0.0489 17,848.50 No Bid 0.0534 19491.00

4.1

Folded 30" x 43" BLUE plastic liner with black 
printed letters "Soiled Linen", 14 micron, star 
seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net weight 12.2 
lbs, 250/cs, SSS Brand each 365000 $0 No Bid No Bid 0.0534 19491.00

4.2

Alternate Rolled 30" x 43" BLUE plastic liner with 
black printed letters "Soiled Linen", 14 micron, 
star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net weight 
12.2 lbs, 250/cs that meet specifications each 365000 $0 No Bid No Bid 0.0534 19491.00

Calico Packaging, 
LLC

CENTRAL POLY-
BAG CORP.

Enviro 
International LLC



4.3

Alternate Folded 30" x 43" BLUE plastic liner with 
black printed letters "Soiled Linen", 14 micron, 
star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case net weight 
12.2 lbs, 250/cs that meet specifications each 365000 $0 No Bid No Bid 0.0534 19491.00

5

Rolled 33" x 40" Clear plastic Cart collection bag, 
16 micron, star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case 
net weight 14 lbs, 250/cs, SSS Brand each 328750 $0 0.0449 14,760.88 No Bid 0.0525 17259.38

5.1

Folded 33" x 40" Clear plastic Cart collection bag, 
16 micron, star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case 
net weight 14 lbs, 250/cs, SSS Brand each 328750 $0 No Bid No Bid 0.0525 17259.38

5.2

Alternate Rolled 33" x 40" Clear plastic Cart 
collection bag, 16 micron, star seal, film type 
HMW-HPDE, case net weight 14 lbs, 250/cs that 
meets specifications each 328750 $0 No Bid 0.0436 14333.50 0.0525 17259.38

5.3

Alternate Folded 33" x 40" Clear plastic Cart 
collection bag, 16 micron, star seal, film type 
HMW-HPDE, case net weight 14 lbs, 250/cs that 
meets specifications each 328750 $0 No Bid 0.0436 14333.50 0.0525 17259.38

6

Rolled 33" x 40" Clear trash bag, 33 gallon, star 
seal, 14 micron, High Density pole, case net 
weight 24.9 lbs, 500/cs each 570000 $0 0.0448 25,536.00 0.0356 20292.00 0.0469 26733.00

7

Rolled 36” x 60” Clear can liner, 55 gallon, 17 
microns, case net weight 15.8 lbs, 200/cs, Hillyard 
PTTMR-36603-MC each 170000 $0 0.0847 14,399.00 No Bid 0.0746 12682.00

7.1

Alternate Rolled 36” x 60” Clear can liner, 55 
gallon, 17 microns, case net weight 15.8 lbs, 
200/cs that meets specifications each 170000 $0 No Bid 0.0720 12240.00 0.0746 12682.00

8

Rolled 37" x 46" Clear plastic liner, 14 micron, tie-
tie design, star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case 
net weight 15.4 lbs, 250/cs, SSS Brand each 3000 $0 0.0623 186.90 No Bid 0.0605 181.50

8.1

Folded 37" x 46" Clear plastic liner, 14 micron, tie-
tie design, star seal, film type HMW-HPDE, case 
net weight 15.4 lbs, 250/cs, SSS Brand each 3000 $0 No Bid No Bid 0.0605 181.50

8.2

Alternate Rolled 37" x 46" Clear plastic liner, 14 
micron, tie-tie design, star seal, film type HMW-
HPDE, case net weight 15.4 lbs, 250/cs that meets 
specifications each 3000 $0 No Bid 0.0516 154.80 0.0605 181.50



8.3

Alternate Folded 37" x 46" Clear plastic liner, 14 
micron, tie-tie design, star seal, film type HMW-
HPDE, case net weight 15.4 lbs, 250/cs that meets 
specifications each 3000 $0 No Bid 0.0516 154.80 0.0605 181.50

9
Rolled 38” x 58” Black liner, 1.5 mil, case net 
weight 19.1 lbs, 100/cs each 600 $0 0.1554 93.24 0.1320 79.20 0.1854 111.24

9.1
Folded 38” x 58” Black liner, 1.5 mil, case net 
weight 19.1 lbs, 100/cs each 600 $0 0.1554 93.24 0.1320 79.20 0.1854 111.24

10

Rolled 40” x 48” Natural or Clear color can liner, 
45 Gallon, 16 microns, case net weight 17.4 lbs, 
250/cs, Hillyard PITMR-40483 each 25250 $0 0.0673 1,699.33 No Bid 0.0663 1674.08

10.1

Folded 40” x 48” Natural or Clear color can liner, 
45 Gallon, 16 microns, case net weight 17.4 lbs, 
250/cs, Hillyard PITMR-40483 each 25250 $0 No Bid No Bid 0.0663 1674.08

10.2

Alternate Rolled 40” x 48” Natural or Clear color 
can liner, 45 Gallon, 16 microns, case net weight 
17.4 lbs, 250/cs that meets specifications each 25250 $0 No Bid 0.0608 1535.20 0.0663 1674.08

10.3

Alternate Folded 40” x 48” Natural or Clear color 
can liner, 45 Gallon, 16 microns, case net weight 
17.4 lbs, 250/cs that meets specifications each 25250 $0 No Bid 0.0608 1535.20 0.0663 1674.08

11

Rolled 43" x 48" Clear trash bag, 56 gallon, star 
seal, 16 micron, High Density poly, case net 
weight 17.6 lbs, 200/cs each 7200 $0 0.0822 591.84 0.0680 489.60 0.0816 587.52

11.1

Folded 43" x 48" Clear trash bag, 56 gallon, star 
seal, 16 micron, High Density poly, case net 
weight 17.6 lbs, 200/cs each 7200 $0 No Bid 0.0680 489.60 0.0816 587.52

12

Rolled 44" x 48" Clear trash bag, 56 gallon, flat 
bottom, 2.0 Mill, Low density poly, case net 
weight 28.1 lbs, 100/cs each 15300 $0 No Bid 0.1870 2861.10 0.2554 3907.62

12.1

Folded 44" x 48" Clear trash bag, 56 gallon, flat 
bottom, 2.0 Mill, Low density poly, case net 
weight 28.1 lbs, 100/cs each 15300 $0 0.2314 3,540.42 0.1870 2861.10 0.2554 3907.62

13

Rolled 46" x 42" Clear plastic shredder bag, 75 
microns, case net weight 16.1lbs, 50/roll, 53” 
depth each 10750 $0 0.3248 3,491.60 0.2840 3053.00 0.3047 3275.53

13.1

Folded 46" x 42" Clear plastic shredder bag, 75 
microns, case net weight 16.1lbs, 50/roll, 53” 
depth each 10750 $0 No Bid 0.2840 3053.00 0.3047 3275.53

Totals 24,699.60 66068.80
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