
3-YEAR CONTRACT TO PROVIDE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
Spec #24-05/13
Purchasing

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid opening

Aoss Medical Calico

Healthcare 
Equip Med 

Part Hillyard
Interboro 

Packaging
Interline 
Amsan Pyramid

State 
Industrial

A1 Bleach, 96 oz, 6/cs NO BID $11.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.15 NO BID NO BID

OUNCES PER CS
768

6, 128 oz/cs 576
COST PER OZ/CS $0.0150 $0.0228

A2
Stain Remover, 32 oz trigger 
spray bottle, 12/cs NO BID $38.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.20 NO BID NO BID

OUNCES PER CS
240

12, 20 oz/cs 384
COST PER OZ/CS $0.1589 $0.1646

A3 Carpet Cleaner, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.72 NO BID $33.81 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:128 1:64
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.12 $0.13

Dispensing System 
NO 

CHARGE
NO 

CHARGE
NO 

CHARGE
NO 

CHARGE
NO 

CHARGE
NO 

CHARGE
NO 

CHARGE
NO 

CHARGE
hydrogen peroxide cleaner, 1 
gal, 4/cs (120 cs) NO BID NO BID NO BID $126.24 NO BID $143.07 NO BID NO BID

DILUTION RATE 1:128 1:256
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.24 $0.28

A4



soft acidic non-alkaline 
disinfectant, 64 oz btl, 4/cs 
(35 cs) NO BID NO BID NO BID $148.48 NO BID $82.18 NO BID NO BID

DILUTION RATE 1:128 1:256
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.28 $0.16

A5
Neutral Cleaner, 32 oz 
canteen, 6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $163.24 NO BID $69.05 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:256 1:1024
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.15 $0.04

A6
Cleaner/Enhancer floor 
cleaner, 32 oz, 6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $115.52 NO BID $95.94 NO BID NO BID

DILUTION RATE 1:32 1:512
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.87 $0.12

A7

Floor Conditioner & 
Neutralizer, 90 pouches/cntr, 
2 cntr/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.36 NO BID $63.98 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:384 1:128
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.08 $0.12

A8 Spotlight, 2.5 gal, 2/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $81.96 NO BID $66.87 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE RTU RTU
COST PER DILUTED GAL $16.39 $13.37

A9
Hard Floor Sealer, 2.5 gal, 
2/cs NO BID

$55.94
1, 5 gal/cs NO BID $82.04 NO BID $64.82 NO BID NO BID

DILUTION RATE RTU RTU RTU
COST PER DILUTED GAL $11.19 $16.40 $12.96

A10 Stripper, 2.5 gal, 2/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.24 NO BID $106.38 NO BID NO BID



A11

Fabric Refresher/ Odor 
Eliminator, 33.81 oz trigger 
spray; 6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $66.08 NO BID NO BID

A12

Disinfectant, Kaivac Inc. 
KaiBosh, 1 gal, 4/cs
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $80.12 NO BID NO BID

A13

KaiO Multipurpose Cleaner, 
Kaivac Inc; Citrus, 1 gal, 4/cs   
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $73.77 NO BID NO BID

A14

KaiBlooey Restroom Cleaner, 
Kaivac Inc, 1 gal, 4/cs
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $72.83 NO BID NO BID

A15
Foam Hand & Body Soap, 
33.8 oz cartridge, 8/cs NO BID NO BID $24.30 $41.16 NO BID $51.80 NO BID NO BID

OUNCES PER CS
202.8

6, 1L/cs

169.072
4, 1250 
ml/cs 270.4

COST PER OZ/CS $0.1198 $0.2435 $0.1916

A16
Stainless Steel Cleaner and 
Polish, 21 oz can, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $53.76 $23.19 NO BID

OUNCES PER CS 252
240

20 oz can
COST PER OZ/CS $0.2133 $0.0960

A17
Bowl Cleaner, 2 oz; 12/cs
Must be thickened liquid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.80 NO BID NO BID



A18
Antibacterial Cleaning Power 
32 oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.71 NO BID NO BID

A19
16” Gray Microfiber pad , 
12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $116.88 $80.28 NO BID

A20 20” Folding Mop Holder, 10/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $576.40
$69.48
12/cs NO BID

A21
16”Scrub Mop, 25/case
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $374.75 $59.75 NO BID

A22 20” Scrub Mop, 25/case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $447.56 NO BID NO BID

A23 Telescoping Handle 38”-72” NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.92 NO BID NO BID

A24 Finish Mops, 25/case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $410.60 NO BID NO BID

A25 32” Dust Mop Holder NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.01 NO BID NO BID

A26 String Mop NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.04 NO BID $3.99 NO BID NO BID

A27
34” Replacement Micro Fiber 
Dust Mop, 14/case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $500.50 NO BID NO BID

A28 Dust Mop, 10/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $445.00 NO BID NO BID

A29
Lambswool Telescoping 
Duster, 35” extends to 48” NO BID $5.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.66 $4.38 NO BID

A30 Broom Handle, 12/cs NO BID $28.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.64 $26.52 NO BID

A31 Lobby Dust Pan Broom NO BID $2.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.08 $2.79 NO BID



A32 Grout Brush NO BID $0.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.29 $1.89 NO BID

A33 Toilet Bowl Brush NO BID $0.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.15 $0.97 NO BID

A34 Dual Surface Scrub Brush NO BID $5.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.23 $9.98 NO BID

A35 Wet Mop Handle NO BID $7.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.88 $59.76 NO BID

COST PER EA $7.14
4.823
12/cs

4.98
12/cs

A36
Floor Burnishing Pad, 20”; 
5/bx NO BID $14.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.29 $11.29 NO BID

A37
Floor Scrubbing Pad, 20”; 
5/bx NO BID $15.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.29 $11.28 NO BID

A38 Floor Stripping Pad, 20”, 5/bx NO BID $15.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.29 $11.28 NO BID

A39
Floor Stripping Pad, 6.5”, 
20/cs NO BID $15.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.80 NO BID NO BID

COST PER EA/CS
3.036
5/cs $1.940

A40 Bucket, 10 qt; NO BID $3.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.38 $2.49 NO BID

A41 Cube Truck NO BID $417.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $440.51 NO BID NO BID

A42 Lobby Dust Pan NO BID $5.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.15 $5.89 NO BID

A43 Floor Sign, 6/cs NO BID $123.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID $154.88 NO BID NO BID

A44
Hand Soap 4 oz. bar, 48 
bars/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $52.28 $48.99 NO BID



A45
Vinyl (Latex Free) Exam 
Gloves, size: Large, 100/bx $3.20 $3.64 NO BID NO BID $2.48 $4.25 $3.09 NO BID

A46 Putty Knife NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.97 NO BID NO BID

A47 Sanitary Pads, 250/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.83 $29.85 NO BID

A48 Scrubbing Sponge, 20/cs NO BID $12.64 NO BID NO BID $15.98 $10.93 NO BID

Spray Bottle, 32 oz capacity NO BID $0.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.63 $0.41 NO BID
Trigger Sprayer, for 32 oz 
spray btl (could be ordered 
separately) NO BID $0.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.59 $0.40 NO BID

A50 Squeegee, 8” head NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.97 NO BID NO BID

A51 Tampons, 500/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.53 $57.98 NO BID

A52 Treated Dust Cloths NO BID $225.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.46 $68.25 NO BID

COST PER EA/CS
0.5636
400/cs $0.1009 $0.1365

A53
Flat Urinal Screen, 12/bx,6 
bx/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.14 $52.14 NO BID

A54
Vacuum Filter for Proteam DT 
100 Tailvac NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.38 NO BID NO BID

A55
Vacuum Filter for Proteam 
DT100 Tailvac, 10/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.09 NO BID NO BID

A56 Vacuum Cleaner Bag, 10/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.00 NO BID NO BID

A49



A57
Disposable Bags for Tidy Vac 
Canister Vacuum, 10/pk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.54 NO BID NO BID

A58
Magnetic Strip for commercial 
vacuum cleaner NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.32 NO BID NO BID

A59
Vacuum Belts for Tornado CV-
30 NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.28 NO BID NO BID

A60
Disposable bags for Tornado 
CV-30  NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.20 NO BID NO BID

A61

Motor intake filter for Tornado 
CV-30 12” vacuum cleaner 
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.14 NO BID NO BID

A62

Replacement roller bar for 
Tornado CV-30 12” vacuum 
cleaner  NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.25 NO BID NO BID

A63

Filter Frame #K5731640 for 
Tornado CV 30 12” vacuum 
cleaner NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.73 NO BID NO BID

A64

Foam Filters #K64147650 for 
Tornado CV 30 12”, NO 
SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.05 NO BID NO BID

A65
Push Button Locking Single 
Roll toilet Tissue holder NO BID

$10.18
20/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.69

$9.98
12/cs NO BID



A66
Wall Mount Feminine Product 
Receptacle NO BID $17.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.38 $19.25 NO BID

A67 Waxed Paper Liners,  500/cs NO BID $15.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.99 $12.59 NO BID

B1
Spray & Wipe Cleaner, 1.5 oz 
packets, 72/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

B2
Furniture Polish. 18 oz. 
aerosol cans; 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $41.89 $27.05 NO BID

Master Center Dispensing 
System 

NO 
CHARGE

NO 
CHARGE

NO 
CHARGE

NO 
CHARGE

NO 
CHARGE

NO 
CHARGE

NO 
CHARGE

NO 
CHARGE

hydrogen peroxide all facility 
cleaner, 1 gal; 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $126.24 NO BID $143.07 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:128 1:3256
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.24
soft acidic non-alkaline 
disinfectant, 64 oz btl, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $146.48 NO BID $82.18 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:128 1:256
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.28 $0.16

B4
Disinfectant Tablet, 270 
tablets/tub, 2/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $266.00 NO BID NO BID

B5 Floor Cleaner, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID

B6
Carpet Cleaner, 1 gal, 4/cs
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.72 NO BID $33.81 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:128 1:64
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.12 $0.13

B3



B7

Coffee and red stain spotter, 
12 oz, 12/cs
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.64 NO BID $181.50 NO BID NO BID

B8
Stain and Odor Remover, 12 
oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $199.83 NO BID NO BID

B9
Crystal Dry Extra, 12 oz btl, 
24/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $234.67 NO BID NO BID

B10
trigger spotter, 22 fl oz, 6/cs
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.64 NO BID $107.25 NO BID NO BID

B11
Stainless Steel Cleaner, 1 qt, 
6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.88 NO BID NO BID

B12 Floor Cleaner, 32 oz, 6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $163.24 NO BID $69.05 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:256 1:1024
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.15 $0.04

B13
Bowl Cleaner, 32 oz, 12/cs 
Must be thickened liquid NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.44 NO BID $46.80 NO BID NO BID

B14

Floor Conditioner & 
Neutralizer, 90 pouches/cntr, 
2 cntr/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.36 NO BID $63.98 NO BID NO BID
DILUTION RATE 1:384 1:128
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.08 $0.12

B15
Renown Stain & Mark Eraser, 
30/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $54.43 NO BID NO BID

B16
Kaivac Kaipowie De-Greaser, 
1 gal; 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $86.82 NO BID NO BID



B17 Floor Finish, 5 Gal NO BID $57.54 NO BID $81.96 NO BID $76.00 NO BID NO BID

B18 Stripper, 5 Gal NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.24 NO BID $106.38 NO BID NO BID

B19 Laundry Detergent Powder NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $92.12 NO BID NO BID

B20
Liquid Fabric Softener, 103 
oz bottle NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.54 NO BID NO BID

B21
Hospital Cleaner Disinfectant 
Towels, 50/bx, 6 bx/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $230.15 NO BID NO BID

B22

Clorox Bleach, 32 oz spray 
bottles, 6/cs
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $83.65 NO BID NO BID

B23
Clorox Bleach, 128 oz btl, 
4/cs NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $89.00 NO BID NO BID

B24 SOS pads NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.92 $1.99 NO BID

Renown Comfresh Refill, 6/cs 
(12 cs) NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.44 NO BID $62.09 NO BID NO BID
Air Freshener dispenser (3 
dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID $53.64 NO BID $11.29 NO BID

B26
Flat Urinal Screen, 12/bx, 6 
bx/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.14 $52.14 NO BID

B27
Foaming hand & body 
shampoo, 1liter, 8/cs NO BID NO BID

$24.30              
1L,6/cs

$41.16                  
4/1250 ml/cs NO BID $51.80 NO BID NO BID

ML PER CS 6000 5000 8000

B25



COST PER ML/CS $0.0041 $0.0082 $0.0064

B28
Foaming anti-bacterial hand 
soap, 1liter, 8/1liter/cs NO BID NO BID

$24.30                
1l/6 l/cs

$44.09          
4/1250 ml/cs NO BID $56.71 NO BID NO BID

ML PER CS 6000 5000 8000
COST PER ML/CS $0.0045 $0.0088 $0.0070

B29 hand sanitizer, 1liter, 6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID
$38.21        

4/1250 ml/cs NO BID $53.66 NO BID NO BID
ML PER CS 5000 8000

COST PER ML/CS $0.0076 $0.0067

B30
Filmop Single Hooks
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.88 NO BID NO BID

B31
Filmop Double Hooks
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $83.88 NO BID NO BID

B32
Filmop 16-18’” microfiber 
mops NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $116.88 NO BID NO BID

B33 Radiator Brush NO BID $3.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.98 NO BID

B34 Toilet Bowl Mop NO BID $0.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.68 $0.46 NO BID

B35 Toilet Bowl Brush NO BID $1.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.40 $0.98 NO BID

B36 Counter Brush NO BID $2.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.51 $1.98 NO BID

B37 Grout Brush NO BID $1.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.29 NO BID NO BID

B38 Utility Brush NO BID $1.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.54 $1.97 NO BID



B39
Filmop Velcro Strip
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $156.40 NO BID NO BID

B40
Filmop Clips 
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $71.76 NO BID NO BID

B41
Swifter Duster w/ Extended 
Handle, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.94 $96.15 NO BID

B42
Swifter Duster Refill, 10/bx, 
6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.44 $43.95 NO BID

Spray Bottle, 32 oz capacity NO BID $0.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.63 $0.41 NO BID
Trigger Sprayer, fits 32 oz 
spray btl (could be ordered 
separately) NO BID $0.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.59 $0.41 NO BID

Spray Bottle, 24 oz capacity NO BID $0.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.58 $0.40 NO BID
Trigger Sprayer fits 24 oz 
spray bottle (could be ordered 
separately) NO BID $0.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.83 $0.40 NO BID

B45 Scrubbing Sponge, 20/cs NO BID $14.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.98 $11.18 NO BID

B46 Dust Panel Filter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.15 NO BID NO BID

B47
micro lined environmental 
filter 10/pk, 10 pk/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $84.40 NO BID NO BID

B48
Wastebasket
No Award NO BID $40.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.56 $26.98 NO BID

B49
Floor Burnishing Pad; 20” 
beige, 5/bx NO BID $13.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.29 $11.29 NO BID

B43

B44



B50
Floor Scrubbing Pad, 17” 
blue, 5/bx NO BID $10.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.79 $8.89 NO BID

B51
Scrubbing Pad, 5/bag, 4 
bags/bx NO BID $13.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.84 $10.98 NO BID

C1 Bleach, 1 gal btl; 4/cs NO BID $11.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.72 NO BID NO BID
GAL PER CS 6 4

COST PER GAL/CS $1.9230 $2.4300

C2
Carpet Extraction Cleaner, 64 
oz btl, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $37.39 NO BID $75.60

DILUTION RATE 1:64 1:32
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.29 $0.59

C3
Concrete Floor Coating, 5-gal 
pail NO BID $57.54 NO BID $81.96 NO BID $76.00 NO BID $91.00

C4

Disinfectant, 64 oz btl, 4/cs 
Must provide, install and 
maintain dispensing system 
for product at no charge for 
duration of contract NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $94.58 NO BID $51.20

DILUTION RATE 1:256 1:64
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.18 $0.20

C5
Foaming Restroom Cleaner, 
64 oz btl, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.84 NO BID $55.34

DILUTION RATE 1:64 1:16
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.56 $0.86

C6
Cleaner, Multi Purpose, 64 oz 
btl, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $47.50 NO BID $51.20



DILUTION RATE 1:64
COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.35 $0.20

C7 Floor Stripper, 5-gal pail NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.24 NO BID $63.84 NO BID $65.00
DILUTION RATE 1:20 1:5

COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.59 $2.55

C8 Glass Cleaner, 64 oz btl, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $52.37 NO BID $51.20
DILUTION RATE 1:64

COST PER DILUTED GAL $0.39 $2.60

C9
Hand, Hair and Body Wash, 
4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $97.00 NO BID NO BID

C10
Foaming Instant Skin 
Sanitizer, 33.8 oz. btl, 8/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID

$38.21       
4/1.250 
ml/cs NO BID $74.85 NO BID NO BID

OUNCES PER CS 169.072 270.4
COST PER OZ/CS $0.2260 $0.2768

C11
Broom Handle with flex tip, 
12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $115.94 NO BID NO BID

C12 Counter Brush, 12/cs NO BID $27.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.12 $23.76 NO BID

C13 Scrub Brush NO BID $16.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.23 $6.89 NO BID

C14 Scrub Brush, 6" length; 12/cs NO BID $16.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.88 $11.76 NO BID

C15 Sweep Broom 24” NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.75 $6.89 NO BID

C16 Toilet Bowl Brush, 24/cs NO BID $29.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.15 $23.52 NO BID



C17
Clamp Style Handle Gripper, 
60” NO BID $7.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.25 $4.99 NO BID

C18
Mop Head, 12/cs Must be 
launderable NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $124.92 $50.28 NO BID

C19
Microfiber Pad Dust Mop, 
must be launderable; 12/cs NO BID $99.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $71.40 $82.68 NO BID

C20
Clamp-On Dust Mop Handles, 
12/cs NO BID $58.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID $167.88 $56.28 NO BID

C21 Clamp-On Dust Mop Frame NO BID $2.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.82 $2.29 NO BID

C22
Super Polishing Pad, 20”, 
5/cs NO BID $13.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.29 $11.29 NO BID

C23
Buffing, Scrubbing or 
Polishing Pad, red, 20”, 5/ cs NO BID $14.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.29 $11.29 NO BID

C24
Stripping Pad, Black; 20”, 
5/cs NO BID $14.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.29 $11.29 NO BID

C25
Multipurpose Wipers, 6/bx, 
150 bx/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID

$38.70                
9.75" x16"   
4bx/175/cs NO BID $44.48 $40.98 NO BID

WIPERS PER CS 700 900
COST PER WIPER/CS $0.0553 $0.0455

C26
Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 
12x12, 240/cs NO BID $101.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $141.60 $151.20 NO BID



C27
Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 
16x16, 180/cs NO BID $123.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $130.00 $124.20 NO BID

C28
Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 
16x27, 120/cs NO BID $146.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $150.00 NO BID NO BID

C29
Wax Bag for Sanitary Napkin 
Disposal, 500/cs NO BID $15.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.15

$12.89           
7.5" x 11" NO BID

C30 Scrubbing Sponge, 20/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.26 $11.18 NO BID

Plastic Spray Bottle; 32oz NO BID $0.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.59 $0.41 NO BID
Trigger Sprayer, for 32 oz 
spray bottle NO BID $0.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.55 $0.41 NO BID

C32 Bowl Clip, 12/bx, 72/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $127.47 $80.98 NO BID

C33
Ultra Fragrance Urinal 
Screen, 10/bx, 60/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $111.14 $78.98 NO BID

C34 Sanitary Napkins #8, 250/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.65 $32.89 NO BID

C35 Tampons, 500/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.53 $58.99 NO BID

Filters:
C36 14x22x1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.06 NO BID NO BID

C37 16x25x1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.84 NO BID NO BID

C38 24x24x1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.53 NO BID NO BID

C39 20x25x1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.29 NO BID NO BID

C40 14x25x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.19 NO BID NO BID

C31



C41 25x25x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.32 NO BID NO BID

C42 20x20x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.18 NO BID NO BID

C43 18x25x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.39 NO BID NO BID

C44 16x30x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.44 NO BID NO BID

C45 16x20x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.44 NO BID NO BID

C46 14x25x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.19 NO BID NO BID

C47 15x20x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.91 NO BID NO BID

C48 20x25x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.64 NO BID NO BID

C49 16x24x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.06 NO BID NO BID

C50 24¾ x27¾ x1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.00 NO BID NO BID

C51 16x25x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.14 NO BID NO BID

C52 18x24x2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.21 NO BID NO BID

D1
Wypall - All Purpose Wipes, 
12-1/2" x 13", 1008 sheets/cs $58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $101.06 $57.79 NO BID

D2
Neutralizer/Conditioner, 0.5 
oz pk, 180/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.98 $49.98 NO BID

D3
Solar Salt, 50 lb bags
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.94 NO BID NO BID



D4
Cleaner Spray Disinfectant, 
19 oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.30 $69.98 NO BID

D5 Sparclean, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.34 NO BID NO BID

D6
Mr Muscle Oven/Grill Cleaner, 
19 oz aerosol, 6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $37.89 $31.95 NO BID

D7
Sparclean Warewash Hi 
Temp Rinse Aid, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.86 NO BID NO BID

D8
Clothesline Fresh Colorsafe 
Bleach 5, 1 gal, 4 gal/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.29 NO BID NO BID

D9
Clothesline Fresh Chlorine 
Bleach 4, 5 gal pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.60 NO BID NO BID

D10
Clothesline Fresh BLD 
Detergent, 5 gal pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $83.05 NO BID NO BID

D11
Clothesline Fresh Laundry 
Detergent, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.70 NO BID NO BID

D12
Clothesline Fresh 
Sour/Softener, 5 gal pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.83 NO BID NO BID

D13 All Temp Detergent, 4/1gl NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.80 NO BID NO BID

D14

Saniwipe Surface Sanitizing 
Wiper, 100 wipes/cntr 6 
cntr/cs $43.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $62.15 $38.99 NO BID



D15
Clean on the Go Clean, 4/cs 
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $67.29 NO BID NO BID

D16
Penetrol Dish Deterg, 1 gal, 
4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.74 NO BID NO BID

D17
Sparclean Pot N Pan 
Detergent, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.21 NO BID NO BID

D18

Consume Eco-Lyzer Neutral 
Disinfectant Cleaner, 1 gal, 
4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.75 NO BID NO BID

D19
Hand Soap, Foam Cleanse, 
1000 ml container, 6/cs NO BID NO BID $24.30 NO BID NO BID $76.28 $58.98 NO BID

D20

Soap, Foam Hair & Body 
KCC91553 or equal, Kimcare, 
dispenser #92145, 1000 ml 
container, 6/cs NO BID NO BID $24.30 NO BID NO BID $71.66 $29.94 NO BID

D21
Lite'n Foamy Citrus Fresh, 1 
gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $97.00 NO BID NO BID

D22

Lite'n Foamy Cranberry Ice 
foaming hand, hair & body 
wash, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $97.00 NO BID NO BID

D23
Shineline Multi Surface 
Cleaner, 2lt, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.40 NO BID NO BID

D24
Shineline Emulsifier Plus 
speed stripper,  5 gal pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.14 NO BID NO BID



D25
Elements Synthetic Floor 
Protectant, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $104.84 NO BID NO BID

D26
Elements Gloss Restorer, 1 
gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.54 NO BID NO BID

D27
Elements Scrub & Recoat 
Cleaner, 1gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.25 NO BID NO BID

D28
Grout restorer-stain remover, 
1gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $73.47 NO BID NO BID

D29
Spartan Shineline 
sealer/finish, 1 gal, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.31 NO BID NO BID

D30 Spartan iShine; 5 gal/pl NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $76.00 NO BID NO BID

D31 Glass Cleaner, 2Lt, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.94 NO BID NO BID

D32 Disinfectant, 2lt, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.55 NO BID NO BID

D33
Clean on the Go Clean, 2lt, 
4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $67.29 NO BID NO BID

D34

Labeled refillable plastic 
spray bottles with trigger, “18 
Bio Renewables Glass 
Cleaner #9331”, 32 oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.91 NO BID NO BID

D35

Labeled refillable plastic 
spray bottles with trigger, 
“103 Neutral Disinfectant 
Cleaner #9493”, 32 oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.91 NO BID NO BID



D36

Labeled refillable plastic 
spray bottles with trigger, “15 
Clean by Peroxy #9247”, 32 
oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.91 NO BID NO BID

D37
Renown Stain & Mark Eraser, 
30/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $54.42 NO BID NO BID

D38
Renown Finish Mop, must be 
launderable, 12/cs NO BID $58.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $107.88 NO BID NO BID

D39
Wet mop, must be 
launderable, 12/cs NO BID $47.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID $124.92 $51.48 NO BID

D40
Microfiber dust mop, must be 
launderable, 6/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $134.95 NO BID NO BID

D41

quick connect microfiber 
frames 24 1/8"L x 4 1/2"W - 
1/2"H  must be launderable, 
6/cs NO BID $6.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID $115.75 NO BID NO BID

COST PER EA/CS $6.3400 $19.2917

D42 Toilet Bowl Mop NO BID $2.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.68 $0.54 NO BID

D43 Toilet Bowl Brush NO BID $1.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.40 $0.99 NO BID

D44
Scrubbing Pad, 17" Green, 
5/cs NO BID $10.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.84 $8.99 NO BID

D45 Blue Cleaning Pad, 17", 5/cs NO BID $10.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.84 $8.99 NO BID



D46
Latex Gloves, large, powder 
free, 100/bx, 10 bx/cs $42.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.90 $84.67 $49.90 NO BID

D47

Vinyl (latex free) exam 
gloves, size: Large, powder 
free 100/bx $32.00 $35.94 NO BID NO BID $24.80 $55.20 $31.90 NO BID

D48

Hot Water Soluble Laundry 
Bag, 100 cs
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

D49
Hookless shower curtain
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

D50
Slip lock laundry nets 
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.79 NO BID

D51

Panty Shields, 22/bx, 36 
bx/cs
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.95 NO BID

D52 Super Tampax, 500/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.98 NO BID

D53 Feminine Napkins, 250/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.15 NO BID

D54 Tampons, 500/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.53 $56.95 NO BID

D55
Floor Mat, 4'x6, color  medium 
brown NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $90.34 $39.95 NO BID

D56

Vacuum Belts for Tornado CV-
30, Belt #K 2884274
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.28 NO BID NO BID



D57

Disposable bags for Tornado 
CV-30, Bag #K6904294
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.20 NO BID NO BID

D58

Motor intake filter for Tornado 
CV-30 12" upright vacuum 
cleaner, #K5731611
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.25 NO BID NO BID

D59

Replacement roller bar for 
Tornado CV-30 12" upright 
vacuum cleaner, #K6906641  
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.50 NO BID NO BID

D60

Hepa Filter #K6414760 for 
Tornado CV30 12" upright 
vacuum cleaner
NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.28 NO BID NO BID

D61 Waxed Paper Liners, 500/cs NO BID $15.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.47 $12.98 NO BID

D62
Sanitary Napkins #8, 250/cs
No Award NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.65 $33.95 NO BID

D63

Disposable MERV-8 SB 
Pleated Filters 25x25x2 
inches NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.32 NO BID NO BID

D64

Disposable MERV-8 SB 
Pleated Filters 20x25x2 
inches NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.64 NO BID NO BID



D65

Disposable MERV-8 SB 
Pleated Filters 16x25x2 
inches NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.14 NO BID NO BID

E1
Cling type bowl cleaner, 24 
oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.80 NO BID NO BID

E2
“Freshmatic” Neutra air or 
citrus refill, 6.17 oz, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.88 NO BID NO BID

E3
Gojo Derma Pro GJ9112 
lotion, 800 ml, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.88 NO BID NO BID

E4
Cone paper cup, 4 oz, 
5000/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $66.00 NO BID NO BID

E5
PCNONSCENTS-B
No Award  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

E6

Misco Products Pearl Drop 
Lotion Hand Soap, 1 Gal 
Bottle, 4/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.15 NO BID NO BID

E7
Gojo Purell Instant Hand 
Sanitizer Bag-in-Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.00 NO BID NO BID
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