
3-YEAR CONTRACT TO PROVIDE BEDDING & LINEN SUPPLIES
Spec #22-05/13
Purchasing

ATD - American 
Company

Bob Barker 
Company Inc Charm-Tex Medline 

Industries Inc
Standard Textile 

Co
Tabb Textile 
Company Inc

1 Wash Cloths, 12” x 12”, 86% 
cotton / 14% poly, color: white, NO BID $3.05 NO BID NO BID $3.48 $3.05

2 Wash Cloths, 12“ x 12”, 86% 
cotton/ 14% poly, color: blue 

(price/dz)
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.76 NO BID

3 Washcloths, 12" x 12", 100% 
cotton (price/dz) NO BID $2.98 NO BID NO BID $3.00 NO BID

4 Terry Towel, 24” x 50” 85% 
cotton/ 15% poly (price/dz) NO BID $25.20 NO BID $27.68 $47.40 $28.50

5 Towels, 25” x 50”, 100% cotton 
terry (price/dz) NO BID $29.40 NO BID NO BID $59.76 $48.75

6 Bath Towels, 27” x 54”, 100% 
cotton (price/dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $83.64 NO BID

7 Bath Blanket, 66” x 90”,  80% 
cotton/20% poly (price/dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $62.88 NO BID

8 Pillows, 21” x 27”, Staph check 
(price/ea) NO BID $4.92 $5.00 NO BID $4.15 NO BID

9 Lightweight Poly Core/Vinyl 
Pillows, 20" x 26", 4/cs (price/cs) NO BID $26.20 $66.90 NO BID $17.00 NO BID

10 Pillow Cases, 20½” x 31 ¾”, 
T180, 50% cotton/50% poly, 

color: bleached white (price/dz)
NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.95 $22.68 $11.75

All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid 
opening



ATD - American 
Company

Bob Barker 
Company Inc Charm-Tex Medline 

Industries Inc
Standard Textile 

Co
Tabb Textile 
Company Inc

11 Standard Pillow Cases, T180, 
55% cotton/45% poly, color: white 

(price/dz)
NO BID $15.25 NO BID NO BID $16.20 NO BID

12 Twin Flat Sheet, 54” x 90”, T180, 
55% cotton/45% poly (price/dz) NO BID $61.92 $38.90 NO BID $57.00 NO BID

13 Flat Sheets, 54” x 90”, T180, 50% 
cotton/50% poly (price/dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.00 $39.00

14 Flat Sheet, 66” x 104”, T-180, 
50% cotton/50% poly (price/dz) NO BID $55.94 $45.90 $50.88 $64.20 $52.50

15 Twin Fitted Sheet, T180, 55% 
cotton/45% poly (price/dz) NO BID $94.75 NO BID NO BID $61.32 NO BID

16 Contour Sheet, 36” x 84” x 9”, 
fitted, 50% cotton/50% poly, 
color: solid colors (price/dz)

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.56 NO BID

17 Percale Contour Sheet, 36” x 84” 
x 9”, T-180, fitted, 50% 

cotton/50% poly. color: white 
(price/dz)

NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.76 $61.32 NO BID

18
Percale Contour Sheet 54” x 80” x 

9”, T-180, fitted 50% cotton/50% 
poly, color: blue (price/dz)

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $106.56 NO BID

19 Muslin Draw Sheet, 54” x 72” 
55% cotton/45% poly blend 

(price/dz)
No Award

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.76 NO BID

20 Thermal Blankets, 66” x 90”, 
color: white (price/dz) $71.28 $83.40 NO BID NO BID $93.00 $73.20

21 Cozy Blanket, 66" x 90", color: 
gray w/ blue striping, 15/cs 

(price/cs)
NO BID $110.75 $68.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID



ATD - American 
Company

Bob Barker 
Company Inc Charm-Tex Medline 

Industries Inc
Standard Textile 

Co
Tabb Textile 
Company Inc

22 Snag Free Thermal Blanket, 74” x 
108”, color: blue (price/dz) NO BID $97.80 NO BID NO BID $214.68 $195.00

23 Blanket Spread, 74” x 108”, 55% 
cotton/45% poly, color:  

wedgewood blue herringbone 
(price/dz)

NO BID $220.25 NO BID NO BID $214.68 NO BID

24
Bedspread, Quilted throw spread, 
66” x 118” (Twin Size), (price/dz)

No Award

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

25
Bedspread, Quilted throw spread, 
90” x 118” (Queen size) (price/dz)

No Award

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

26 Adult clothing protector, 22” x 41”, 
(price/dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.53 $33.12 NO BID

27 Bib Aprons, cotton/poly blend 
(price/dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.92 NO BID

28 Resident gowns, 66” sweep, 47” 
length (price/dz) NO BID NO BID $24.90 $46.80 $53.28 NO BID

29 Surgeon’s Gowns, Extra Large 
(price/dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $238.56 NO BID

30 Incontinent Pad, 36” x 34”, 65% 
poly / 35% rayon 2 dz/cs 

(price/cs)
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $135.84 $110.00

31 Wheelchair pads, 17” x 24” 
(price/dz)
No Award

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.96 NO BID

32 Cart Covers, 24” x 60” x 62” 
(price/dz)
No Award

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



ATD - American 
Company

Bob Barker 
Company Inc Charm-Tex Medline 

Industries Inc
Standard Textile 

Co
Tabb Textile 
Company Inc

33 Shower Curtains, 44” x 77” 
(price/ea) NO BID $15.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

34 Tub Mats, 20" x 30" (price/dz) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.28 NO BID

35 Flame Chek Polyester Core 
Mattresses, 39" x 75" x6" 

(price/ea)
NO BID $51.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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