MEDICAL & SURGICAL SUPPLIES

Spec #21-06/15

Multiple Departments

Revised 8/21/15
I

King of

. . . Delcrest First C'h0|ce Nashyllle Prussia Manheim Maven McKesson Medline Moore Para Pathology | Pro Off'ce & Re'.dy School
Prices Shown are Unit Price . Medical Medical . . . . . L Lab Medical Medical Health
Medical Pharmacy Medical Medical Medical- Industries Medical Scientific - .
Supply Kentron . Solutions Supply Supply | Corporation
Services
Bandages
1 |Elastic Bandages, 6" x 5 yd $0.8000 | $0.4100 | $0.6900 | $0.7667 | $2.0000 | $2.8500 | $2.2980 | $0.6384 | $2.1590 | NOBID | $1.0390 | NOBID | NOBID | $2.5860
2 g,";‘f:;rg'”g Stretch Bandage, | ¢, 1100 | $0.0940  $0.1050 | $0.0971 | $0.9000 | $1.2800 | NOBID | $0.0789 | $0.1250 | $0.1240 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.1638 | $0.1050
3 Z,,O)r(‘f:;rg'”g Stretch Bandage, | o5 1300 | $01190  $0.1250 | $0.1094 | $0.1150 | $1.4600 | NOBID | $0.0966 | $0.1042 | $0.1460 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.3574 | $0.1442
4 |Elasticated Tubular Bandage
Size C| $57.9000 | $24.8500 | NOBID | NOBID | $30.1000 | NOBID | NOBID | $20.1700 | $27.7900 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $27.4200
Size D| $56.4800 | $28.9800 | NOBID | NOBID | $33.9000 | NOBID | NOBID | $21.2400 | $31.6700 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $32.4700
Size E| $72.6500 | $32.2900 | NOBID | NOBID | $37.8500 | NOBID | NOBID | $25.6500 | $35.8700 | NOBID | NOBID | $37.8000 | NOBID | $36.4500
Size F| $68.8500 | $34.9600 | NOBID | NOBID | $40.9000 | NOBID | NOBID | $28.0400 | $39.2600 | NOBID | NOBID | $43.2000 | NOBID | $39.3900
Size G| $90.8200 | $41.3300 | NOBID | NOBID | $49.4500 | NOBID | NOBID | $31.7600 | $46.9300 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $46.8400
Total| $346.7000 | $162.4100 $192.2000 $126.8600 | $181.5200 $182.5700
5 |Bandaids- latex free $0.0140 | $0.0120 | $0.0129 | $0.0143 | $0.0130 | $2.0200 | NOBID | $0.0119 | $0.0167 | NOBID | $0.0228 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0231
6 |Bandages, 1" x 3" plastic NOBID | $0.0120 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0225 | $0.0145 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0101 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0231
7 |Bandages
3" x5vyd NOBID | $0.3400 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $04350 | NOBID | $0.7900 | $05360 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $1.0300
4" x5yd NOBID | $0.4300 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.5650 | NOBID | $0.8600 | $0.6290 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $1.1900
Total $0.7700 $1.0000 $1.6500 | $1.1650 $2.2200
8 fi‘"’t‘)':idcages’ 1"x3", flexible $0.0170 | $0.0580 | NOBID | $0.0370 | $0.0270 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0245 | $0.0213 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0298
g |Bandages, assort. sizes w/ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
cartoon character
No Bids
10 5:;‘;?;5: 3/a"x 3wl NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.0289 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0475
11 |Bandages; assort. sizes w/ NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1140 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1168
cartoon character
1o |Bandages: assort. sizes w/ NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1425 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1095
cartoon character
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13 |Bandages: assort. sizes w/ NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1425 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1070 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
cartoon character

14 Sﬁ:rii?;s: 3/4"x 3" wi NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.0376 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

15 Sﬁ:rii?gf: 34" x 3wl $0.0670 | NOBID NOBID | $0.0385 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.0220 | NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

16 |Bandages: assort. sizes w/ $0.1060 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.1425 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.1070 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.1505
cartoon character

17 |Gauze $0.00420 | $0.00200 | NOBID | $0.00330 | $0.00330 | $0.00395 | NOBID | $0.00410 | $0.00480 | $0.00860 | $0.00600 | NOBID | $0.00390 | $0.00700
Wound Care

18 |Non-Adhering Dressing $0.1700 | $0.6640 | NOBID | $04774 | $0.5800 | $0.8200 | NOBID | $05729 | $1.1838 | NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.6475 NO BID

19 E?g:gﬁ:;m Transparent $1.2400 | $1.2810 = $0.6000  $1.3050 | $0.8000 | $1.1400 | $1.2682 | $0.6460 | $1.2862 | $0.0410 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.9900 | $1.3170

20 |Absorbent Combine Pad $0.0920 | $0.0860 | $0.0890 | $0.1110 | $1.9800 | $0.0940 | NOBID | $0.0656 | $0.0688 | NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1170 | $0.1380

21 |Sterile Gauge Sponge $0.0580 | $0.0210 | NOBID | $0.0265 | $1.2700 | $0.0590 | $0.0624 | $0.0193 | $0.0698 | $0.0660 | $1.3300 | NOBID | $0.0705 | $0.0600

22 |Non-Sterile Gauge Sponges $0.0143 | $0.0090 | $0.0110 | $0.0007 | $0.0100 | $0.0130 | NOBID _ $0.0089  $0.0162 | $0.0137 | $3.4900 | NOBID | $0.0141 | $0.0114

23 |Micropore Tape $0.6000 | $0.6150 | $0.2900 | $0.2868 | $0.4125  $0.2900 | $0.6450 | $0.3283 | $0.6175 | NO BID NO BID NOBID | $05500 | $0.6717

24 |Transpore Tape $1.1300 | $1.1640 | $0.7900 | $1.0365 | $9.3600 | $0.9650 | NOBID | $1.2233 | $1.1783 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.8300 | $1.2708

25 |Wound reinforced skin closure | $1.4000 | $1.4340 | NOBID | $0.6490 | $1.3000 | $0.6470 | $1.5040 | $1.5100 | $1.4402 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $1.0000 NO BID

26 |Super Soft Heel Protectors $44.6800 | $44.6500 | NOBID | $23.9500  $44.3500 $46.9500 | $50.2700 | $1.7400 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fall Prevention

27 |Siderail Pads $33.0000 | $58.3900 | $27.9900 | NOBID | $29.1500 | NOBID | $65.3000 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

28 |Hipsters Standard Brief S $39.3000 | $23.0200 | NOBID | $38.0000 | $23.6500 | NOBID | $29.1600 = $24.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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29 |Hipsters Standard Brief M $39.3000 | $23.0200 NO BID $38.0000 | $23.6500 NO BID $29.7500 | $24.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 |Hipsters Standard Brief L $39.3000 | $23.0200 NO BID $38.0000 | $23.6500 NO BID $29.7500 = $24.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 |Hipsters Standard Brief XL $39.3000 | $23.0200 NO BID $38.0000 | $23.6500 NO BID $29.7500 = $24.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 |Body Wedge NO BID $15.8900 | $15.6900 | $18.4000 NO BID NO BID $15.7300 $5.3800 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 |Bed Positioner $9.7700 $17.4000 $8.9900 NO BID $15.9500 NO BID $18.5300 $4.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 |Bedside Safety Mat $90.8500 | $113.3600 NO BID NO BID $95.4000 NOBID | $119.0000 | $89.3700 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 |Bed Buddy $260.000 | $77.1100 | $179.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 |Bed Rail Wedge $96.9900 | $95.3200 NO BID NO BID $93.4000 NOBID | $110.5300 | $58.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Trach Supplies
37 |Trach Ties-M $1.2500 $1.2430 NO BID NO BID $1.3600 $1.3990 $0.9500 $0.9933 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.0700 NO BID
No Award
38 |Trach Ties— L $1.2500 $1.2430 NO BID NO BID $1.3600 $1.3990 $0.9500 $0.9983 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
No Award
39 |Trach Mask $1.0700 $0.7900 $0.7600 $0.9000 $1.0400 $0.9200 $1.1408 $0.5300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.6000 NO BID
40 |Trach Tee Adapter $0.9900 $1.0190 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.5360 $1.0680 $1.0600 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 |Disposable Inner Cannula
#4DIC or equal $4.8100 $3.4280 $2.4900 $3.5000 $3.1000 $4.7870 $3.6600 $5.2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.0510 NO BID
#6DIC or equal $4.8100 $3.4280 $2.4900 $3.5000 $2.4700 $4.7860 $3.4570 $5.2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.0510 NO BID
#8DIC or equal $4.8100 $3.4280 $2.3900 $3.5000 NO BID $4.7880 $3.6600 $5.2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.0510 NO BID
Awarded Total $7.3700 $10.5000 $10.7770
42 |Drain Sponge NO BID $0.0980 NO BID $0.0558 $0.0090 $0.1140 NO BID $0.0421 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Solutions, Ointments & Gels
43 |Distilled Water $0.9900 NO BID NO BID $1.2500 $0.7200 $1.0400 NO BID $2.8000 $1.2200 $2.2900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
44 |Hydrogen Peroxide Solution $0.4100 $0.0300 NO BID NO BID $0.0400 $0.5900 NO BID $0.0379 $0.4300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.7825
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45 ggﬂg?ﬂcmc’”de Irrigation NOBID | $0.0040 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0049 | $1.0700 | $0.0109 | $0.0114 | $4.0200 & NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.2000 | NOBID
46 |Sterile Water for Irrigation NOBID [ $0.0040 NO BID NOBID | $0.0049 | $1.2500 | $0.0109 | $0.0113 | $4.0200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2000 NO BID
47 |Odor Eliminator $1.1400 [ $0.1220 NOBID | $0.1647 | $0.1625 | $1.3400 NOBID | $0.2274 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2339 NO BID
48 [Incontinent Cleanser $0.7600 | $0.1040 NOBID | $0.0833 | $0.0956 | $0.8000 | $0.1010 | $0.1101 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1196 NO BID
49 [Hand Sanitizer w/ vitamin $0.5500 [ $0.1000 | $0.1625 | $0.1770 | $0.1600 | $0.5600 NOBID | $0.1748 | $1.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.3641
50 |Surgilube lubricating jelly $0.0350 | $0.0150 NO BID NOBID | $0.0140 | $0.0466 NOBID [ $0.0123 | $0.0330 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 |Lubricating Jelly $1.3800 | $0.3520 NOBID | $0.2813 | $0.2700 | $0.8400 NOBID | $0.2792 | $1.0568 [ $0.0310 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 |Antifungal Cream $3.2300 | $2.0300 NO BID NOBID | $1.8500 | $4.4500 | $1.9500 | $1.4229 NOBID [ $0.9990 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 |Viniferamine Cream $3.3000 [ $0.7550 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $5.1700 NOBID | $0.8038 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

No Award
54 |Antibiotic Ointment $0.0670 [ $0.0430 NOBID | $0.0849 NOBID | $0.0980 NOBID | $0.1103 | $0.0804 | $0.1130 NOBID | $0.1170 NO BID $0.1106
55 |Hydrocortisone Cream $0.0940 [ $0.0010 NOBID | $0.8488 | $0.0080 | $0.0745 NOBID | $0.0620 | $0.0439 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1275
56 |Eye Wash NOBID [ $0.4420 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.6618 NO BID NOBID | $1.2600 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 |Hand Instant Sanitizer $0.4100 | $0.4230 NOBID [ $0.1771 | $0.4200 | $0.4350 | $0.3150 | $0.2925 | $1.7000 NOBID | $0.5000 NO BID NO BID $0.6350

Syringes/Lancets

58 [Insulin Safety Syringe $0.2200 | $0.1960 NOBID | $0.2280 | $0.2080 | $0.2305 | $0.1927 | $0.1700 | $0.1910 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.2545 NO BID
59 |TB Safety Syringe $0.2200  $0.1960 NOBID | $0.2280 | $0.2080 | $0.1960 | $0.2221 | $0.1085 | $0.2202 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.2545 NO BID
60 |Safety Syringe, 259 x 5/8" $0.2100 | $0.2380 NO BID NOBID | $0.2740 | $0.2494 NO BID NOBID [ $0.2012 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 |Safety Syringe, 23g x 1" $0.2100 | $0.1010 NO BID NOBID | $0.2740 | $0.1235 | $0.1000 NOBID | $0.2012 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

No Award
62 |Syringe Luer Lok $0.1000 | $0.1200 NO BID NOBID | $0.1065 | $0.1159 | $0.1060 | $0.0976 | $0.1051 NO BID $0.6860 NO BID $0.1104 NO BID
63 |Ear Syringe NOBID | $1.5900 NO BID NOBID | $0.9060 NOBID | $0.9600 | $0.4880 | $0.8800 | $0.9920 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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64 |Oral Dispenser, 1ml $0.1200 | $0.1730 | NOBID NOBID | $0.1220 | $0.1650 | $0.1296 | NOBID | $0.1213 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.1203 NO BID
65 |Oral Dispenser, 5mi $0.1100 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.1115 | $0.1319 | $0.1200 | $0.1244 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1200 NO BID
66 fg;'”ge Vanish Point, 259 X251 ¢ 6400 | $0.5210 | NOBID NOBID | $0.4450 | $79.7100 | $0.4471 | NOBID | $0.4176 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 f}’z“lr;%e Vanish Point, 299 x $0.6400 | $0.5180 | NOBID NOBID | $0.4450 | $79.7100 | $0.4222 | NOBID | $0.4176 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 |Syringe, 23g x 1" w/ safety-lok | $0.2100 | $0.2310 | NOBID NOBID | $0.2105 | $0.2548 | $0.2273 | $0.2350 | $0.2128 | NOBID | $0.4200 | NOBID | $0.2236 | $0.3927
69 |Syringe, 27g x 1/2" $0.3600 | $0.3720 | NOBID NOBID | $0.3150 | $0.4111 | $0.3894 | $0.4022 | $0.3646 | NOBID | $0.4970 | $0.3220 | $0.3831 NO BID
70 ﬁé’ggl‘f 23g x 1" Integra $0.4900 | NOBID NOBID | $0.5244 | $0.4800 | $0.5617 | $0.4952 | $0.5448 | $0.4910 | NOBID | $0.7460 | $0.4720 | $0.5159 | $0.5156
71 ﬁé’ggl‘f 25g x 5/8" Integra $0.4900 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.5244 | $0.4690 | $0.5617 | $0.4952 | $0.5442 | $0.4910 | NOBID | $0.7460 | $0.4720 | $0.5159 | $0.5156
72 ﬁé’ggl‘f 25g x 1" Integra $0.4900 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.5244 | $0.4690 | $0.5617 | $0.4952 | $0.5442 | $0.4910 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.4720 | $0.5159 | $0.5156
73 | Syringe: 269 x 3/8" $0.1500 | NO BID NOBID | $0.1620 | $0.1300 | $0.1873 | $0.1620 | $0.1680 | $0.1517 | NOBID | $0.2620 | $0.1290 | $0.1594 NO BID
74 |Needle $0.0680 | $0.0970 | NOBID | $0.0820 | $0.6100 | $0.0950 | $0.0729 | $0.0758 | $0.0683 | NOBID | $0.1090 | $0.0600 | $0.0718 NO BID
75 |Lancets: 26g x Lmm $0.1000 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.1115 | $0.1433 | $0.1072 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1080 NO BID
76 |Lancets: 23g x 1.8mm $0.1200 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.1115 | $0.1433 | $0.1072 | NOBID | $0.1051 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.1080 NO BID
77 |Lancets: 22g x 2.2mm $0.1000 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.1115 | $0.1433 | $0.1072 | NOBID | $0.1051 | NO BID NO BID NOBID | $0.1080 NO BID
78 |Lancets: 21g x 2.8mm $0.1000 | $0.0540 | NOBID NOBID | $0.1115 | $0.1433 | $0.1072 | NOBID | $0.1051 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $0.1080 NO BID
79 |Vacutainer: 259 x .75" NOBID | $1.0070 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $1.5094 | NOBID NOBID | $1.1184 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 |Vacutainer: 23g x .75" $0.7500 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $1.1976 | $1.0858 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vucutainer Safety -Lok Blood
81 $1.1100 | $1.0650 | NOBID NOBID | $1.1060 | $1.2470 | $1.1945 | $0.6418 | $1.1184 | NOBID | $85.0070 | $0.9650 | $1.1750 NO BID

Collection Set
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82 |Uretheral Catheter Tray NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $1.4900 | $1.9280 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID
No Award

83 |Catheter Tray $1.3900 | $1.2000 | NOBID | NOBID | $1.6800 | NOBID | $1.4900 | $1.7200 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $1.6100 NO BID

84 [S)te""\fi'ggc Foley Stabilation $3.9200 | $4.0070 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $5.1900 | $4.2000 | $4.8000 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $4.1200 NO BID

85 |Irrigation Tray — Bulb Syringe | $1.2100 | $1.0700 | NOBID | $1.1100 | $1.0500 | $1.0000 | $1.7825 | $1.0200 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $1.1600 NO BID

86 |lrrigation Tray Sterile Saline $2.5500 | $1.9800 | NOBID | $1.0000 | $0.9000 | NOBID | NOBID | $1.5900 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID

87 |Cath Straps $3.8900 | $3.8900 | NOBID | NOBID | $3.5000 | $4.9300 | $4.0800 | $0.6650 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID

88 |Urinary Drainage Bag Holder | $6.6000 | $4.4100 | NOBID | NOBID | $2.6000 | $8.0000 | NOBID | $9.6000 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID

89 B:irt'e Specimen Collection $0.6700 | $0.3500 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.3500 | $0.5100 | NOBID | $0.3110 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.8268 NO BID

Swabs, Cotton & Wipes

90 |No Sting Skin Prep Wipes $0.3400 | $0.4190 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.1900 | $0.1744 | $0.3800 | $0.3140 | $05172 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.4334 NO BID

91 |Alcohol Prep Pads $0.0099 | $0.0070 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.00695 | $0.0079 | $0.0152 | $0.0072 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0113

92 |Adhesive Remover Wipes $0.1700 | $0.0330 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0338 | $0.0365 | NOBID | $0.0254 | $0.0137 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0591

93 | Alcohol Wipes $0.00680 | $0.00500 | NOBID | $0.00675 | $0.00625 | $0.00695 | NOBID | $0.00590 | $0.00570 | NOBID | $0.01970 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.00600

04 Xg;fi‘z;"; gonon Tip $0.0034 | $0.0030 | NOBID NOBID | $0.0032 | $0.0336 | $0.0388 | $0.0039 | $0.0038 | $0.00379 | $0.4990 | NO BID NO BID $0.0034

95 i;egl'ilceafoortsto“ Tipped $0.0120 | $0.0210 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0210 | $0.0130 | $0.0228 | $0.0120 | $0.0234 | NOBID | $0.0390 | NOBID | NOBID | $0.0247
No Award

96 |Lemon Glycerin Swabs $0.0340 | $0.0340 | NOBID | $0.0353 | $0.0334 | $0.0357 | NOBID | $0.0358 | $0.1024 | $0.1265 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID

g7 |Compound Tincture of $0.3500 | $0.1850 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.2117 | $0.1940 | $0.2284 | $0.1818 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $0.2984

Benzoin
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98 |Sani Bleach Wipes $0.1800 $0.1820 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2070 NO BID $0.1584 $0.1790 $0.0850 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
99 |Cotton Balls $0.0059 $0.0080 NO BID $0.0073 $0.0082 $0.0066 $0.0086 $0.0063 $0.0062 $0.0039 $0.0062 NO BID NO BID $0.0040
100 |Washcloth with aloe $0.0450 $0.0450 NO BID $0.0540 $0.0449 $0.0408 $0.0480 $0.0638 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0645
Batteries
101 |Batteries, AAA $0.2700 $0.2540 NO BID NO BID $0.2700 $0.2950 NO BID $0.2467 $0.2583 $0.4400 NO BID NO BID $0.4100 $0.6600
102 |Batteries, AA $0.2700 $0.2540 NO BID NO BID $0.2700 $0.2950 NO BID $0.2417 $0.2583 $0.4500 NO BID NO BID $0.4100 $0.6600
103 |Batteries, C $0.7300 $0.6280 NO BID NO BID $0.6100 $0.8000 NO BID $0.5958 $0.6066 $1.1000 NO BID NO BID $0.7400 $0.9900
104 |Batteries, 9 volt $1.0700 $1.1860 NO BID NO BID $0.8800 $0.7580 NO BID $0.9100 $0.9550 $1.9800 NO BID NO BID $1.3600 $1.7600
105 |Batteries, 3 volt lithium $1.2600 $0.8280 NO BID NO BID $1.0500 $1.1700 NO BID $0.9800 $3.5300 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.6500 $1.5500
Miscellaneous
106 |Acetaminophen Non-Aspirin NO BID $0.0080 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0201 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0814
107 |Aspirin NO BID $0.0070 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0141 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
108 |Ibuprofen NO BID $0.0100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0283 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
109 |Antacid Tablets NO BID $0.0110 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0180 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
110 |Ammonia Inhalants $0.1900 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2000 $0.1650 NO BID $0.3020 $0.2030 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2650
111 |Defibrillator Accessories
Standard Battery $310.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $239.000 | $162.3500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $247.4600
Adult pads $56.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.4000 $42.0000 $20.3500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.4500
Infant/Child pads $125.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $116.2100 | $98.7200 | $64.7100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $98.6300
Total $491.0000 $379.7200 | $247.4100 $385.5400
112 |Defibrillator Accessories
Stat Padz $35.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.1000 NO BID $53.1100 | $74.0000 | $36.6900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.1600
Pedi Padz $79.8000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.1000 NO BID $85.5100 | $103.0000 | $83.8200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $88.1900
Total $114.8000 $128.2000 $138.6200 | $177.0000 | $120.5100 $133.3500
113 |Exam Drapes $0.1500 $0.4060 NO BID $0.1360 $0.1305 $0.1550 NO BID $0.1340 $0.1161 $0.1580 $0.2490 $0.1590 $0.1300 NO BID
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114 |Exam Table Rolls $1.9400 $2.2420 NO BID $2.3080 $1.9000 $2.0600 NO BID $2.1967 $1.8850 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.3340 $2.9558
115 |Protective Towels $0.0410 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0336 $0.0282 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
116 |Masks, size: small $0.8400 $0.8590 NO BID NO BID $0.0808 NO BID $0.9000 $0.9190 $0.8825 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.8825 NO BID
117 |Masks, size: regular $0.8400 $0.8590 NO BID NO BID $0.0808 NO BID $0.9000 $0.9190 $0.8825 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.8825 NO BID
118 |Pen lights $0.9500 $0.8200 $0.5300 NO BID $0.8100 $1.2730 NO BID $0.9717 $0.5666 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.8400 $0.9050
119 |Pregnancy Tests $1.5300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.8844 NO BID $1.2520 $0.7468 $0.6548 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
120 gcstrepailn-Room Disposal $4.1100 | $3.7200 | NOBID | $4.3375 | $3.9800 | $4.3700 | $3.6000 | $4.5375 | $3.4500 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $4.7723 | $7.0500
121 |Sharps Biohazard Collector, NO BID $3.1800 $4.7900 NO BID $6.6900 $6.3600 NO BID $6.5817 $6.0700 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
122 |Sphygmomanometer
Size: Child $17.5600 | $15.3200 | $12.6900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.7000 $10.2900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.5400
Size: Small Adult $12.0000 | $12.2300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.8100 $10.2900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Size: Adult $12.0000 | $12.2300 | $12.6900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.0200 | $10.2900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.5400
Size: Large Adult $15.5000 | $18.5700 | $14.9900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.2100 | $18.5300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.5800
Sphygmomanometer Accessories
Bulb $1.6500 $2.6500 $1.9900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.0000 $2.1800 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gauge $10.4100 $6.0400 $4.9900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.3400 $5.3200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Valve $9.1800 $2.0100 $2.4900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8600 included NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $78.3000 | $69.0500 $56.9400 | $56.9000
123 |Thermometer NO BID $0.1260 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1459 NO BID $0.1140 $0.0879 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1038
124 |Thigh Inflation System $35.6100 $20.9200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.6000
125 |Tongue Wood Depressors $0.0070 $0.0060 NO BID $0.0124 $0.0070 $0.0072 NO BID $0.0089 $0.0085 $0.0089 $10.1700 NO BID NO BID NO BID
126 |Biohazard Waste Plastic Bags NO BID $0.0860 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.4658 NO BID $0.0734 $0.0319 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
127 |Complete RX Cup NO BID $0.0340 NO BID NO BID $0.0450 $0.0550 $0.0371 $0.0382 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
128 |Pill Crusher Pouches $0.0320 $0.0220 NO BID $0.0003 $0.0250 $0.0270 NO BID $0.0220 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0350 NO BID NO BID
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Department Totals
Health Dept $2,700.00 | $2,800.00 | $130.00 $190.00 | $6,400.00 | $1,000.00 $2,000.00 | $6,000.00 | $1,500.00 $3,500.00
Neshaminy Manor $2,168.50 | $10,509.37 | $7,123.52 | $11,379.00 | $5,570.03 | $3,646.62 $8,148.03 | $6,229.38 | $681.13
$4,868.50 | $13,309.37 | $7,253.52 | $11,569.00 | $11,970.03 | $4,646.62 $10,148.03 | $12,229.38 | $2,181.13 $3,500.00
Advertised in Newspaper Total Contract Award: $81,675.58

Posted on Public Purchase

469 Notified

66 Planholders

17 Responses

3 Rejected

Awarded Vendor

1 No Response

Low Vendor




