3-Year Contract to Provide Lawn Maintenance

Spec #20-05/17

Purchasing
Cutting Edge Focus M&M
Total Lawn Solutions JOliva MKay Lawncare |Steve's Lawn
Location Description ACC Int'l Care Services, Inc. Trucking Enterprises East Service
(Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut
or service) or service) or service) or service) or service) or service) or service)
DC 07-1-01 (1) Lawn Mowing $45.00 NO BID $35.00 $1,000.00 $975.00 $60.00 $3,375.00
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $20.00 $40.00 $100.00 $200.00 $0.00 $200.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $50.00 $60.00 $75.00 $200.00 $100.00 $450.00
Total $3,845.00 $3,655.00 $71,650.00 $72,875.00 $4,740.00 $239,975.00
DC 07-1-02 Parking lot maint. Only $30.00 NO BID $30.00 $200.00 NO BID $250.00 $960.00
Total $660.00 $660.00 $4,400.00 $5,500.00 $21,120.00
DC 07-1-03 (1) Lawn Mowing $38.00 NO BID $25.00 $800.00 $975.00 $50.00 $3,000.00
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $20.00 $20.00 $50.00 $150.00 $0.00 $200.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $25.00 $60.00 $120.00 $140.00 $50.00 $300.00
Total $3,212.00 $2,525.00 $57,020.00 $71,415.00 $3,750.00 $213,200.00
DC 07-1-04 (1) Lawn Mowing $45.00 NO BID $65.00 $900.00 $1,100.00 $65.00 $2,625.00
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $25.00 $40.00 $100.00 $350.00 $0.00 $900.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $50.00 $40.00 $120.00 $130.00 $100.00 $360.00
Total $3,955.00 $5,605.00 $65,020.00 $84,380.00 $5,085.00 $203,085.00
DC 07-1-07 (1) Lawn Mowing $30.00 NO BID $25.00 $650.00 $850.00 $40.00 $2,400.00
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $15.00 $30.00 $75.00 $225.00 $0.00 $900.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $25.00 $20.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $600.00
Total $2,550.00 $2,505.00 $46,950.00 $64,050.00 $3,210.00 $189,000.00
DC 07-1-08 (1) Lawn Mowing $45.00 NO BID $40.00 $950.00 $1,225.00 $60.00 $3,750.00
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $25.00 $30.00 $100.00 $220.00 $0.00 $300.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $35.00 $40.00 $100.00 $140.00 $75.00 $300.00
Total $3,865.00 $3,660.00 $68,350.00 $90,205.00 $4,590.00 $267,150.00
DC 07-1-09 (1) Lawn Mowing $50.00 NO BID $30.00 $1,000.00 $950.00 $55.00 NO BID
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $25.00 $30.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $40.00 $60.00 $300.00 $200.00 $150.00
Total $4,240.00 $3,090.00 $70,800.00 $71,150.00 $4,695.00
DC 07-1-10 (1) Lawn Mowing $45.00 NO BID $25.00 $900.00 $1,250.00 $55.00 NO BID
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $20.00 $40.00 $50.00 $200.00 $0.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $50.00 $50.00 $150.00 $175.00 $100.00
Total $3,845.00 $2,905.00 $64,100.00 $91,700.00 $4,395.00
DC 07-1-11 (1) Lawn Mowing $55.00 NO BID $30.00 $1,600.00 $1,275.00 $85.00 NO BID
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $30.00 $40.00 $200.00 $250.00 $0.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $50.00 $40.00 $200.00 $275.00 $100.00
Total $4,755.00 $3,190.00 $116,000.00 | $95,125.00 $6,465.00
DC 07-2-01 Bed maint. Only $18.00 NO BID $20.00 $300.00 NO BID $400.00 NO BID
Total $108.00 $120.00 $1,800.00 $2,400.00
DC 07-2-02 (1) Lawn Mowing $58.00 $40.00 $50.00 $900.00 $1,150.00 $85.00 NO BID
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $35.00 $15.00 $30.00 $200.00 $200.00 $0.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $50.00 $20.00 $50.00 $50.00 $100.00 $200.00
Total $5,072.00 $3,210.00 $4,410.00 $66,800.00 $84,350.00 $7,065.00
DC 07-2-05 (1) Lawn Mowing $40.00 $65.00 $50.00 $500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $20.00 $15.00 $40.00 $100.00 NO BID NO BID
(3) Tree Shrub Care $50.00 $30.00 $40.00 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
Total $3,500.00 $4,995.00 $4,570.00 $37,150.00
DC 07-3-01 (1) Lawn Mowing $48.00 $45.00 $65.00 $1,600.00 $1,450.00 $95.00 NO BID
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $25.00 $18.00 $50.00 $150.00 $250.00 $0.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $40.00 $80.00 $60.00 $150.00 $175.00 $100.00
Total $4,102.00 $3,981.00 $5,945.00 $114,600.00 | $106,600.00 $7,155.00
DC 07-3-03 (1) Lawn Mowing $48.00 $45.00 $65.00 $2,300.00 $1,300.00 NO BID NO BID
(2) Add'l maint/clean up $25.00 $15.00 $40.00 $200.00 $200.00 NO BID
(3) Tree Shrub Care $45.00 $25.00 $30.00 $200.00 $170.00 NO BID
Total $4,132.00 $3,585.00 $5,545.00 $164,300.00 | $95,120.00
DC OPTIONAL SVCS |(4) RED CRUSHED STONE $1.25 $65.00 $125.00 $100.00 $0.00 $95.00 $0.00
(5) TURF MAINT/SEEDING $6.10 $40.00 $200.00 $50.00 $0.00 $85.00 $0.00
(6) PROBLEMS OR
POTENTIAL PROBLEMS $38.00 $40.00 $250.00 $50.00 $0.00 $50.00 $0.00
(7) WEED CONTROL $0.0075 $50.00 $150.00 $100.00 $0.00 $75.00 $0.00
Forensic Facility (1) Lawn Mowing: $60.00 NO BID $60.00 $450.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID
(2) Add'l Maint/Clean up $30.00 $40.00 $150.00 $175.00
(3) Tree Shrub Care $42.00 $20.00 $100.00 $150.00
(4) Turf Seed Maint: $170.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
(5) Mulch Beds $295.00 $100.00 $200.00 $250.00
Total $4,347.00 $3,940.00 $20,400.00 $8,480.00




3-Year Contract to Provide Lawn Maintenance

Spec #20-05/17

Purchasing
Cutting Edge Focus M&M

Total Lawn Solutions JOliva MKay Lawncare |Steve's Lawn

Location Description ACC Int'l Care Services, Inc. Trucking Enterprises East Service
(Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut | (Price per cut

or service) or service) or service) or service) or service) or service) or service)
Emergency Mgmt Lawn Mowing: $60.00 NO BID $50.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $90.00 NO BID
Total $4,200.00 $3,500.00 $105,000.00 | $105,000.00 $6,300.00

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor




