Patient Personal Care
Spec #19-04/13
Neshaminy Manor

ALL PRICES LISTED ARE PER CASE

April Bath Body Wash and Shower

Gel: Chester Labs #000998 or equal,
8 fl. oz., 48/cs

[ERN

2 Ultra Dry Roll-On Antiperspirant, 1.5
0z., no alcohol, Ban or equal, 96/cs

3 Men'’s Deodorant, 2.25 oz., regular
scented or Unscented, translucent

stick, 12/cs

No Size Substitute

4  Toothbrush, Colgate Total Soft, Full
Head 144/cs No Substitute

5 Toothetes oral care suction swabs
system Sage #02232226 R/o #6512,
or equall00/bg, 10 bgs/cs

Toothpaste, Personal Size, 1.5 oz
tube Regular Flavor with Fluoride,
144/cs

(o)}

American Bob Barker

Amenities Company
NO BID $69.21
$24.00 $91.52
$6.00 $22.04
NO BID $30.64
NO BID NO BID
$27.00 $24.73

Care

Supplies

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$35.75

NO BID

NO BID

Delcrest
Medical
Services

$27.84

$25.39

$23.04

$53.28

NO BID

$24.28

Henry Manheim Medline

Schein

NO BID

$28.02

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Medical Industries
NO BID $25.78
$24.95 $30.50
$28.20 $24.48
$37.60 $59.04
$121.00| $137.80
$28.65 $35.15

Medpart

$29.76

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



Patient Personal Care
Spec #19-04/13
Neshaminy Manor

ALL PRICES LISTED ARE PER CASE

7 Evoke Alcohol-Free Mouthwash or
equal
4 0z. Plastic bottle 48/cs

g8 Overnight Denture Cleanser Tablets,
Polident or Efferdent, or equal 40/bx,
24bx/cs

9 Denture Adhesive Powder, Procter &
Gamble Fixodent or equal, Extra
Hold, 2.7 oz. Container, 24/cs

10 Oral Swabs, Kimberly Clark/Ballard
Medical, Ready care, Dentaswab

#12240 or equal, individually wrapped
250/pk, 4 pks/cs.

11
Denture Brushes, Donovan, TBDEN

or equal, 2 sided, clear polypropylene
bristles, individually wrapped, 144/cs

12 Denture Adhesive Cream, Proctor &
Gamble Fixodent Original or equal,
2.4 0z tube. 24/cs

American Bob Barker

Amenities

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Company

$22.46

$28.37

NO BID

$93.76

NO BID

$118.08

Care
Supplies

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$99.97

Delcrest
Medical
Services

$15.60

$37.44

$118.80

$77.76

$19.73

$103.68

Henry Manheim Medline

Schein

$39.31

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$31.74

NO BID

Medical

$26.20

$25.50

NO BID

$58.00

$20.30

NO BID

Industries

$16.44

$39.80

NO BID

$69.20

$24.91

$75.94

Medpart

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



Patient Personal Care
Spec #19-04/13
Neshaminy Manor

ALL PRICES LISTED ARE PER CASE
Delcrest
American Bob Barker Care Medical Henry Manheim Medline
Amenities Company  Supplies Services  Schein  Medical Industries Medpart

13 Baby Shampoo, Johnson & Johnson
No Tears Formula or equal, 3.5 oz.,
96/cs NO BID $26.96 $23.75 $18.76 NOBID NOBID  $23.37 NO BID

14 Combs, 7 inch, unbreakable, 144/cs $28.00 $3.96 NO BID $3.17 $2.88 $5.45 $5.65 NO BID
15
Women'’s Brushes, Plastic Vent, 12/cs $3.25 $3.62 NO BID $3.48 NO BID  $3.40 $4.42 NO BID

16 Nail Polish Remover, 6 fl oz., plastic
bottle, 12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

17 Emery Boards, Graham Fields #1778,
or equal, 4.15", 144/BX/cs $2.50 $1.34 NO BID $2.60 $4.99 $2.25 $4.21 NO BID

18 Manicure Sticks, Graham Fields,
#1780 or equal smooth, beveled
wood, hoof shaped 4.5, 144/bx/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.19 $3.34 $1.47 $2.92 NO BID

19 Nail Clippers, Nail Clipper Only (No
File Attached) Regular Size 288/cs $60.00 $78.48 NO BID $62.92 $64.32 $60.48 $98.40 NO BID




Patient Personal Care
Spec #19-04/13
Neshaminy Manor

ALL PRICES LISTED ARE PER CASE

20 Nail Clipper, Nail Clipper Only (No File
Attached) Large Size 144/cs

21 Pre-Shave, Williams Lectric Shave
Original or equal 3fl. oz btl., 24/cs

22 After Shave, Aqua Velva Ice Blue or
equal, 3.5 oz. btl, 12/cs

23 Razors, Gillette, Good News, Twin
Blade, 100/cs No Substitute

24 Brushless Shave Cream, 11 0z. can,
Barbasol Aerosol Shave Cream, or
equal 12/cs

25 Facial Tissue, Kimberly-Clark’s Scott
Surpass #21304 or equal, 100
2ply/box, 30/bx/cs

Delcrest

American Bob Barker Care Medical
Amenities Company  Supplies Services
$63.00 $77.76 NO BID $66.24
NO BID NO BID $46.10 $51.06
NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.67
NO BID $28.06 NO BID $34.50
NO BID $22.15 NO BID $12.24
NO BID $21.18 NO BID $19.09

Henry
Schein

$67.92

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Manheim Medline

Medical Industries
$77.76 $98.40
$47.00 NO BID
$34.25 $60.00
$37.25 $52.00
$10.50 $12.96
$14.50 $24.32

Medpart

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$10.50

NO BID



Patient Personal Care
Spec #19-04/13
Neshaminy Manor

ALL PRICES LISTED ARE PER CASE

26 Feminine Napkins, Personal Products
co, Stayfree Maxi-Pads , Regular,
#1201012, or equal, No Extra Long,
576/cs

27 Bladder Control Prevail, First Quality
#BC-011 or equal, Regular
6ph/24bgl/cs

28
Dove Soap, 3.5 0z bar 2/bx, 24bx/cs

No Substitute

29 Moisturizing Lotion, Smith & Nephew
Secura #59433400 or equal, 8 fl oz.
bottle, 48 blt/cs

30 Shower Caps, Disposable, 200/bx

31 Shampoo Cap-all in one, Rinsefree —
Shampoo & Conditioner. Sage, R/O
#7909 or equal, 40/cs

American Bob Barker
Amenities

$31.50

NO BID

NO BID

$36.00

$15.00

$28.00

Henry Manheim Medline

Schein

$41.33

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$7.17 NO BID

Delcrest

Care Medical

Company  Supplies Services

$24.15 NO BID $81.14

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$59.23 $42.15 $86.88

$41.45 NO BID $16.56
$10.50 NO BID

NO BID NO BID $142.14

$127.40

Medical

NO BID

$31.00

$52.80

$19.15

NO BID

$68.20

Industries

$33.97

$22.42

NO BID

$12.06

$25.27

$49.29

Medpart

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$22.00

NO BID

NO BID
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