Poly Bags & Can Liners
Spec #15-04/13
Purchasing

1 23" x 10" x 39" black
2 24" x 24" Clear

3 24" x 33", clear trash bag, 13
gallon

4 30" x 37" 27-30 gallon, natural
or clear

5 30" x 43" RED plastic liner with
black printed letters "Infectious
Waste"

6 30" x 43" BLUE plastic liner

with black printed letters
"Soiled Linen"

7 33" x 40" Cart collection bag,
clear

8 33" x 40" clear trash bag, 33
gallon

g 36” x 60" 55 gallon can liners,
natural or clear

10 37" x 46" clear plastic liner
250/cs

11 38" x 58” black

12 40” x 46" Blue recycling bags,
42 gallon

13 40" x 48" 45 Gallon

14 43" x 48" clear trash bag, 56
gallon

15 44" x 48" clear trash bag, 56
gallon

16
46" x 42" shredder bags, clear

CALICO CENTRAL POLY PRESTIGE SINGER
rolled folded rolled folded rolled rolled
| $13.09 $13.09 | $15.40 $15.40 $15.05 $17.25
$9.44 NO BID $10.80 $11.60 $11.40 $10.99
$18.04 NOBID $13.90 $14.60 $15.70 $19.99
$17.74  NOBID $19.20 $19.90 $13.85 $19.67
$15.20 NOBID $19.40 NOBID $14.80 $15.59
$15.10 NOBID $17.90 NO BID $14.50 $15.45
$13.54 NOBID $14.20 $14.30 $12.75 $15.40
$27.09 $27.09 $25.00 $25.00 $24.60 $25.10
$17.54  NOBID $18.90 $18.90 $16.65 $21.20
NOBID | $1654 | | $16.60 | $16.60 $16.95 NO BID
240/cs
$18.17 | NOBID $19.00 $19.00 $18.95 $21.79
$12.44 | NOBID $12.00 $12.00 $19.85 NO BID
$19.44  NOBID $19.60 | $19.90 | | $18.50 $22.23
$18.64  NOBID $19.40 $19.40 $15.85 $19.20
NOBID | $26.64 $29.20 $29.20 $22.70 $29.00
$18.94 | NOBID $23.80 $23.80 NO BID NO BID
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