Vehicle Purchases

Spec #15-03/15

Multiple Departments

Beans-Class Faulkner Koch Koch Red Hill
Ford/New | Pontiac Buick | Holdings Holdings Garage Inc.
Altec Apple Holland Auto| GMC Isuzu (Milham (Milham (Sands Ford Sutliff Whitmoyer
Industries Automotive Group Truck Inc. Ford) Ford) of Red Hill) Chevrolet Ford
Bid by Individual Vehicle
Passenger Vehicles
Vehicle #

1((S) Chevy Impala Police 4 ea NO BID $22,623.00 NO BID $20,744.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20,432.00 $23,100.00
2|(JP) Ford Taurus lea NO BID $25,343.00 | $25,603.00 NO BID $25,098.00 | $25,098.00 | $25,499.00 NO BID $25,750.00
3| (ES) Chevy Impala Police 1ea NO BID $20,138.00 NO BID $20,744.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20,432.00 $20,575.00

4| (YC) Dodge Grand Caravan 1 ea NO BID $21,327.00 | $21,457.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21,300.00 NO BID NO BID

Trucks
Vehicle #
5|(H) Chevy Colorado 1ea NO BID $26,297.00 NO BID $26,496.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $26,510.00 $26,100.00
Discount $25,969.50
6|(FM) Chevy Silverado 1500 1 ea NO BID $28,625.00 NO BID $30,802.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29,446.00 $29,600.00
7|(EC) Chevy Silverado 2500 1 ea NO BID $35,251.00 NO BID $37,107.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,557.00 $35,450.00
8| (GS) Chevy Silverado 2500 4 ea NO BID $32,969.00 NO BID $37,212.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $33,340.00 $31,650.00
Discount $31,491.75
9|(GS) Ford F-550 1lea $69,247.00 | $62,995.00 NO BID NO BID $63,450.00 | $64,580.00 | $67,115.00 NO BID $63,875.00
Total Individual Award $147,009.00 $25,098.00 $21,300.00 $81,728.00| $151,936.50




Bid by Manufacturer Grouping

General Motors

(Item #1, #3, #5, #6, #7, #8) N/A $332,679.00 N/A $346,979.15 N/A N/A N/A $328,033.00 | $330,725.00
Individual vehicle award comparison: $317,678.50
Ford Motor
(Item #2, #9) N/A $88,338.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A $92,614.00 N/A $89,625.00
Individual vehicle award comparison: $88,093.00
Chysler
(Item #4) N/A $21,327.00 | $21,457.00 N/A N/A N/A $21,300.00 N/A N/A
Awarded by Unit Cost Comparison: $21,300.00
Bid by Vehicle Type
Passenger Vehicles N/A $157,300.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Awarded by Unit Cost Comparison: $147,009.00
Trucks N/A $285,044.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $281,625.00
Awarded by Unit Cost Comparison: $278,807.50
Multi Vehicle Award Discount 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0.50%
Piggyback Contract No COSTARS COSTARS COSTARS COSTARS | COSTARS No COSTARS COSTARS

Advertised in Newspaper

Posted on Public Purchase

261 Notified

41 Planholders

9 Responses

2 No Bid

1 Rejected




