Contract to Provide 2018 Vehicle Upfit Packages

Spec #14-04/18

Item Dept

1.1 FM

2 Rangers

2.1 Rangers

w

Rangers

3.1 Rangers

4 Rangers

4.1 Rangers

5 DOC

5.1 DOC

6 EM
6.1 EM

7 Coroner

7.1 Coroner

8 Sheriff
8.1 Sheriff
9 Sheriff
10 Sheriff
11 Sheriff

11.1 Sheriff

12 Sheriff

12.1 Sheriff

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor

Upfit Package for Vehicle Type

2018 Ford F150 Supercab 4WD Pickup Truck per
specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Ford F150 Supercab 4WD Pickup
Truck

2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWA (#83-10)
per specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility
AWA (#83-10)

2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWA (#83-11)
per specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility
AWA (#83-11)

2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWA (#83-20)
per specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility
AWA (#83-20)

2018 Ford Transit 350 Medium Roof Cargo Van per
specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Ford Transit 350 Medium Roof
Cargo Van

2018 Ford Explorer LS 4WD SUV per specifications
ALTERNATE 2018 Ford Explorer LS 4WD SUV

2018 Chevy Silverado 2500HD Crew Cab, Long Box
4WD Pickup Truck with Bed Cap per specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Chevy Silverado 2500HD Crew
Cab, Long Box 4WD Pickup Truck with Bed Cap

2018 Chevy Tahoe SSV 4WD SUV per specifications
ALTERNATE 2018 Chevy Tahoe SSV 4WD SUV

Ford Transit 350 12-Passenger Van (#85-25) per
specifications

2018 Ford Transit 350 12-Passenger Van (#85-26)
per specifications

2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility (1 of 2) per
specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility (1
of 2)

2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility (2 of 2) per
specifications

ALTERNATE 2018 Ford Police Interceptor Utility (2
of 2)

Total Amount Bid
Total Award Amount

Qty

KOCH ENTERPRISES
D/B/A MILHAM

BLOCK FORD TOYOTA
BEYER FORD COMMUNICATIONS HAVIS SCION
$4,563.00 No Bid $4,431.54 No Bid
No Bid No bid No Bid $4,015.56
$10,080.00 No Bid $8,255.72 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,773.42
$9,885.00 No Bid $8,255.72 No Bid
No bid No Bid No Bid $11,773.42
$9,868.00 No Bid $8,255.72 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,773.42
$6,853.00 No bid $18,179.82 No Bid
No bid No Bid No Bid $24,020.48
$3,352.00 No Bid $3,068.71 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,084.72
$5,954.00 No Bid $5,655.41 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,217.40
$5,311.00 No Bid $5,510.07 $4,724.70
No Bid $4,820.89 No Bid No Bid
No Award
$8,357.00 No Bid $9,108.09 $9,440.77
$12,805.00 No Bid $9,108.09 $9,440.77
No Award
$12,014.00 No Bid No Bid $11,908.97
No Bid $9,692.86 $12,684.58 No Bid
$12,257.00 No Bid No Bid $11,908.97
No Bid $9,692.86 $12,684.58 No Bid
$101,299.00 $24,206.61 $105,198.05 $122,082.60
$8,357.00 $51,671.10 $27,833.50

low bid

$4,015.56

$8,255.72

$8,255.72

$8,255.72

$6,853.00

$3,068.71

$5,655.41

$4,724.70

$8,357.00

$9,108.09

$9,692.86

$9,692.86

$87,861.60



