PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF FLEET VEHICLES

Spec #13-03/17

General Services

Item 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13
Chevrolet Chevrolet
Specified Chevrolet | Silverado Ford Utility Ford Utility Ford Sedan| Colorado
Ford Escape | Silverado DIESEL |Ford Transit| Ford Escape Police Ford Edge | Ford Escape Police Ford Transit Police Extended Cab | Ford Taurus
SE 2500HD 3500HD Van XL SE Interceptor SE SE Interceptor |Wagon, T-350| Interceptor | Long-Box LT SEL
. Parks
Ordering Dept GenServ | GenServ | GenServ | GenServ | Coroner Parks Sheriff Sheriff Sheriff Sheriff Security Health Juvenile
Qty 1 2 1 1 2 3 1 1 1 3 1 1 1
No Award No Award
Apple Ford $23,798.00 No Bid No Bid | $31,852.00 | $22,091.00 | $28,898.00 | $26,877.00 | $22,097.00 | $28,385.00 | $29,965.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Apple Chevrolet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30,240.00 No Bid
A&T Chevrolet No Bid $40,345.96 |$59,331.76| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30,877.40 No Bid
*order date passed before bid was opened, dealer can "try" to order
Beyer Ford (Celebrity Ford) $23,909.00 No Bid No Bid | $31,265.00 | $22,093.00 | $28,821.00 | $26,702.00 | $22,093.00 | $28,562.00 | $30,709.00 | $26,709.00 No Bid $26,783.00
Blaise Alexander Chevrolet No Bid $41,116.00 |$60,411.00/ No Bid $21,270.00 No Bid No Bid $21,270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31,634.00 No Bid
Equal Product Bid Chevy Trax Chevy Trax
Brian Hoskins Ford $23,599.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,368.00 | $28,712.00 No Bid $22,398.00 | $29,082.00 No Bid $27,426.00 No Bid $26,958.00
Equal Product Bid
Chas Winner Ford $23,443.00 No Bid No Bid | $31,765.00 | $22,333.00 | $29,049.00 | $26,995.00 | $22,333.00 | $28,470.00 | $30,100.00 | $25,600.00 No Bid $27,000.00
Day Automotive $23,698.00 | $39,957.00 | $59,559.00| $31,073.00 | $21,668.00 | $29,055.00 | $26,577.00 | $21,668.00 | $27,442.00 $29,269.00 | $23,749.00| $30,514.00 | $27,037.00
Equal Product Bid
Fred Beans Ford & Chevrolet $23,400.00 | $36,952.00 |$55,865.00( $31,096.00 $21,468.00 $28,367.00 | $26,577.00 | $21,468.00 | $27,857.00 | $30,366.00 | $25,474.00| $29,449.00 | $25,732.00
Hertrich Fleet $22,573.00 | $39,421.00 | $60,441.00| $31,492.00 | $21,598.00 | $28,418.00 | $26,709.00 | $21,598.00 | $28,110.00 | $29,582.00 | $25,422.00| $30,665.00 | $26,680.00
John Kennedy Ford #1 $24,303.00 No Bid No Bid | $30,027.00 | $22,349.00 | $27,073.00 | $26,956.00 | $22,349.00 | $26,683.00 | $30,742.00 | $25,972.00 No Bid $27,237.00
John Kennedy Ford #2 $24,303.00 No Bid No Bid | $30,027.00 | $22,349.00 | $27,073.00 | $26,956.00 | $22,349.00 | $26,683.00 | $30,742.00 | $25,972.00 No Bid No Bid
Koch Holdings Milham Ford $23,550.00 No Bid No Bid | $30,394.00 | $21,795.00 | $28,495.00 | $26,403.00 | $21,793.00 | $29,550.00 | $29,509.00 | $24,401.00 No Bid $26,483.00
Ray Price $23,802.00 | $41,906.00 | $61,242.00| $31,703.00 | $21,841.00 | $28,420.00 | $26,500.00 | $25,198.00 | $28,478.00 | $28,811.00 | $24,761.00 | $32,097.00 | $26,601.00
**Incomplete bid price *x
Red Hill Garage Sands Ford $23,800.00 No Bid No Bid | $31,527.00 | $21,969.00 | $28,916.00 | $26,578.00 | $21,969.00 | $28,479.00 | $29,948.00 | $24,840.00 No Bid $26,659.00
RGH New Holland Auto Group $23,818.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,028.00 | $28,398.00 No Bid $22,028.00 | $28,230.00 | $30,345.00 | $25,566.00 No Bid No Bid
Whitmoyer Ford $24,200.00 | $39,500.00 | $59,575.00| $31,775.00 | $21,625.00 | $28,225.00 | $26,875.00 | $21,625.00 | $28,000.00 | $29,900.00 | $24,950.00 | $31,000.00 | $27,050.00
multi-vehicle discount applied $24,139.50 | $39,401.25 | $59,426.06| $31,695.56 | $21,570.94 | $28,154.44 | $26,807.81 | $21,570.94 | $27,930.00 | $29,825.25 | $24,887.63 | $30,922.50 | $26,982.38

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor




PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF

Spec #13-03/17

General Services

Item 14 15 16 17 18
Specified Chevrolet Multi Vehicle
Ford Fusion| Chevrolet Cruze Chevrolet | Chevrolet Total Award
SE Tahoe LS Hatchback Malibu | Traverse LS Award Discount
Ordering Dept . 5 :
Juvenile Ecomm GenServ Youth Ctr Coroner
Qty 1 1 1 1
No Award
Apple Ford No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.00%
Apple Chevrolet No Bid $39,575.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39,575.00 0.00%
A&T Chevrolet No Bid $42,996.91 | $20,150.60 | $19,964.26 | $26,440.20 0.00%
*order date passed before bid w *
Beyer Ford (Celebrity Ford) No Bid No Bid $20,395.00 No Bid $30,664.00 0.00%
Blaise Alexander Chevrolet No Bid $42,881.00 | $20,693.00 | $20,021.00 | $28,848.00 0.00%
Equal Product Bid
Brian Hoskins Ford $23,711.00 No Bid $16,307.00 | $18,149.00 No Bid $18,149.00 0.00%
Equal Product Bid Ford Fusion
Chas Winner Ford $23,923.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.00%
Day Automotive $22,781.00 | $40,988.00 | $16,262.00 | $22,555.00 | $29,420.00 | $150,599.00 0.00%
Equal Product Bid Ford Focus
Fred Beans Ford & Chevrolet $23,359.00 | $39,927.00 | $20,288.00 | $22,296.00 | $26,577.00 | $202,154.00 0.00%
Hertrich Fleet No Bid $41,062.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,573.00 0.00%
John Kennedy Ford #1 $24,442.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137,929.00 0.00%
John Kennedy Ford #2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.00%
Koch Holdings Milham Ford $23,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,403.00 0.00%
Ray Price $23,364.00 | $43,444.00 | $20,846.00 | $20,182.00 | $27,857.00 0.00%
**Incomplete bid price
Red Hill Garage Sands Ford $23,482.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.00%
RGH New Holland Auto Group No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.00%
Whitmoyer Ford $23,650.00 | $41,675.00 | $17,300.00 | $18,850.00 | $28,175.00 0.25%
multi-vehicle discount applied | $23,590.88 | $41,570.81 | $17,256.75 | $18,802.88 | $28,104.56

Low Vendor

Awarded Vendor




