3 Year Contract to Provide Poly Bags & Can Liners
Purchasing Department
Spec #12-04/16
PA Paper &
All American Poly | Calico Industries Interboro Sysco Xpedx Veritiv | Central Poly Corp MJ Earl Inc Supply Singer Equipment
(cost per case) (cost per case) (cost per case) (cost per case) (cost per case) (cost per case) (cost per case) (cost per case) (cost per case)
Rolled | Folded | Rolled | Folded | Rolled | Folded | Rolled | Folded | Rolled | Folded | Rolled | Folded | Rolled | Folded | Rolled | Folded | Rolled Folded
23" x 10” x 39” black
1 plastic trash liners $11.71 | $11.25 | $14.25 | $14.25 ( $9.48 | $9.48 | $10.50 | NOBID| NOBID | NOBID| $12.05 | $12.15 | $14.43 | NOBID | NOBID | $14.10 | $17.42 | NOBID
2 |24” x 24" Clear plastic liner| | NOBID | NOBID| $9.30 | NOBID| $9.32 | $9.32 | $10.23 | NOBID| $10.98 | NOBID| $8.90 | $10.80 | $12.59 | NOBID| $9.50 | NOBID| $11.02 | NO BID
3 | 24"x 33" cleartrash bag| | NOBID | NOBID| $13.74 | NOBID| $13.24 | $13.24 | $18.96 | NOBID| $20.47 | NOBID| $12.30 | $16.90 [ $14.29 | NOBID| $17.20 | NOBID| $19.58 | NO BID
4 | 30" x 43" RED plastic liner| [ NOBID | NOBID| $13.44 [ NOBID| $17.24 | $17.24 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | $21.10 | $22.80 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NOBID| $15.16 | NO BID
5 30" x 43" BLUE p""l‘if]t; NO BID | NO BID | $12.24 | NOBID| $13.24 | $13.24 | $14.50 | NO BID| $15.52 | NO BID | $18.20 | $18.40 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | $15.16 | NO BID
6| 3340 canco"ecggg NO BID | NO BID | $11.44 | NO BID | $10.84 | $10.84 | $14.38 | NO BID | $15.55 | NO BID | $11.75 | $12.40 | $15.54 | NO BID | $14.55 | NO BID | $15.18 | NO BID
7 33" x 40" clear trash bag| | NOBID| N/A $22.64 N/A $22.82 N/A $23.75 N/A_ |NOBID| N/A $11.80 N/A $27.64 N/A $20.95 N/A $24.42 N/A
36” x 60” 55 gallon can
8 liners NOBID| N/A $14.67 N/A $17.34 N/A $19.92 N/A $20.39 N/A $16.80 N/A $22.03 N/A $18.04 N/A $19.59 N/A
9 | 37" x 46" clear plastic liner NO BID | NOBID | NOBID | $16.20 | $15.74 | $15.74 | NOBID | NOBID| NOBID | NOBID| $25.10 | $26.40 | $17.50 | NOBID | NO BID | NO BID | $17.28 NO BID
38" x 58” black, 1.5 mil
10 plastic trash liner $20.21 | $19.62 | $15.73 | NOBID| $17.90 | $17.82 | $20.24 | NOBID | NO BID | NO BID| $15.90 | $15.90 | $15.42 | NOBID | NO BID | NO BID | $22.02 NO BID
40" x 48” 45 Gallon can
11 liners NO BID | NOBID| $16.94 | NOBID| $18.24 | $18.24 | $20.99 | NOBID| $22.70 | NOBID | $15.80 | $16.80 | $19.38 | NO BID | $19.50 | NO BID | $21.69 NO BID
12| 43" x48"clear trash bag| [ NOBID | NOBID| $15.24 | NOBID| $18.32 | $18.32 | NOBID | NOBID| NOBID | NOBID | $15.40 | $16.40 | $17.62 | NOBID| $16.98 | NOBID| $18.75 | NO BID
13| 44" x 48" clear trash bag| | $23.30 | $22.54 | NOBID | $24.54 | $24.32 | $24.32 | $27.65 | NOBID| NOBID | NO BID | $23.40 | $23.40 | $31.81 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID| $28.30 | NO BID
14 46" x 42" shredder bags| | $13.01 [ $12.59 | $19.14 | NOBID | $12.98 | $12.98 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | $20.60 | NO BID| NOBID | NO BID [ NO BID | NOBID | NOBID| NO BID
add $25/order
under 10 cs
\
Agreement signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No No No
Documentation Ct_)nflrr_n!ng Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
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