



Janitorial Services Spec #10-02/13												
		Alpha Omega Janitorial & Power Washing	Bucks County Cleaning	CPS Cleaning (CNS Cleaning)	Jani King	Phelan Service	RMBS Busines Solutions	S & S Cleaning	UniquSource Products & Services	CURRENT MONTHLY COST		
	<b>Combined total Individual Lower Bucks Locations</b>	\$62,798.40										
10	D.C. 07-1-06 WALTMAN	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 <b>\$7,092.00</b>	No Bid	\$305.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$342.00	\$299.00 \$7,176.00	\$477.05	\$336.87		
11	D.C. 07-1-09 FINELLO	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 <b>\$7,092.00</b>		\$303.00			\$342.00	\$299.00 \$7,176.00	No Bid	\$336.87		
12	D.C. 07-2-01 BENZ	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 <b>\$7,092.00</b>		\$308.00			\$342.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$336.87		
13	D.C. 07-2-02 DOUPLE	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 \$7,092.00		\$288.00 <b>\$6,912.00</b>			\$320.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$315.20		
14	D.C. 07-2-07 JUDGE	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 <b>\$7,092.00</b>		\$303.00			\$342.00	\$320.00	No Bid	\$336.87		
15	D.C. 07-2-08 ARMITAGE	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 <b>\$7,092.00</b>		\$303.00			\$330.00	\$318.00	No Bid	\$325.05		
16	D.C. 07-3-01 SNOW	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 <b>\$7,092.00</b>		\$308.00			\$342.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$336.87		
17	D.C. 07-3-02 SEAMAN	\$300.00 \$7,200.00 <b>\$7,092.00</b>		\$308.00			\$342.00	\$324.00	No Bid	\$336.87		
	<b>Combined total if bidding ALL Middle Bucks Locations</b>	\$56,736.00 w/ discount		N/A			\$58,224.00	N/A	N/A	\$64,848.00	N/A	N/A
	<b>Combined total Individual Middle Bucks Locations</b>	\$56,556.00										
18	D.C. 07-2-03 BAUM	\$310.00					\$281.00		\$330.00	\$375.00	\$477.05	\$330.00

Janitorial Services Spec #10-02/13										
		Alpha Omega Janitorial & Power Washing	Bucks County Cleaning	CPS Cleaning (CNS Cleaning)	Jani King	Phelan Service	RMBS Busines Solutions	S & S Cleaning	UniquSource Products & Services	CURRENT MONTHLY COST
		\$7,440.00		\$6,744.00						
		\$7,328.40								
19	D.C. 07-2-05 ROTH	\$310.00	No Bid	\$279.00	No Bid	\$337.50	\$360.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$310.00
		\$7,440.00		\$6,696.00						
		\$7,328.40								
20	D.C. 07-3-03 GAMBARDELLA	\$310.00		\$320.00		\$337.50	\$342.00		No Bid	\$310.00
		\$7,440.00								
		\$7,328.40								
<b>Combined total if bidding ALL Upper Bucks Locations</b>		\$21,985.00 w/ discount	N/A	\$21,120.00	N/A	\$24,120.00	\$25,848.00	N/A	N/A	
<b>Combined total Individual Upper Bucks Locations</b>		\$20,768.40								
<hr/>										
21	Domestic Relations		No Bid	\$300.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$275.00	No Bid	\$300.00
								\$6,600.00		
22	<b>Combined Total Forensic Facility Group</b>									
	Crime Laboratory		No Bid	\$160.00	\$344.75	No Bid		\$125.00	\$396.58	
	Coroner's Office		No Bid	\$240.00	\$349.70	No Bid		\$199.00	\$580.17	
			N/A	\$400.00	\$694.45	N/A		\$324.00	\$976.75	\$400.00
								\$7,776.00		
23	Children & Youth		No Bid	\$1,490.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$1,453.00	No Bid	\$1,655.00
								\$34,872.00		
24	Parks & Rec Admin Building		\$88.00	\$67.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$60.00	No Bid	\$69.00
				\$1,608.00				\$1,440.00		
25	P&R Annex Building		No Bid	\$75.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$69.00	No Bid	\$79.00
				\$1,800.00				\$1,656.00		
26	P&R Morav Pottery & Tile Works	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00
				\$3,600.00						
27	P&R Churchv Nat Ctr & Farmhse		No Bid	\$195.00	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00
				\$4,680.00						

