4-YEAR CONTRACT FOR TRASH AND RECYCLING SERVICE

Spec #04-01/14

General Services

1 below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day ol

Services
UPPER BUCKS MIDDLE BUCKS LOWER BUCKS Outside
AREA AREA AREA Contract TOTAL
Advanced Disposal Services (SUBMITTED) NO BID $732,919.00 NO BID $732,919.00
Advanced Disposal Services (ACTUAL) NO BID $2,135,202.00 NO BID $5,000.00 $2,140,202.00
DelGuerico's Wrecking & Salvage, Inc (SUBMITTED) $38,008.00 NO BID NO BID $38,008.00
DelGuerico's Wrecking & Salvage, Inc (ACTUAL) $38,008.00 NO BID NO BID $5,000.00 $43,008.00
George Leck & Son (SUBMITTED) $44,084.00 $666,972.00 $123,860.00 $834,916.00
George Leck & Son (ACTUAL) $42,792.00 $719,193.20 $136,136.00 $5,000.00 $903,121.20
JP Mascaro & Son Inc (SUBMITTED) $90,420.00 $788,884.00 $158,160.00 $1,037,464.00
JP Mascaro & Son Inc (ACTUAL) $90,420.00 $781,684.00 $158,160.00 $5,000.00 $1,035,264.00
BFI dba Republic Services (SUBMITTED) $33,134.85 $543,609.15 $120,108.00 $696,852.52
BFI dba Republic Services (ACTUAL) $33,135.24 $537,731.04 $118,762.94 $5,000.00 $694,628.32
Waste Management (SUBMITTED) $44,084.00 $666,972.00 $123,860.00 $834,916.00
Waste Management (ACTUAL) $44,084.00 $666,972.00 $121,196.00 $5,000.00 $837,252.00
Advertised in Newspaper
Posted on Demand Star
100 Notified
18 Planholders
6 Responses




