Skin Care Products
Spec #03-02/16
Neshaminy Manor

Item 1: Nourishing Skin Cream
4 ml foil packet
4 0z. tube
1,000 ml bag

Item 2: HydraGuard Silicone Blend or equal
4 ml foil packet
4 0z. tube

Iltem 3: Skin Protectant Paste
4 ml foil packet
4 0z. tube

Item 4: Antifungal Ointment
4 ml foil packet
2.5 0z. tube

Advertised in Newspaper
Posted on Public Purchase
507 Notified

64 Planholders

5 Responses

4 No Responses

American
Health Care
Services, Inc.

$0.06815
$0.02587
$0.01563

$0.08640
$0.04129

$0.10711
$0.04136

Incomplete
$0.06425

First Choice

Medical Manheim

Supply Medical Medline
$0.05529 $0.05000 $0.04604
$0.02713 $0.77000 $0.01635
$0.01671 $0.01550 $0.01387
$0.06369 $0.06000 $0.06394
$0.03677 $1.06000 $0.02977
$0.06369 $0.05799 $0.05498
$0.03423 $0.98000 $0.07257

NO BID NO BID $0.06387
$0.04793 $1.39000 $0.04279

Reidy Medical
Supply

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$0.14844
$0.06890

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID



