Vehicle Purchases

Spec #02-01/16

Apple Bayshore Brian John Whitmoyer
Automotive | Westgate | Ford Truck RGH Hoskins Kennedy Whitmoyer Buick-
Qty Group Chevrolet Sales Automotive Ford Ford Koch Holdings | Sands Ford Ford Chevrolet
(Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost) (Unit Cost)
Vehicle #
1 |DOC |Ford Transit 350XL 3 | $29,759.00 NO BID $30,728.00 | $29,786.00 NO BID $31,085.00 $29,321.00 $29,931.00 | $30,150.00 NO BID
2 $58,642.00
2 |GS |Ford Transit 350 Base 1 | $26,136.00 NO BID $27,350.00 | $26,463.00 NO BID $27,499.00 $25,979.00 $26,554.00 | $26,800.00 NO BID
DOC 2 $51,958.00
3 |GS |Chev Silverado 2500HD D NO BID $32,293.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31,350.00
Multi-Vehicle Award Discount 2 $31,036.50
$62,073.00
4 |PR |Ford Utility Police Interceptor 3 | $27,454.00 NO BID NO BID $27,339.00 | $28,773.00 | $28,734.00 $26,851.00 $28,169.00 | $27,700.00 NO BID
2 $53,702.00
5 1S Ford Sedan Police Interceptor 2 | $23,998.00 NO BID NO BID $23,799.00 | $24,508.00 | $25,280.00 $23,992.00 $24,509.00 | $24,500.00 NO BID
$47,598.00
6 |S Ford Utility Police Interceptor 1 | $26,993.00 NO BID NO BID $27,114.00 | $28,518.00 | $28,154.00 $26,452.00 $27,719.00 | $27,500.00 NO BID
$26,452.00
7 |S Ford Transit T-350 1 | $26,350.00 NO BID $27,488.00 | $26,635.00 NO BID $27,927.00 $26,225.00 $26,822.00 | $27,050.00 NO BID
$26,225.00
8 |[FM |Chev Silverado 1500 Double Cab 1 NO BID $29,368.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30,325.00
$29,368.00
Multi Vehicle Award Discount NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA 1% 1%
Piggyback Contract CoStars CoStars CoStars CoStars NA CoStars CoStars NA CoStars CoStars
Total Award $29,368.00 $47,598.00 $216,979.00 $62,073.00 | $356,018.00

Advertised in Newspaper

Posted on Public Purchase

318 Notified

54 Planholders

10 Responses

2 No Bid




