
Sakoutis 
Builders

DeNucci 
Excavating AJ Jurich

Titanium 
Enterprises Crest

CONTRACT A- Asbestos Abatement
805 6th Ave Bristol NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,125.00

769 Haunted Ln Bensalem NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7,500.00
906 Bridge Rd Bensalem NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $975.00

2615 Creek Rd Lower Southampton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,930.00

CONTINGENCY ITEM
Unforeseen Asbestos $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

CONTRACT A TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $13,530.00

DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (2) 2.0%
DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (3) 3.0%
DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (4) 5.0%

Awarded Amount: $12,953.50

CONTRACT B- Demolition
805 6th Ave Bristol $16,000.00 $8,650.00 $21,500.00 $46,200.00 NO BID

769 Haunted Ln Bensalem $14,500.00 $10,850.00 $24,300.00 $44,100.00 NO BID
3301 Taylor Ave Bristol $24,000.00 $25,150.00 $35,000.00 $52,150.00 NO BID

906 Bridge Rd Bensalem NO BID $26,450.00 $76,400.00 $58,250.00 NO BID
4606 North River Dr Bensalem $34,000.00 $22,000.00 $43,500.00 $50,000.00 NO BID

2615 Creek Rd Lower Southampton NO BID $13,650.00 $27,700.00 $48,150.00 NO BID

CONTRACT B TOTAL $88,500.00 $106,750.00 $228,400.00 $298,850.00 $0.00

CONTINGENCY ITEMS
Add'l Well Abandonments $3,600.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $4,822.00 NO BID

Closure Requirements $10,000.00 $2,800.00 $3,500.00 $9,800.00 NO BID
Contaminated Soil Excavation $2,375.00 $3,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,750.00 NO BID

CONTINGENCY ITEMS TOTAL $15,975.00 $7,300.00 $10,500.00 $23,372.00 $0.00

COMBINED TOTAL AMOUNT BID $104,475.00 $114,050.00 $238,900.00 $322,222.00 $13,530.00

DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (2) 3.5% 5.0% 0.0% 1.0%
DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (3) 3.5% 5.0% 0.0% 2.0%
DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (4) 3.5% 5.0% 0.0% 3.0%
DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (5) 0.0% 5.0% 0.0% 4.0%
DISCOUNT FOR MULTIPLE AWARD (6) 0.0% 10.0% 0.0% 5.0%

NRCS Neshaminy Creek Work Plan, Demolition of Flood Hazard Mitigation Properties, Group 13
Spec #39-07/12


	Unofficial Bid Tab

