
Spec #32-06/12

American 
Uniform

Atlantic 
Tactical Hess

911 Safety 
Equip

Flemington 
Dept Store Samzies

Uniform 
Gear Witmer

Shirts

1
Men’s Long Sleeve Shirt: Elbeco Inc Tex-Trop Shirt #314. Color: Dark 
Navy, 

UNIT COST $46.75 $44.30 $43.50 $47.00 $49.50 $45.00  No Bid No Bid

2 Men’s Long Sleeve Shirt: Elbeco Inc Tex-Trop Shirt #310. Color: White, 
UNIT COST $44.80 $41.20 $41.50 $46.00 $49.50 $43.39  No Bid No Bid

3 Men’s Short Sleeve Shirt: Elbeco Inc Tex-Trop Shirt #3314. Color: Dark 
Navy Blue, 

UNIT COST $43.85 $39.80 $40.00 $45.00 $46.00 $41.50 No Bid No Bid

4 Men’s Short Sleeve Shirt: Elbeco Inc Tex-Trop Shirt #3310. Color: White, 
UNIT COST $42.50 $36.40 $38.50 $44.00 $46.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid

5 Women’s Long Sleeve Shirt: Elbeco Inc Tex-Trop Shirt #9314. Color: Dark 
Navy Blue, 

UNIT COST $46.75 $44.30 $43.50 $47.00 $49.50 $45.00 No Bid No Bid

6 Women’s Short Sleeve Shirt: Elbeco Inc Tex-Trop Shirt #9814. Color: 
Dark Navy Blue, 

UNIT COST $43.85 $39.80 $41.50 $45.00 $46.00 $41.50 No Bid No Bid

7 Cardigan Sweater: Zip Front, Heavy Weight, SAI #5510. Color: Black, 
UNIT COST $40.00 $41.40 $37.25 $58.00 $42.63 $39.99 $39.25 No Bid

Trousers
8 Basic Duty Pants: Elbeco Inc #E7604. Color: Dark Navy Blue;

UNIT COST $33.00 $38.80 $44.00 $49.00 $41.00 $52.00 No Bid No Bid

Officer's Uniforms



9 Men’s Trousers: Elbeco Inc. Tex Trop Trousers #E314. Color: Navy Blue; 

UNIT COST $34.50 $32.80 $44.00 $48.00 $39.00 $49.00 No Bid No Bid

10 Women’s Trousers: Elbeco Inc Tex Trop Trousers #E9314. Color Navy 
Blue; 

UNIT COST $34.50 $32.80 $44.00 $48.00 $39.00 $49.00 No Bid No Bid

Dark Navy Shirt/Trousers Group

Jackets/Coats
11 Convertible Duty Jacket: Spiewak WeatherTech Tactel Duty Jacket 

#S310. Color: Black 003;
UNIT COST $101.25 $92.70 $105.00 $115.00 $129.00 $112.00 $95.48 No Bid

12
Raincoat: Blauer Mfg Co, Defender Style #733. Color: Black reversing to 
fluorescent orange; 

NOT Blauer - 
substituted 

product
UNIT COST $107.50 $107.60 $126.00 $135.00 $60.00 $135.00 $121.30 $129.00

Miscellaneous
13 Officers’ Cap: Lancaster Uniform Cap Co. LAPD style #1960. Color: LAPD 

Blue fabric w/ black patent vinyl visor.
UNIT COST $33.50 $28.20 $41.00 $57.00 $29.95 $49.50 No Bid No Bid

14 Officer’s Cap: Bodek and Rhodes Style #8101, Color Black. Department 
Patch will be sewed to front of cap. 

UNIT COST $6.50 $8.60 $7.50 $9.75 $13.75 $18.00 $7.00 $9.25

15 Hat Covers: Blauer Mfg Co, Defender style #107. Color: Black reversing to 
fluorescent orange. 

UNIT COST $5.85 $6.10 $7.00 $9.00 $9.00 $8.00 $6.55 $6.75

16 Safety Vest: High Visibility, Spiewak #S911, VizMax athletic jersey mesh, 
Adjustable Velcro side closures. Color: HV Yellow.

UNIT COST $29.00 $37.20 $36.00 $49.00 $36.00 $31.29 $35.40 $38.00

17 Black Knit Hat: Color: Black, 
UNIT COST $7.35 $7.20 $10.50 $19.00 $8.50 $18.50 No Bid No Bid



18 Battle Dress Uniform (BDU) Tactical Pants: Tru-Spec style #1995, Color: 
Black, 

UNIT COST $24.20 $22.35 $27.00 $34.00 $26.00 $30.99 No Bid $26.75

19 BDU Tactical Long Sleeve Dress Shirt: Tru-Spec style #1412, Color: 
 UNIT COST $41.00 $29.80 $24.25 $34.00 $43.00 $39.99 No Bid $35.25

20 BDU Tactical Short Sleeve Dress Shirt: Tru-Spec style #1014, Color: 
Black, 

UNIT COST $38.50 $28.80 $48.50 $32.00 $46.00 $37.99 No Bid $32.50

BDU Group

21 Windbreak/Raid Jacket: Dutyman J31 style, Color: Black, 

UNIT COST $39.25 $38.40 $50.00 $48.00 $69.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

22 Mock Dickey: Flying Cross by Fechheimer style #52110, Color: Black, 
UNIT COST $10.00 $10.40 $8.87 $21.30 $13.00 $13.99 No Bid No Bid
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