
2-Year Contract to Provide Medical and Surgical Supplies
 Spec #30-07/18

Number Description
Total 

Quantity
Unit Of 

Measure

School 
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Corp

Bob Barker 
Company 

Inc

American 
Health Care 
Services, Inc

Manheim 
Medical 

Supply Inc.

Dealmed 
Medical 
Supplies

DiaMedical 
USA 

Equipment 
LLC

Concordance 
Healthcare 
Solutions

4 My Clinic 
Inc

Bound 
Tree 

Medical, 
LLC

Maven 
Medical

1

Bandaids, Flexible Fabric Bandages, 1" x 3", with non-
stick pad, STERILE, 100/box, 24 boxes/case, Brand: 

Dynarex #3612 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0230 0.0196 0.0210 0.0216 0.0198
1.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Bandaid PRODUCT 14400 ea 0.0313 No Bid No Bid 0.0170 0.0181 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4800

19200

2
Bandages, 1" x 3", plastic, fabric, adhesive, sheer, sterile, 

latex-free, 100/box Brand: Stat-strip #15205  4800 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0225 No Bid 0.0277 0.0240 0.0625 0.0216 0.0198
2.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Stat-Strip PRODUCT 4800 ea 0.0234 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0119 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandages, 3" x 4.1 yds. NON 

STERILE, 12 rolls/box 8 boxes/case, Brand: Dynarex #3103 6912 ea No Bid No Bid 0.1322 No Bid No Bid 0.1210 0.1040 0.1300 0.1073 0.1072
3.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dynarex PRODUCT 6912 ea 0.4240 No Bid No Bid 0.0930 0.1059 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
Conforming Stretch Gauze Bandages, 4" x 4.1 yds. NON 

STERILE, 12 rolls/box 8 boxes/case, Brand: Dynarex #3104 11136 ea No Bid No Bid 0.1392 0.0000 0.0000 0.1414 0.1220 0.1510 0.1345 0.1220
4.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dynarex PRODUCT 11136 ea 0.5116 No Bid No Bid 0.1150 0.1176 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: 

Medigrip #MSC9502  Size C 5 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.2048 46.9800 0.0000 31.0500 No Bid No Bid
5.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Medigrip PRODUCT 5 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.2000 No Bid No Bid 28.4230 No Bid No Bid 48.0800

5.2
Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: 

Medigrip #MSC9503  Size D 22 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.7229 28.8200 No Bid 32.0500 No Bid No Bid
5.3 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Medigrip PRODUCT 22 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.0500 No Bid No Bid 32.4120 No Bid No Bid 59.2600

5.4
Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: 

Medigrip #MSC9504  Size E 96 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.6024 59.5600 No Bid 39.1000 No Bid No Bid
5.5 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Medigrip PRODUCT 96 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.6000 No Bid No Bid 38.4590 No Bid No Bid 62.0400

5.6
Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: 

Medigrip #MSC9505  Size F 96 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 51.8072 65.3500 No Bid 42.5500 No Bid No Bid
5.7 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Medigrip PRODUCT 96 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.0000 No Bid No Bid 42.2120 No Bid No Bid 74.0000

5.8
Elasticated Tubular Bandage, Non Sterile, Brand: 

Medigrip #MSC9506  Size G 42 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.0120 73.9900 No Bid 47.5000 No Bid No Bid
5.9 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Medigrip PRODUCT 42 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.0000 No Bid No Bid 46.2120 No Bid No Bid 86.9900

6
Gauze, 2" x 2", 8-ply surgical sponges, non-sterile, color: 

white, 200/pack 100000 ea 0.0076 No Bid No Bid 0.0034 0.0044 0.0044 0.0034 0.0175 No Bid 0.0040

7
Gauze Surgical Sponges, 4" x 4", 8 ply, NON STERILE, 
200/sleeve, 10 sleeves/case, Brand: Dynarex #3242 240000 ea No Bid No Bid 0.0129 No Bid No Bid 0.0154 0.0137 0.0295 No Bid 0.0259

7.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dynarex PRODUCT 240000 ea 0.0096 No Bid 0.0000 0.0107 0.0125 0.0000 0.0083 No Bid No Bid 0.0000

8

Gauze Sponges, 4" x 4", 8 ply, 100% cotton, STERILE, 
2/pack, 50 packs/box, 12 boxes/case, Brand: Caring 

#PRM4408 28800 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0271 0.0000 0.0300 0.0000 0.0000
8.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Caring PRODUCT 28800 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0236 0.0330 0.0000 0.0240 0.0000 0.0000 0.0281

9
Drain Sponges, 4" x 4", 6 ply, STERILE 2/pack, 25 

packs/box 12 boxes/case, Brand: AMD-RITMED, #A9210 43800 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0381 0.0325 0.0649 0.0560 0.0650 0.0000 0.0000
9.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL AMD-RITMED PRODUCT 43800 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0240 0.0000 0.0000 0.0569

10
Abdominal Combine Pads, 5" x 9", STERILE, 25/box, 16 

boxes/case, Brand: Caring #PRM21450 57600 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0808 0.1800 0.0900 0.0043 0.0000
10.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Caring PRODUCT 57600 ea 0.1148 0.0000 0.0000 0.0940 0.1059 0.0000 0.1470 0.0000 0.0000 0.0940

11
Non-Adhering Dressing 3" x 8", 24/box, 6 boxes/case Oil 

Emulsion, Brand: Shur-Conform 77042 10368 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.5975 0.7229 0.0000 0.0000 0.7290 0.0150 0.0000
11.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Shur-Conform PRODUCT 10368 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.6784 0.8580 0.0000 0.0000 0.8170

12
Tegaderm Transparent Dressing, 4" x 4 ¾", 50/box, 

1626W, Brand: 3M Tegaderm 8400 ea 1.4036 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.7590 1.6532 1.0020 2.1000 0.0648 1.3298
12.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL 3M Tegaderm PRODUCT 8400 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.4722 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

13
No Sting Skin Prep Wipes, 50/box, 20 boxes/case, Brand: 

Smith  Nephew #594 20600, NO SUBSTITUTE 48000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.3950 0.6506 0.7366 0.4760 0.7880 0.2158 0.0245

14

Alcohol Prep Pads, 2-ply, saturated w/ 70% isopropyl 
alcohol, individual wrapper, sterile, latex-free, 2.5" x 1-

1/16", 200/pack, Covidien Curity #5750 484000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0093 0.0080 0.0250 0.1046 0.0760
14.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Covidien Curity PRODUCT 384000 ea 0.0059 0.0000 0.0000 0.0061 0.0068 0.0000 0.0070 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

100000

15
Medipore Tape, cloth, 4" x 10 yds, 12 rolls/box, Brand: 

3M #2964 1728 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 8.8300 11.3373 12.1708 9.1270 16.4830 1.7932 10.5000
15.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL 3M PRODUCT 1728 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

16
Micropore Tape 1" paper tape, 12 rolls/box, 12 

boxes/case, Brand: 3M #1530-1 2304 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.4125 0.6988 0.7254 0.4280 0.8190 1.4387 0.4216
16.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL 3M PRODUCT 2304 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

Unit Cost for "each"

No Award 



17
Transpore Tape 1", Plastic, 12 rolls/box, 12 boxes/case, 

Brand: 3M #1527-1  NO SUBSTITUTE 1728 ea 1.2750 0.0000 0.0000 0.7500 0.9398 1.3480 0.8220 1.5780 0.0000 0.8039

18

Wound closure-Steri-strips, flesh tone color, ¼" x 4", 
10/pack, 200 packs/box, Brand: 3M #B1172803  NO 

SUBSTITUTE 48000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.2550 0.0070 0.1860

19 Super Soft Heel Protectors, Brand: Skil Care #503410 170 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 44.9500 0.0000 62.2100 53.6670 75.9000 0.0000 51.7100
19.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Skil Care PRODUCT 170 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

20
Body Wedge  9" x 10.5" x 24, Brand: Span America 

#50630-507 257 ea 0.0000 0.0000 93.2700 22.9000 0.0000 21.5405 0.0000 46.0000 0.0000 25.9500
20.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Span America PRODUCT 257 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

21
Bed Positioner Wedge 8" x 8" x 17", Brand: Skil Care 

#554020 415 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 18.2500 0.0000 24.3700 0.0000 36.0000 0.0000 35.8800
21.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Skil Care PRODUCT 415 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

22

Bedside Safety Matt, 24" x 70" x 1", Beveled Edge, 1 yr 
warranty, 6 lb., Fire Retardant, Brand: Span America 

#37052 28 ea 0.0000 0.0000 124.9900 0.0000 0.0000 143.1800 0.0000 190.2400 0.0000 0.0000
22.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Span America PRODUCT 28 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 62.5000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 58.8100

23 Bed Rail Wedge, Brand: Skil Care, #4021240 12 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 47.6300 0.0000 65.1400 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000
23.2 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Skil Care PRODUCT 12 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

24
Distilled Water, 1 gallon container, 6 containers/case, 

Brand: Crystal Spring #79765-02000 69888 oz 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0055 0.0000 0.0000 1.0960 0.0000 0.0000 2.2000
24.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Crystal Spring PRODUCT 69888 oz 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0073 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

25

Hydogen Peroxide Solution 10 volume, Local antiseptic, 
16 oz plastic bottle, 12 bottles/case, Brand: Swan #0869 

0871 43 4608 oz 0.4900 0.0000 0.0000 0.0406 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 1.0490 0.5883
25.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Swan PRODUCT 4608 oz 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0361 0.0431 0.0370 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

26
Sodium Chloride Irrigation Solution, 0.9%, 250 ml bottle, 

24 bottles/case, Brand: Baxter #2F7122 1086000 ml 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0177 0.0000 0.0240 4.2708 6.2800
26.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Baxter PRODUCT 1086000 ml 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0046 0.0000 0.0000 0.0045 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

27
Sterile Water for Irrigation, 250 ml/bottle, 24 

bottles/case, Brand: Baxter #2F7112 174000 ml 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0206 0.0189 0.0000 0.0265 4.5992 1.3975
27.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Baxter PRODUCT 174000 ml 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0046 0.0000 0.0000 0.0044 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

28
Odor Eliminator Bye Bye Apricot, 8 oz bottle, 48 

bottles/case, Brand: Dermarite #00257 55296 oz 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.3340 6.8651 1.3358
28.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dermrite PRODUCT 55296 oz 0.0000 0.7950 0.0000 0.1725 0.0000 0.1508 0.1300 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

29

Odor Neutralizer, gel odor eliminator, non-toxic, lasts 30-
40 days, for spaces up to 250 sq ft, 8 oz container, 12 

containers/case, Brand: Odor Hound OH-G08 19200 oz 0.0000 0.3900 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.8950 6.4506 0.0000
29.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Odor Hound PRODUCT 19200 oz 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.4270 0.3030 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

30

Perineum Wash Incontinent Cleanser, 8 oz Spray bottle 
only, 48 bottles/case, Brand: Dynarex Product #4850, any 

color other than blue 276480 oz 0.0000 0.0000 0.0915 0.0820 0.0916 0.1030 0.0000 0.0938 0.0000 0.0000
30.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dynarex PRODUCT 276480 oz 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.1230 0.0000 0.0000 0.8015

31
Humidifier Pre-Filled Bottles, Sterile Water, 500 ml, 12 
bottles/case, Brand: Care Fusion-Air Life #CAR002620 750000 ml 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0048 0.0000 0.0036 0.0000 0.0115 2.0077 0.0000

31.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Care Fusion-Air Life PRODUCT 750000 ml 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0065 0.0000 0.0051 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

32
Insulin Safety Syringe, 1 ml, 29g x ½", 100/box, 5 

boxes/case, Brand: Kendall #88815111110 63000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.1844 0.0000 0.0000 0.2310 0.4853 0.2539 0.2306
32.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Kendall PRODUCT 63000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.3012 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

33
TB safety Syringes, 1 ml, 28g x 1.2", 100/box, Brand: 

Kendall #8881511201 500 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.2060 0.2651 0.2940 0.2320 0.5635 0.0941 0.2306
33.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Kendall PRODUCT 500 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

34

Syringe, Integra needle/syringe w/ detachable needle, 
sterile, latex-free, 3cc 23g x 1", 100/box, Brand: BD 

#305271  NO SUBSTITUTE 4000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.4750 0.5542 0.5959 0.5140 0.8236 0.0000 0.7244

35

Syringe, Integra needle/syringe w/ detachable needle, 
sterile, latex-free, 3cc 25g x 5/8", 100/box, Brand: BD 

#305269  NO SUBSTITUTE 1600 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.4750 0.5548 0.5959 0.5140 0.8236 0.0000 0.7244

36

Syringe, Integra needle/syringe w/ detachable needle, 
sterile, latex-free, 3cc 25g x 1", 100/box, Brand: BD 

#305270  NO SUBSTITUTE 4000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.4750 0.5542 0.5959 0.5140 0.8236 0.0000 0.7244

37

Needle Only, PrecisionGlide Needle, 25G x 1", Regular 
Bevel, Sterile, 100/box, Brand: BD #305125  NO 

SUBSTITUTE 2000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0705 0.7981 0.0900 0.0780 0.1276 0.0000 0.1008

38
Stat Loc Foley Stabilation Device, Tricol Anchor Pad for 

Silicone Catheters, 25/case, Brand: Bach #Fol0102 400 ea 0.0000 0.0000 23.9000 5.5800 5.2092 5.9400 4.1180 0.0000 0.0000 5.1900
38.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Back PRODUCT 400 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

39

Irrigation Tray Sterile Saline Thumb Control Ring Piston 
Syringe, 60cc Piston Syringe w/ Sterile Saline, 20/case, 

Brand: Welyn #6122 4660 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 1.2292 0.0000
39.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Welyn PRODUCT 4660 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 1.9565 2.7229 1.9625 0.8800 0.0000 0.0000 1.1100

No Award 



40

Sharps In-Room Disposal System, 5-qt container w/ 
sharpstar lid and counter-balanced door, used in locked 
wall cabinet, color: red, 20/box, Brand: Kendall #8507SA 300 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 4.0500 4.8819 5.5025 4.5560 7.6475 4.9951 4.3235

40.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Kendall PRODUCT 300 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

41

Sharps Multi-Purpose Sharps Biohazard Collector, 6.9 qt, 
11.5" x 8.75" x 5.5", plastic, color: red, one-piece with 

regular funnel entry w/ two handles, must not be able to 
see through container, 12/box, Brand: B-D #300467 240 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 10.5900 4.3123 0.0000

41.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Sharps PRODUCT 240 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 8.5975 6.8460 0.0000 0.0000 7.2150

42
Gen 2 First Crush Automated Pill Crusher, Brand: First 

Wave Products #QESPC-47461 24 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 256.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000
42.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL First Wave Products PRODUCT 24 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 85.8800

43
Gen 2 First Crush Automated Pill Crusher Cups, 1000/box, 

Brand: First Wave Products #QES-FW02NS 300000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0450 0.0000 0.0430 0.0000 0.0644 0.0000 0.0000
43.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL First Wave Products PRODUCT 300000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0203

44
Welch Allyn Temperature Probes, 250/box, 20 

boxes/case, Brand: Welch Allyn #WA05031-105 120000 ea 0.0385 0.0000 0.0000 0.0339 0.0400 0.0421 0.0370 0.0000 0.0408 0.0661
44.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Welch Allyn PRODUCT 120000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

45
Isolation Gowns- Tie Back, YLW, 50/case, Brand: Dynarex 

#DYN2141 15000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.2950 0.2973 0.3000 0.2590 0.3220 0.3343 0.2804
45.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Dynarex PRODUCT 15000 ea 0.0000 0.4840 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

46
Exam Drapes, 2-ply tissue/poly lined, color: white, 

disposable, 40" x 48", 100/box 1500 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.3831 0.0000 0.2460 0.4600 0.1843 0.0000

46.1

ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (The brand and model 
for the proposed Alternate or Equal item must be noted 
in the "Comment" area.)   (enter UNIT COST for 1 drape) 1500 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.1480 0.0000 0.3553 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.2178

47
Isolation Masks, Ear loop, pleated yellow, 50/box, 10 

box/case, Brand: AMDRIT #1531-IMC 12000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0370 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0523 0.0000
47.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL AMDRIT PRODUCT 12000 ea 0.0560 0.0720 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0659 0.0570 0.0000 0.0000 0.0537

48
Shoe covers- no skid, Size 9-11 white, 150 pair/pack, 3 

packs/case, Brand: Uline #S-15369White 43200 pair 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.4819 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.1118 0.0000
48.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Uline PRODUCT 43200 pair 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0870 0.0000 0.1471 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0343

49
Shoe covers- no skid, Size 12-15 blue, 150 pair/pack, 3 

packs/case, Brand: Uline Part #S-15370Blu 43200 pair 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.5145 0.0000 0.1800 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000
49.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Uline PRODUCT 43200 pair 0.0000 0.1476 0.0000 0.0970 0.0000 0.1808 0.1800 0.0000 0.0000 0.0343

50
E-Z Lubricating Jelly, .17oz packet, 150 packets/box, 6 

boxes/case, Brand: Medline MDS032280 21600 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.1093 0.1130 0.0613 0.0665 0.0000
50.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Medline PRODUCT 21600 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0375 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0448

51
Protective Towels, scale paper/liner, 2-ply tissue/poly 

waffle embossed, 13" x 18", color: white, 500/box 25000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0365 0.0000
51.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT 25000 ea 0.0418 0.0000 0.0000 0.0316 0.0446 0.0539 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0436

52
Tissue, 2-ply, color: white, disposable, 8.4" x 8.0", 125 

sheets/box, 48 boxes/case Brand: Kimberly-Clark Kleenex 150000 ea 0.0104 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0111 0.0166 0.0140 0.0000 0.0116 0.0105

52.1 ALTERNATE or EQUAL Kimberly-Clark Kleenex PRODUCT 150000 ea 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0037 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000
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